BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Title: Commercial Metal Containers Page 1
Bid No.:  2017-03
Date Opened: 10/3/2016
ROLL-OFFS USA Wastequip Mfg. Co. LLC
DURANT, OK CHARLOTTE, NC
ITEM QUANTITY DESCRIPTION OF GOODS OR SERVICES UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1.1 10 1.5 yd Commercial Metal Side Load/3 piece metal
and poly lid plus freight $387.00 $3,870.00 $422.00 $4,220.00
1.2 10 2 yd Commercial Metal Side Load/3 piece metal
and poly lid plus freight $439.00 $4,390.00 $444.00 $4,440.00
1.3 10 3 yd Commercial Metal Side Load/3 piece metal
and poly lid plus freight $488.00 $4,888.00 $493.00 $4,930.00
1.4 10 4 yd Commerical Metal Side Load/3 piece metal
and poly lid plus freight $555.00 $5,550.00 $533.00 $5,330.00
1.5 10 1.5 yd Commercial Metal Side Load/3 piece metal
lid plus freight $412.00 $4,120.00 NO BID NO BID
1.6 10 2 yd Commercial Metal Side Load/3 piece metal
lid plus freight $469.00 $4,690.00 NO BID NO BID
1.7 10 3 yd Commercial Metal Side Load/3 piece metal
lid plus freight $515.00 $5,150.00 NO BID NO BID
1.8 10 4 yd Commerical Metal Side Load/3 piece metal
lid plus freight $580.00 $5,800.00 NO BID NO BID
2.1 10 2 yd Commercial Metal Front Load/3 piece metal and
[poly plus freight $426.00 $4,260.00 $367.00 $3,670.00
SUBTOTAL. ...
NETTOTAL .................
TERMS. ... ... i
DELIVERY ..................
RECOMMENDATION:
Award: Bid 2017-03 to ROLL-OFFS USA and Wastequip Mfg. Co. LLC, Department: Solid Waste Management

the lowest bidders per unit pricing on highlighted items

DISCLAIMER:
The above bid recommendation is made by Department Directors and the final award is subject to City Council approval.

Budgeted Amount Available: $285,000
Additional Funds Required:
Prepared By: Laura Olivarez, Adminsitrative Assistant
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BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Title:  Commercial Metal Containers Page 2
Bid No.:  2017-03
Date Opened: 10/3/2016
ROLL-OFFS USA Wastequip Mfg. Co. LLC
DURANT, OK CHARLOTTE, NC
ITEM QUANTITY DESCRIPTION OF GOODS OR SERVICES UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
2.2 10 3 yd Commercial Metal Front Load/3 piece metal
and poly lid plus freight $517.00 $5,170.00 $439.00 $4,390.00
2.3 10 4 yd Commerical Metal Front Load/3 piece metal
and poly lid plus freight $633.00 $6,330.00 $494.00 $4,940.00
2.4 10 2 yd Commercial Metal Front Load/3 piece metal
lid plus freight $476.00 $4,760.00 NO BID NO BID
2.5 10 3 yd Commercial Metal Front Load/3 piece metal
lid plus freight $577.00 $5,770.00 NO BID NO BID
2.6 10 4 yd Commercial Metal Front Load/3 piece metal
lid plus freight $693.00 $6,930.00 NO BID NO BID
3.1 10 8 yd Low Profile or Slanted Type Commercial
Metal Front Load/2 piece poly lid plus freight $983.00 $9,830.00 $777.00 $7,770.00
4.1 10 8 yd Standard Type Commercial Metal Front Load
/2 piece poly lid plus freight $983.00 $9,830.00 $791.00 $7,910.00
5.1 10 10 yd Commercial Metal Front Load/2 piece poly
lid plus freight $1,219.00 $12,190.00|] $1,138.00 $11,380.00
6.1 10 20 Cubic Yard "T" Style or Tub Style Roll Off Container
[plus freight $3,520.00 $35,200.00|f $3,510.00 $35,100.00
SUBTOTAL. .................
NETTOTAL .................
TERMS. . ... ... o
DELIVERY ............... ...
RECOMMENDATION:
Award: Bid 2017-03 to ROLL-OFFS USA and Wastequip Mfg. Co. LLC, Department: Solid Waste Management

the lowest bidders per unit pricing on highlighted items

DISCLAIMER:
The above bid recommendation is made by Department Directors and the final award is subject to City Council approval.

Budgeted Amount Available:
Additional Funds Required:
Prepared By: Laura Olivarez, Adminsitrative Assistant

$285,000
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BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Title: Commercial Metal Containers Page 3
Bid No.: 2017-03
Date Opened: 10/3/2016
ROLL-OFFS USA Wastequip Mfg. Co. LLC
DURANT, OK CHARLOTTE, NC
ITEM QUANTITY DESCRIPTION OF GOODS OR SERVICES UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
6.2 10 30 Cubic Yard "T" Style or Tub Style Roll Off
Container plus freight $3,949.00] $39,490.00[| $3,823.00 $38,230.00
6.3 10 40 Cubic Yard "T" Style or Tub Style Roll Off
Container plus freight $4,820.00 $48,200.00f  $4,493.00 $44,930.00
7.1 10 Replacement 2,3 & 4 yd Hinged Metal Lid - 3
piece Metal Lid - 1 complete set $144.00 $1,440.00 NO BID NO BID
7.2 10 tRepIacement 2,3 & 4 yd Hinged Metal Lid piece
|of a 3 piece lid $144.00 $1,440.00 NO BID NO BID
7.3 10 |Replacement 2,3 & 4 yd 2 single wall UHM
}polyethylene lids of the 3 piece lid. (Set of 2) $40.00 $400.00 $128.30 $1,283.00
7.4 10 Replacement 2,3 & 4 yd 2 single wall UHM
}polyethylene lids of the 2 piece lid. (Set of 2 -
Full Length) $54.00 $540.00 $42.00 $420.00
7.5 10 |Rep|acement 8 & 10 yd 2 single wall UHM
}polyethylene lids (set of 2) $60.00 $600.00 $42.00 $420.00
* |INO freight charges apply IF shipped with containers
"If shipped alone charges are based on weight
"and will be added to extended price
SUBTOTAL. ...,
NETTOTAL .................
TERMS. ....................
DELIVERY ..................
RECOMMENDATION:
Award: Bid 2017-03 to ROLL-OFFS USA and Wastequip Mfg. Co. LLC, Department: Solid Waste Management

Budgeted Amount Available: $285,000

the lowest bidders per unit pricing on highlighted items

Additional Funds Required:

Prepared By: Laura Olivarez, Adminsitrative Assistant

DISCLAIMER:

The above bid recommendation is made by Department Directors and the final award is subject to City Council approval. Page 127



BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Title: Commercial Metal Containers Page 4
Bid No.:  2017-03
Date Opened: 10/3/2016
ROLL-OFFS USA Wastequip Mfg. Co. LLC
DURANT, OK CHARLOTTE, NC
ITEM QUANTITY DESCRIPTION OF GOODS OR SERVICES UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
8.1 10 1.5yd side load prefabricated 10ga primed bottom with
6" lip, caster pad, and drain plug $177.00 $1,770.00 $165.00 $1,650.00
8.2 10 2yd side load prefabricated 10ga primed bottom with
6" lip, caster pad, and drain plug $177.00 $1,770.00 $180.00 $1,800.00
8.3 10 3yd side load prefabricated 10ga primed bottom with
6" lip, caster pad, and drain plug $194.00 $1,940.00 $195.00 $1,950.00
8.4 10 4yd side load prefabricated 10ga primed bottom with
6" lip, caster pad, and drain plug $194.00 $1,940.00 $195.00 $1,950.00
8.5 10 2yd front load prefabricated 10ga primed bottom with
6" lip, caster pad, and drain plug $181.00 $1,810.00 $135.00 $1,350.00
8.6 10 3yd front load prefabricated 10ga primed bottom with
6" lip, caster pad, and drain plug $204.00 $2,040.00 $155.00 $1,550.00
8.7 10 4yd front load prefabricated 10ga primed bottom with
6" lip, caster pad, and drain plug $237.00 $2,370.00 $175.00 $1,750.00
8.8 10 8yd low profile or slanted type commerical metal front
load prefabricated 10ga primed bottom with 6" lip,
caster pad, and drain plug $295.00 $2,950.00 $215.00 $2,150.00
* |INO freight charges apply IF shipped with containers
If shipped alone charges are based on weight
and will be added to extended price
SUBTOTAL. ...t
NETTOTAL .................
TERMS. . ... ... ... ...
DELIVERY ..................
RECOMMENDATION:
Award: Bid 2017-03 to ROLL-OFFS USA and Wastequip Mfg. Co. LLC, Department:  Solid Waste Management

the lowest bidders per unit pricing on highlighted items.

DISCLAIMER:
The above bid recommendation is made by Department Directors and the final award is subject to City Council approval.

Budgeted Amount Available:
Additional Funds Required:
Laura Olivarez, Adminsitrative Assistant

Prepared By:

$285,000
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Title:

BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Commercial Metal Containers

Bid No.:

2017-03

Date Opened:

10/3/2016

Page 5

ROLL-OFFS USA
DURANT, OK

Wastequip Mfg. Co. LLC
CHARLOTTE, NC

ITEM

QUANTITY

DESCRIPTION OF GOODS OR SERVICES

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

8.9 10

8yd standard type commerical metal front load

[prefabricated 10ga primed bottom with 6" lip,

caster pad, and drain plug

295.00

$ 2,950.00

$ 185.00

$ 1,850.00

8.10 10

10yd commercial metal front load prefabricated 10ga

[primed bottom with 6" caster pad, and drain plug

358.00

$ 3,580.00

$ 215.00

$ 2,150.00

8.11 10

20cy "T" style or tub style roll off container prefabricated

10ga primed bottom with 6" lip, caster pad, and drain

|plug (5'6"x19'11%")

2,592.00

$ 25,920.00

NO BID

NO BID

8.12 10

30cy "T" style or tub style roll off container prefabricated

10ga primed bottom with 6" lip, caster pad, and drain

|plug (5'6"x19'11%")

2,592.00

$ 25,920.00

NO BID

NO BID

8.13 10

20cy "Rectangular” style or tub style roll off contianer

prefabricated 10ga primed bottom with 6" lip, caster
tpad, and drain plug (6'11"x21'8%")

2,592.00

$ 25,920.00

NO BID

NO BID

8.14 10

30cy "Rectangular"” style or tub style roll off contianer

prefabricated 10ga primed bottom with 6" lip, caster

pad, and drain plug (7'x21'8%")

2,592.00

$ 25,920.00

NO BID

NO BID

NO freight charges apply IF shipped with containers

If shipped alone charges are based on weight

and will be added to extended price

RECOMMENDATION:

Award:

SUBTOTAL. .................

Bid 2017-03 to ROLL-OFFS USA and Wastequip Mfg. Co. LLC,

the lowest bidders per unit pricing on highlighted items.

DISCLAIMER:
The above bid recommendation is made by Department Directors and the final award is subject to City Council approval.

Department:

Solid Waste Management

Budgeted Amount Available: $285,000
Additional Funds Required:
Prepared By: Laura Olivarez, Adminsitrative Assistant
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BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Title:  Purchase of Commercial Metal Containers Page 6
Bid No.: 2017-03
Date Opened:  10/3/2016
ROLL-OFFS USA Wastequip Mfg. Co. LLC
DURANT,OK CHARLOTTE, NC
ITEM QUANTITY DESCRIPTION OF GOODS OR SERVICES UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
8.15 10 20cy roll off container prefabricated 10ga primed
bottom with 6"lip, caster pad, and drain plug
(7'4"x19'11%,") $2,592.00 $25,920.00 NO BID NO BID
8.16 10 30cy roll off container prefabricated 10ga primed
bottom with 6"lip, caster pad, and drain plug
(7'3%"x20") $2,592.00 $25,920.00 NO BID NO BID
SUBTOTAL. .................
NETTOTAL .................
TERMS. . ... ... . .......
DELIVERY ..................
RECOMMENDATION:
Award: Bid 2017-03 to ROLL-OFFS USA and Wastequip Mfg. Co. LLC, Department:  Solid Waste Management

the lowest bidders per unit pricing on highlighted items.

DISCLAIMER:

Budgeted Amount Available:
Additional Funds Required:
Prepared By: Laura Olivarez, Adminsitrative Assistant

The above bid recommendation is made by Department Directors and the final award is subject to City Council approval.

$285,000
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