BID RECOMMENDATION FORM
Title: Fuel, Motor Oil and Lubricants
Bid No.: 2012-03
Date Opened: 10/3/2011 @ 3:00 PM

Petroleum Traders Corp.[| Gold Star Petroleum, Inc.} Oil Patch Fuel & Supply
TEM QUANTITY DESCRIPTION OF GOODS OR UNIT |EXTENDED| UNIT |EXTENDED| UNIT |EXTENDED
SERVICES PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1 300,000 GALS ||[Unleaded Fuel - Delivery Margin $0.0507] $15,210.00f $0.0050 $1,500.00f $0.0100 $3,000.00
2 200,000 GALS  [[Diesel Ultra Low Sulfur Clear - Delivery Margill $0.0818] $16,360.00f $0.0124 $2,480.001 $0.0100 $2,000.00
3 20,900 GALS [Diese] Ultra Low Sulfur Dyed - Delivery Margil| $0.1407 $2,940.63F $0.0524 $1,095.16}f $0.0100 $209.00
4 50 DRUMS Hydraulic Fluid in 55 Gal Drums No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bidl $571.10] $28,555.00
5 50 DRUMS 15-W 40 Motor Oil 55 Gal. Drums No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid§  $554.13 $27,706.50
6 4 DRUMS Delo 400 15W-40 Motor Oil No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid] $727.00 $2,908.00
7 4,000 GALS Premiuimn 40W Motor Oil No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.99 $35,960.00
8 55 DRUMS  [SAE 30W No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bidj] $632.49] $34,786.95
9 6 DRUMS SAE 50W No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid]| $770.65 $4,623.90
10 1,000 GALS  {Dexron/Mercron - ATF (G) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.40 $8,400.00
11 2 DRUMS 70-90W Synthetic Oil No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 14,000 GALS | Tractor Hydraulic Fluid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.22| $129.,080.00
13 3 DRUMS Antifreeze (50/50) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid|| $274.73 $824.19
14 3 DRUMS Antifreeze (Long Life Premium with Additive No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid|| $374.32 $1,122.96
to Prevent Electrolysis)
SUBTOTAL............ccovvv
NETTOTAL .......coivvan. $34,510.63 $5,075.16( $279,176.50
TERMS. .. .ovviiiiiiiiannn,
DELIVERY ......c.oovivnn.n.
RECOMMENDATION:
Award: Award Bid #2012-03, Fuel, Motor Qil, and Lubricants to Gold Star Department:  Public Works / Streets
Petroleum Inc. For Their Delivery Margin (Unit Price) For Unleaded Fuel and Budgeted Amount Available: Funds From All Departments.
To Qil Patch Fuel & Supply For Their Delivery Margin (Unit Price) For Diesel Additional Funds Required:  $0.00
Fuel and Their Unit Price for Motor Oil, and Lubricants Prepared By: Tom Reyna - A.D. of Public Works
DISCLAIMER:
The above bid recommendation is made by Department Directors and the final award is subject to City Council approval. Page 1 of 1
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