BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Title:  Swimming Pool Chemicals
Bid No.:  2012-05 Page 10f2
Date Opened: 3-Oct-11
AQUATIC COMMERCIAL UNIVAR VALLEY SOLVENTS
SOLUTIONS, INC. & CHEMICALS
ITEM|  QUANTITY DESCRIPTION OF GOODS OR SERVICES UNIT | EXTENDED | UNIT | EXTENDED ||  UNIT | EXTENDED
PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1 11,000 GAL. SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE $1.95 $21,450.00 $2.75 $30,250.00 $1.58 $17,380.00
2 825 GAL. MURIATIC ACID $2.65 $2,186.25 $3.75 $3,093.75 $2.82 $2,326.50
3 700 LBS. CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE $1.55 $1,085.00 $2.00 $1,400.00 $1.555 $1,088.50
4 500 LBS. CYANURIC ACID (STABILIZER) $1.10 $550.00 No Bid No Bid $0.965 $482.50
5 1,000 LBS. SODIUM BICARBONATE $0.50 $500.00 $0.5500 $550.00 $0.415 $415.00
SUBTOTAL.........ociinun $25,771.25 $35,293.75 $21,692.50
NETTOTAL..................
TERMS. ...t ce s
DELIVERY ..................
RECOMMENDATION:
Award; Award ltems 1 and 4 to Valley Solvents and Chemicals and Department: Parks & Recreation

ltems 2, 3 and 5 to Leslie's Poolmart, Inc., the lowest bidders meeting specifications.

DISCLAIMER:
The above bid recommendation is made by Department Directors and the final award is subject to City Council approval.

Budgeted Amount Available: $29,200

Additional Funds Required: $0.00

Prepared By: Luis A. Rodriguez, Director of Parks and

Recreation
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BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Title:  Swimming Pool Chemicals
Bid No.. 2012-05 Page 2 of 2
Date Opened: 3-Oct-11
LESLIE'S POOLMART INC. AMCHEM, INC.
UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
ITEM QUANTITY DESCRIPTION OF GOODS OR SERVICES
PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1 11,000 GAL. SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE $2.23]  $24,530.00 $2.65 $29,150.00
2 825 GAL. MURATIC ACID $2.26 $1,864.50 $5.50 $4,537.50
3 700 LBS. CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE $1.4999 $1,049.33 No Bid No Bid
4 500 LBS. CYANURIC ACID (STABILIZER) $1.0999 $549.95 No Bid No Bid
5 1,000 LBS, SODIUM BICARBONATE $0.345 $345.00 $0.72 $720.00
SUBTOTAL...........covan.. $28,338.78 $34,407.50]
NETTOTAL...........c..c.u.
TERMS. .....coiiiiiincnnes
DELIVERY .........civvcnnns
RECOMMENDATION:
Award:  Award ltem 1 and 4 to Valley Solvents and Chemicals and Department. Parks & Recreation

Items 2, 3 and 5 {o Leslie's Poolmart, Inc. the lowest bidders meeting specifications.

DISCLAIMER:
The above bid recommendation is made by Department Directors and the final award is subject to City Council approval.

Budgeted Amount Available: $29,200

Additional Funds Required: $0.00

Prepared By: Luis A. Rodriguez, Director of Parks and

Recreation
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