BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Title: Water & Wastewater Plant Chemicals

Bid No.._2012-12
Date Opened: October 17, 2011 @ 3:00 p.mn.

Pageiof 3

Univar USA Amchem, Inc. Chemrite, Inc.
Dallas, TX Los Fresnos, TX Buford, GA
UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
ITEM QUANTITY DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
i 180 con. |INSF Chlorine Gas (1 Ton Containers) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2 18 c¢yls. jINSF Chlorine Gas (150 1b Cylinders) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 62 cyls. [INitrogen, Compressed (150 |b Cylinders) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 10,000 Ibs. {|Copper Sulfate (L arge Crystal) $1.59 $15,900.00 $1.63 $16,300.00 $1.89 $18,900.00
200 Bags to be shipped
at once
GROSSTOTAL. .............. $16,300.00 $18,900.00
LESSDISCOUNT ... .. ... ...
NETTOTAL ... .............. $15,800.00 $16,300.00 $18,900.00
DELIVERY ... e iiines 5 Days 72 Hrs 4-7 Days ARO
EMERGENCY RESPONSE....... na immediately 3-5 Hrs
RECOMMENDATION:  Award ftem No. 1, 2, & 3 to Acetylene Oxygen Company, for Department; Water Plant WWTP

a total amount of $138,330: and ltem No. 4 to Univar USA, in the amount of $15,900,

for a total bid amount of $154,230.

DISCLAIMER:

The above bid recommendation is made by Department Directors and the final award is subject to City Council approval.

Budgeted Amount: $154 680

Additional Funds Required:

Prepared By: Patricia Sanchez, Adm. Asst. ]
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BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Title: Water & Wastewater Plant Chemicals
Bid No.: 2012-12
Date Opened: October 17,2011 @ 3:00 p.m.

Page2 of 3

Valley Solvents & Chemicals

Altivia Corporation

DPC Industries, Inc.

Harlingen, TX Houstan, TX Corpus Christi, TX
UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
iTEM QUANTITY DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1 180 con. NSF Chlorine Gas (1 Ton Containers) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $700.00 $126,000.00
2 18 cyls. [[NSF Chlorine Gas (150 |b Cylinders) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 62 cyls. |INtrogen, Compressed (150 Ib Cylinders) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 10,000 bs. |iCopper Sulfate (Large Crystal) $1.94 $19,400.00 $2.0855 $20,855.00 No Bid No Bid
GROSSTOTAL. . ... .......... $19,400.00 $20,855.00 $126,000.00
LESSDISCOUNT .............
NETTOTAL........cocvvrnn- $19,400.00 $20,855.00 $£126,000.00
DELIVERY . .. oiceiiiie e As Needed 3 Days ARO 3 Days ARO
EMERGENCY RESPONSE....... 24 Hrs 24 Hrs Not Available
RECOMMENDATION:  Award ltem No. 1, 2, & 3 to Acetylene Oxygen Company, for Department: Water PlanttWWTP

a fotal amount of $138,330: and item No. 4 to Univar USA, in the amount of $15,900,

for a total bid amount of $154,230.

DISCLAIMER:

The above bid recommendation is made by Department Directors and the final award is subject to City Council approval.

Budgeted Amount: $154,680

Additional Funds Required:

Prepared By: Patricia Sanchez, Adm. Asst. Il
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BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Page 3 0f 3
Title: Water & Wastewater Plant Chemicals
Bid No.: 2012-12
Date Opened: October 17,2011 @ 3:00 p.m.
Acetylene Oxygen Co. Siemens Industry, Inc
Harlingen, TX Sarasota, FL
UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
TEM QUANTITY DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1 180 con. UNSF Chiorine Gas (1 Ton Containers) $695.00 $125,100.00 No Bid No Bid
2 18 cyls. INSF Chlorine Gas (150 Ib Cylinders) $115.00 $2,070.00 No Bid No Bid
3 62 cyls. [iNitrogen, Compressed {150 ib Cylinders) $180.00 $11,160.00 No Bid No Bid
4 10,000 Ibs. [iCopper Sulfate (Large Crystal) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
GROSSTOTAL. .......ocvv-tn No Bid
LESS DISCOUNT ..ovvvnvnenns
NETTOTAL .. ......cccvennn- $138,330.00 No Bid
DELIVERY .. cvviiinraneeanns 24-72 Hrs
EMERGENCY RESPONSE. ...... i-4 Hrs
RECOMMENDATION:  Award ltem No. 1,2, & 3 to Acetylene Oxygen Company, for Department: Water Plant/WWTP

a total amount of $138,330; and ltem No. 4 to Univar USA, in the amount of $15,900,

for a total bid amount of $154,230.

DISCLAIMER:

The above bid recomm

Budgeted Amourt: $154,680

Additional Funds Required:

Prepared By: Patricia Sanchez, Adm. Asst.

endation is made by Department Directors and the final award is subject to City Council approvat.
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