BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Title: Traffic Signal Parts and Hardware

Bid No.: 2015-58
Date Opened: 2/2/15 @ 3:00 PM
TEXAS HIGHWAY PARADIGM TAFFIC
TRAFFIC PARTS INC. PRODUCTS SYSTEMS, INC.
UNIT (EXTENDED{ UNIT EXTENDED UNIT {EXTENDED
[TEM| QUANTITY DESCRIPTION OF GOODS OR SERVICES PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1 60 EA |Red $35.50 $2,130.00 $35.00 $2,100.00 $37.00 $2,220.00
2 60 EA ||Green $36.00]  $2,160.00 $35.00 $2,100.00 $39.00]  $2,340.00
3 20 EA [|Amber $38.50 $770.00 $35.00 $700.00 $39.00 $780.00
4 25 EA [|Green Arrow $45.00 $1,125.00 $50.00 $1,250.00 $50.00]  $1,250.00
5 10 EA [[Amber Arrow $39.75 $397.50 $50.00 $500.00 $40.00 $400.00
6 7 EA J|Controllers Traffic Signal Time Only, NEMA TS.2 NO BIb NO BID| $1,775.00 $12,425.00 $1,855.00] $12,985.00
7 7 ROLLMMU2-16 LKE Smart Monitor $865.001  $6,055.00 $612.00 $4,284.00][ $810.00f $5,670.00
8 30 ROLLjTwo Circuit Solid State Flasher/Type I $20.10 $603.00 $19.00 $570.00 $20.00 $600.00
9 50 ROLLj|Triple Signal Load Switch with Light Indicator $20.35 $1,017.50 $19.00 $950.00 $20.00 $1,000.00
10 50 ROLI|IFlash Transfer Relay NEMA $32.60 $1,630.00 $20.00 $1,000.00 $28.00 $1,400.00
il 10 ROLLJStandard Bus Interface unit (CIU 700) For NEMA TS-2 $255.00 $2,550.00 $185.00 $1,850.00 $193.00 $1,930.00
12 5 ROLLSHA-1250 Base A (Mounting) Noise Supressor $29.50 $147.50 $30.00 $150.00 $32.00 $160.00
13 5 EA [ISHA-1250 Noise Supressor $135.00 $675.00|  $155.00 $775.00]l  $156.00 $780.00
14 5 EA {[HESCO RLS HE-1750 Tees high Energy Supressor $99.90 $499.50 3$95.00 $475.00 $115.00 $575.00
15 10 EA |IBrass Threaded Inserts for Attachemts (4) $143.001  $1,430.00f $415.00 $4,150.00)f  $310.00]  $3,100.004
16 10 EA [IRibs, Tops & Bottoms $100.00]  $1,000.00) $300.00 $3,000.00f  $218.00]  $2,180.00f
17 25 SET ||Ped Butions (Yellow) with 3"Round Body $25.50 $737.50 $75.00 $1,875.00 $36.00 $900.00
18 100 SET ||3/4 Inch Threaded CGB(Cord Crip) Black Nylon $2.00 $200.00 $4.35 $435.00 $4.50 $450.00
19 4 EA [|Automatic Traffic Recorder NO BID NO BID|I NO BID NO BID|| NO BID NO BID
SUBTOTAL........iviiviaann
NETTOTAL..........vcuv... $23,127.50 $38,589.00 $£38,720.00
TERMS. ... iviiiiiiiiaaas
DEIIVERY ........ovivvunnn.
RECOMMENDATION:
Award:  Bid #2015-58 Traffic Signal Parts and Hardware to Texas Highway Products the lowest

bidder meeting specifications in the amount of $38,589.

DISCLAIMER:
The above bid recommendation is made by Department Directors and the final award is subject to City Council approval.

Department: FUBLIC WORKS/STREETS

Budgeted Amount Available: $50,000
Additional Funds Required: $0.00
Prepared By Velma Gomez, Senior Secretary |
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BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Title: Traffic Signal Parts and Hardware

Bid No.: 2015-58
Date Opened: 2/2/15 @ 3:00 PM
ITERIS INC. GENERAL TRAFFIC CONSOLIDATED
EQUIPMENT CORP. TRAFIC CONTROLS
UNIT [EXTENDED]| UNIT EXTENDED UNIT |EXTENDED
ITEM| QUANTITY DESCRIPTION OF GOODS OR SERVICES PRICE, PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1 60 EA {[Red NO BID NO BID $23.85 $1,431.00 $33.75]  $2,025.00
2 60 EA ||Green NO BID NO BID $23.85 $1.431.00 $38.75]  $2,325.00
3 20 EA [|Amber NO BID NO BID $22.85 $457.00 $37.50 §750.00
4 25 EA ||Green Arrow NO BID NO BID $24.00 $600.00 $38.75 $968.75
3 10 EA [[Amber Arrow NO BID NO Bib $26.85 $268.50 $37.06 $370.60
6 7 EA [Controllers Traffic Signal Time Only, NEMA TS-2 $1,975.00] $13,825.00) NO BID NO BID| $2.868.75] $20,081.25
7 7 ROLIMMU2-16 LKE Smart Monitor $705.00F  $4,935.000 NO BID NO BID 3948.75F  $6,641.25
8 30 ROLLYTwo Circuit Solid State Flasher/Type 111 $25.00 $750.00 $26.00 $780.00 $18.75 $562.50
9 50 ROLLjTriple Signal Load Switch with Light Indicator $25.00F  $1,250.00 $18.40 $920.00 $18.58 $929.00
10 50 ROLILj|Flash Transfer Relay NEMA $28.75}  $1,437.50 $31.00 $1,550.00 $27.501  $1,375.00
11 10 ROLLYStandard Bus Interface unit (CTU 700) For NEMA, TS-2 $190.00f  $1,900.00f NO BID NO BID!  $213.75] $2,137.50
12 5 ROLIISHA-1250 Base A {Mounting) Noise Supressor $31.00 $155.00f NOBID NOBID|| NO BID NO BID
13 5 EA |ISHA-1250 Noise Supressor $135.00 $675.00f NO BID NO BIDI  NO BID NO BID
14 5 EA JHESCO RLS HE-1750 Tees high Energy Supressor $130.00 $650.00f NO BID NO BIDBj| NO BID NO BID
15 10 EA |IBrass Threaded Inserts for Attachemts (4) $228.00 $2,280.00 $218.00 $2,180.00 $294.63 $2,946.30
16 1 EA |Ribs, Tops & Bottoms $153.00] $1,530.00| $166.00 $1,660.00 $200.88]  $2,008.80
17 25 SET |iPed Buttons (Yellow) with 3"Round Body NO BID NO BID $26.00 $650.00 $80.46] $2,011.50
18 100 SET |[3/4 Inch Threaded CGB(Cord Crip) Black Nylon NO BID NO BID $8.00 $800.00 §6.70 $670.00
19 4 EA |lAutomatic Traffic Recorder NO BID NO BID| __NO BID NO BID|| NO BID NO BID
SUBTOTAL......ooiiiviveaen
NETTOTAL ..........vuuu... $29,387.50 $12,727.50 $45,802.45
TERMS. ...t iiiininnn
DELIVERY .ivvinvinsnnneannen
RECOMMENDATION:

Award:

Bid #2015-58 Traffic Signal Parts and Hardware to Texas Highway Products the lowest

bidder meeting specifications in the amount of $38,589.

DISCLAIMER:

Department: PUBLIC WORKS/STREETS
Budgeted Amount Available; $100,000
Additional Funds Required: $0.00
Prepared By Velma Gomez, Senior Secretary 1

The above bid recommendation is made by Department Directors and the final award is subject to City Council approval,
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