BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Tille: Waterworks Fittings and Materials

Bid No.: 2018-07
Date Opened: October 19, 2015 @ 3:00 p.m.

Page 1 of 8

ACT Pipe & Supply EMMSA, Co. Aguaworks Pipe & Supply, LLC
Mission, Texas McAlien, Texas Brownsville, Texas
UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
ITEM Qry DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
Group A Brass Fittings

1 200 {4 Angle Stop by Compression { BA43-232WNL or Equal) 3 3044 $ 6,088.00( % 36.32]% 7,264.00 || $ 52,40 1% 10,480.00
2 100 [[1"X 34" Pack Joint *Y" (Y44-243NL ar Equal) 5 259G % 2,590,00 || § 35118 3,i151.00 1 8 2454 1§ 2,454.00
3 100 |[}#" Angle Stop by Compression { BA43-444W NL or Equal) 3 78061 % 7,80500|{% 90.8C | % 9,080.00 )i 78621% 7,862.00
4 150 |[1"x34Ford Angle Stop by Compression { BA43-242WNL o Fqual) 5 39281 % 589200} $% 45851 % 7.027.50 )| $ 59,44 | % 8,916.00
5 100 ||2" Multi "Y" Service {Ford Y11-474NL or Equal 5 50511 8 5051009 % 614315 6,143.0C || $ 6669 |5 56,669.00
& 60 2" Balt Corp MIP X PJ (FB1100-7NL or Egual) $ 161631 & 9,697.807% 1747015 10,482,060 { $ 168.52 1% 9,511.20
7 50 |j1" Brass Senvice Plugs {Ford CSP-4-1 or Equal) 3 701 % 395.0011 % 59718 498,501 § 13.29118% 660.50
8 100 |i%4 Straight Meter Couplings {Ford G38-23-2-5 NL or Equaf} 8 5001 % 500.00 || $ 832]8 83200} $ 6211% 621.00
9 100 1% Pack Joint Compression coupling (C44-33 NL or Equal} % 12521 & 1,25200(% 1522 1% 1,522.00 | & 1247315 1.247.00
10 100 j1" Pack Joinl Compression coupling {C44-44 NL or Equal) $ 1431 % 143100} % 174118 1,741.00 | § 13.61)% 1,361.00
11 40 {|2" Angle Stop x Compression (FV43-777W-NL or equal) § 6594| % 6B37T60|$ 18061}1% 7224404 % 16266 | $ 6,5056.4C
12 10 {[1%4" Angle Stop x Compression (FV43-866W-NL or Equal} $ 129261 % 1,2026C{13% 140691 % 1,406.90 | $ 126.70 | §  1,267.00
13 30 11" Straight Meter Coupling{C38-44-2.625 or equal) $ 10271 % 308.10 | $ 12.501% 375.00] % 9551% 286.50
14 100  |[Expansion conneclions for 5/8 x 3/4 meter {Ford EC-23 or Equal) $ 13741 % 1.374000 % 18721% 1872001 % 13.22 1% 1,322.00
15 10 [V Bronze Meler Flange x FIP with accessories (Ford CF31-66 or equal $ 52351 % 523501 % 36.131% 361301 % 306218 306.20
16 30 [2" Branze Meter Flange % FIP with accessories (Ford CF31-77 or equal) 3 64091 % 4,92270[k8 471813 1,41540 || § 3997 1% 1,19910

Total Group A $ 52,760,30 $ 60,396.00 § 60,668.90

Group B: Copper Fittings

1 50 2" X 1" Copper Reducer (For 2" Copper Tubing) for hard copper No Bid No Bid No Bid
2 20 2" Copper Couplings ( For 2" Copper Tubing} for hard copper No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 20 2" 45° Copper (For 2" Copper Tubing) for hard copper No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 30 |[2" 90 (For 2" Copper Tubing) for hard copper No Bid No Bid No Bid

Total Group B No Bid No Bid No Bid

Group C: Barrel Couplings .

1 20 |i4" 421 top bolt coupiing 0.0 range 4.46-5.60 (Smith Blais,Romac Masro, or approved equal) $ 16607] % 3,321.4C No Bid || $ 15313 | §  3,082.60
2 12 |[6" 421 top bolt coupling 0.0 range 6.56-7.60 {Smith Blais, Romac Macro, or approved equal) $ 219171 % 2,630.04 No Bid || $ 19841 |5 2,380.92
3 6  [I8" 421 top bolt coupling ©.D range 8.54-8.85 {Smith Blals,Romac Macro, or approved equal) $ 248181 % 1,485.08 No Bid §| $ 22468 |% 1,348.08
4 3 [110" 421 top boit coupling ©.D range 11.00-12.20 {Smith Blair,Romac Macyo, or approved equal) $ 343251 % 1,029.75 No Bid || § 29636 1 & 889.08

Total Group C $ 8,470.27 No Bid $ 7,680.68

Group D: Service Saddles

1 10 [l4"x3/4" Brass Service Saddis{Single Strap Ford Style 161B or Equal} 0.D Range 4.80-5.40 $ 34811 % 348.10 1 40.38 1 $ 403.80 1| $ 34551% 34550
2 10 {j4" x1" Brass Service Saddie(Single Strap Ford Style 101B or Equal)0.D Range 4.80-5.40 $ 3481] 3% 348.10[1% 40381 % 403.80 || $ 34551% 345.50
3 10 {4 x 2 Brass Service Saddie (Double Strap Ford Siyle 202B or Equal) 0.D Range 4.80-5,40 $ 8017 ] $ 801.70 §| $ 9M.75F% 907,50 || $ 79.57 1% 795.70
4 10 {|6"X3/4' Brass Senvice Saddie{Single Strap Ford Style 1018 Or Egual} 0.D Range 6.90-7,50 $ 4236 $ 423.60 || $ 49.16 1% 491.50 1 § 420315 420,30
5 10 Ilﬁ"x1" Brass Service Saddle (Single Strap Ford Style1018 or Equal) 0.0 Range 6.96-7.50 $ 42361 § 423.60§ $ 49.151% 491.501 % 42.03]% 420,30
8 10 "6" x 2"'Brass Service Saddle (Double Strap Ford Style 20628 or Equal) 0.D Range 6.90-7.50 $ 93451 % 934.501% 10449]3% 1,04490] % 02741 % 0927.40
7 10 ||B"x3/4" Brass Service Saddle(Single Strap Ford Style 1018 or Equal) 0.0 Range 9.05-9.62 $ 54.00] § 540.00 || $ 62631% 626.30 | & 53.56 | $ 535.60
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BID RECOMNMENDATION FORM

Title: Waterworks Fittings and Materials

Bid No.: 2016-07
Date Opened: QOctober 19, 2015 @ 3:00 p.m.

Page 2 of 8

ACT Pipe & Supply EMMSA, Co. Aguaworks Pipe & Supply, LLC
Mission, Texas McAllen, Texas Brownsville, Texas
UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
ITEM QTY DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
Group D: Service Saddies {Cont'd}
8 10 18" x 1" Brass Service Saddle (Single Strap Fard style 1018 or approved Equal) O.D Range 9.05-9.62 $ 54.00 | $ 540.00 )| $ 62631% £26.30 || $ 53.56 | $ 535.60
9 10 ||8" x 2"Brass Service Saddle (Double Sirap Ford Style 202B or Equal) ©.0 Range 9.05-9.62 $ 105521% 1,05520)|% 118.00]% 1,180.00 || 104798 1,047.90
10 10 {[12" x 2"Brass Service Saddle (Double Sirap Ford Siyle 2028 or Equal) O.D Range 13.20-14.38 $ 15326 % 1532605 17139]% 1,713.901 & 152.121%  1,521.20
Total Group B $ 6,947.40 $ 7,889.50 $ 6,895.00
Group E: Copper Tubing
1 2,000 4" Soft Copper Type "K” ( 100" Roks) NoBid||$ 273.156]% 546,320.00 } § "4201{% 8,400.00
2 1,000 {}1" Soft Copper Type "K" (100’ Rolls) NoBidl{§$ 35590]% 355,900.00 || $ 4911% 491000
3 500 |[2" Hard Copper Type "L" (20° Joinis) NoBidf|$ 135481% 67,740.00 (| 1855 | § ©,275.00
4 60 ||1"% Hard Copper Type "L" ( 20' Jeints No Bid || $ 89.8215% 5380201 % 12451 % 747.00
Total Group E No 8id $ 975,349.20 $ 23,332.00
Group F: Meter Boxes
1 35 [i15" x 25" Gast lron Reclanguiar Box with 2" Inlet and outiet opening and hasp No Bid No Bid |{ $ 8500 | $ 2,975.00
2 500 HPiastic oval meter box with ptaslic meter lid (DFW1017 or approved equal) No Bid Mo Bid || $ 48.97 | $ 24,485.00
Total Group F No Bid No Bid $ 27,460.00
Group G: Valve Boxes
50 [iComplele valve box $ 81871 % 4,09350(3 32661% 1,633.00{$ B81.21| $ 4,060.50
15 |IValve Bax Lid ( Lid Only) $ 3287|$% 49455]%  1066]S 159.90 |[§ 32703 49050
15 ||Upper section of valve box $ 13191 § 197.85 No Bid || $ 12.96§ $ 194.40
Total Group G $ 4,785.,90 % 1,792.90 $ 4,745.40
Group H: Tapping Gate Valves
1 10 {2" Resilient Gate Valve Mueller A-2360 or AFC2500 Series (THD X THD) § 23547]| % 2,354.70 No Bid || $ 2276913 227650
2 5  |i2" Brass Gate Valve (Hammond 18-645 Or Equal Threaded on both ends) $ 15638 % 781.90 No Bid || $ 1224148 612.05
3 12 |4 MJ X Flange Resilient Wedge Gate Valve (Mueller A-2360 or AFC 2500 Sedies) $ 3BOT70| % 4,328.40 NoBid || § 35588 |% 4,270.56
4 12 {4 MJ X MJ Resilient Wedge Gate Valve {Musller A-2360 or AFC 2500 Series) $ 377811 3% 4,533.72 No Bid [{ $ 37299 1% 447588
5 8 [[5" MJ X MJ Resilient Wedge Gate Valve (Mueller A-2360 or AFC 2500 Sezies) $ 48211§ % 289266 No Bid || $ 47575 | % 2,854.50
6 8 "6 MJ % Flange Resilient Wedge Gate Valve (Muslier A-2350 or AFC 2500 Series) $ 48211 & 289266 No Bid || $ 475.751% 2,854.50
7 2 {18" MJ X MJ Resilient Wedge Gate Valve (Muelier A-2360 or AFC 2500 Series) $ 7679013 153580 No Bid || $ 757.721% 1,51544
8 2 [H2" MJ X MJ Resilient Wedge Gate Valve {(Mugeller A-2360 of AFC 2500 Series) $ 151513 $ 3,030.26 NoBid[[$ 1,494.24]1% 20989.88
9 2 |{12° x 4 Tapping Steeve ( O.D 13.13-13.60) Smith Blair 622 or approved equal $ 34000} $ 680.00 No Bid §§ $ 402.09 | % 804.18
10 2 j[18"X &' Tapping Steeve (0.D 17.40-17.80} Smith Blair 622 or approved equal $ 461361 % 922.72 No Bid }| $ 491191 % 982.38
Total Group Hi $ 23,852.82 No Bid $ 22,653.89
Group [: Fire Hydrant Repair Kits
1 5  [iMusller Safety Flange Repair Kit (1968-Present) $ 126001 % 630.00 No Bid || $ 22050 § 1,102.50
Total Group | $ - 630.00 No Bid $ 1,102.50

Page 211




BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Title: Waterworks Fitlings and Materials

Bid No.: 2016-07
Date Opened: Qctober 19, 2015 @ 3:00 p.m.

Page 3 of 8

ACT Pipe & Supply EMMSA, Co. Aguaworks Pipe & Supply, LLC
Mission, Texas McAllen, Texas Brownsvilie, Texas
UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
ITEM QTty DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
Group J: Fire Hydrant Extension Kit
1 2 |[Mueller Super Centerion 250 Exiension .5" No Bid No Bid J| 44816 | $ 896.32
2 2  |[Mueler Super Centerion 250 Exiension 1' No Bid No Bid || $ 513461 5 102592
Total Group J No Bid No Bid $ 1,923.24
Group K: Fire Hydrants
1 5 ' Fire Hydrant { Super Centarion 250 or approved equal) $ 1,82573| 8 9,128.65 NoBid §§ 2,050.48 | § 10,252.45
Total Group K $ 9,128.65 No Bid $ 10,252.45
Group L: Sanitary Sewer Rings and Covers
1 2 |ls'x48" LD, 24 opening x 1/2 wall manhcle $956.521 $ 1,913.04 NoBid[[$ 1,106.78| $ 2,213.56
Z 1 [l8'x48" 1.D,32" opening x 1/2 wall manhole $1,062.22| § 1,062.22 NoBid[f$ 1108781 % 1,106.78
3 20 124" Plastic Rain Guard with strap $22.00] % 44000 No Bid | $ 22501 % 450.00
4 20 132" Plastic Rain Guard with strap $41.00] § 820.00 No Bid || $ 68751 % 137500
5 10 [24"Manhols Ring and Covers (With City of Edinburg Logo) with bolts $295.70] $ 2,957.00 No Bid [| $ 280451 8§ 2,894.50
6 10 {[24"Manhole Ring and Cavers (With City of Edinburg Logo) $226.77] $ 2,267.70 No Bid | § 248401 % 2,484.00
7 20 {[24" Plastic Adjusting Rings $26.001 $ 520.00 No Bid || § 3031] % 606.20
8 20 ||30" Plastic Adiusting Rings $41.00] § 820.00 No Bid || $ 4980 5 996.00
9 2 30" Manhcle Ring and Covers ( With City of Edinburg Logo) $327.87] & £65.74 NoBid || % 244951 $ 489.90
Total Group L $ 11,455.70 No Bid $ 12,615.94
Group M: Repair Clamps
1 6 |4 Full dircle repair clamp (0.0 Range 4.45-4.75, Width 15")Smith Biair 226 or approved equai $ 62981 % 377.88 NoBid || $ 74981 % 445.88
2 6 " Full circle repair clamp (Q.D Range 4.45-4.75 Width 7.5)Smith Blair 226 or approved equal % 35151 % 216.90 NoBid|| § 37931 ¢ 227.58
3 3 |l4" Full cirde repair clamp (0.D Range 4.95-5,35 Width 12.5)Smith Blair 226 or approved eguai 3 61211 % 183,63 NoBid|| $ 65.16 | $ 19548
4 15 H4" Full circle repair clamp (O.D Range 4.95-5.35 Width 7.5)Smith Blair 226 or approved aqual 3 3825] 8% 573,756 N& Bid || § 39.36| % 580.40
5 6 ji4" Full eircle repair clamp (C.D Range 5.22-5,62 Widlh 7.5)Smith Blair 226 or approved equal $ 36231 % 235,38 NoBid || $ 264 | $ 231.84
6 6 |[8” Full eircle repair clamp {O.D Range 6.84-7.24 Widih 7.5)Smith Biair 226 or approved equal $ 43681 § 262.08 NoBid|$ 4562 | % 27372
7 3 {[8” Full circle repair clamp £0.D Range B.84-7.24 Width 15"} Smith Blair 226 or approved equal 5 77241 % 231.72 No Bid |§ $ 8686 | % 260.58
8 10 {B" Full circle repair clamp {O.D Range 7.05-7.45 Width 7.5)Smith Biair 226 or approved equal $ 44861 % 448,60 No Bid || $ 45621 % 456.20
9 6 & Full circle repair clamp {0, Range 7.05-7.45 Width 12.5)Smith Blair 226 or approved equal $ 6989} % 419,34 No Bid [{§ 72.95(% 43770
10 3 ||8" Full circle repair clamp (0.D Range 7.26-7.56 Width 7.5)Smith Blair 226 or approved equal 3 74321 % 222,96 Mo Bid {| $ 45621 $ 136.86
1% 4 |i8" Full eircle repair clamp (0.0 9.27-9.87 Width 7.5)Smith Blair 226 or approved squal 5 5240 % 209.60 No Bid j| $ 53551 % 214.20
12 2 |8 Fult circle repair damp (0.D 9.27-8.67 Width 12.5)Smith Blair 226 or approved equal $ 83993 167.98 No Bid || $ 8576 [ $§ 17152
13 4 |l8" £ull circle repair damp (0. Range 5.99-9.39 Width 7.5)Smith Blair 226 or approved equal $ 51233 204.02 No Bid |[ 5 5355 % 21420
14 2 |i18" Full ciscle repair camp (0.0 Range 8.99-9.39 Width 15"Smith Blair 226 or approved equal $ 93831 % 187.66 NoBid §| & 10407 | $ 208.14
15 2 |10" Full tiscle repair clamp (0.D Range 10.75 PVC €900 Width 12.5)Smith Blair 226 or approved equal $ 10523} % 210.46 NoBid || $ 10936 | $ 218.72
16 2 |12 Full circle repair ciamp (O.D Range 13.10-13.50 Width 15*)Smith Blair 225 or approved equal $. 137783 3 275.56 No Bid || $ 16734 | % 334.68
17 2 118" Full cigcle repair clamp (O.D Range 17.45-17.90 Width 15")Smith Blair 226 or approved equal $ 218.121 % 436.24 No Bid [{ $ 30330)1 % 606.60
Total Group M $ 4,864.66 No Bid $ 5,228.30




BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Title: Waterworks Fitfings and Materials

Bid No.: 2018-07

Page 4 of 8
Date Opened: October 19, 2015 @ 3:00 p.m.
ACT Pipe & Supply EMMSA, Co. Aguaworks Pipe & Supply, LLC
Mission, Texas McAllen, Texas Brownsville, Texas
UNIT EXTENMDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
ITEM Qry DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
Group N: Sewer Francos
1 20 [l4" Pve X 4" Clay No Bid NoBid | $ 336] % 67.20
2 20 |[6" x 6" Pvc x Clay No Bid No Bid || § 7191 % 143.80
3 20 ||8" x 8" Pvcx Clay No Bid No Bid || $ 11.06 1 & 221.20
Total Group N No Bid No Bid % 432,20
Group ©: PVC Restraints
1 20 {l4" Mega Lugs with accessories (Ebba fron or equal) $ 351] 3% 630,20 $ 33331 % 666.6C || $ 28.731% 574.60
2 20 [l8" Mega Lugs with accesscries(Ebba Iron or equal) 3 39.794{ % 795.80 4 % 3776 | $ 755.201 % 36301 % 726.00
3 12 |I8" Mega Lugs with accesscries (Ebba lron or equal} $ 53781 % 84536 || § 50.95 1% 61140101 % 4617435 580.04
4 12 J[12" Mega Lugs wilh accessosies {Ebba lfon or equa) § 9772 $ 11728413 63.1019% 1,117.20 0 % 8961 ]|% 107532
Total Group O $  3,244.00 $ 3,150.40 $ 2,965.96
Group P: Meter Gaskets
i 1,000 [|%x¥% Straight Meter coupling rubber gasket $ 0071 % 70.00 NoBid || § 0.071% 70.00
2 1,000 {{¥%x=¥ Straight Meler coupling fiber plug $ 008] & 80.00 NoBid i § 0031% 90.00
3 1,000 |[1" Straight Meter coupling rubber gasket 5 0.08)] % 80.00 No Bid || § 0.08]% 80.00
4 1,000 [iFord Meter yoke rubber gasket $ 0254 % 250.00 No Bid || § 08413 840.00
Total Group P, $ 480.00 No Bid || - t$  1,080.00
TOTAL AMOUNT. .............
LESS DISCOUNT..............
TOTALAMOUNT.............. $126,719.70 $1,048,578.00 $189,036.46
TERMS. ......oiiviineenn s
DELIVERY .......c.cvaiannn
RECOMMENDATION:

Award: Bid No. 2016-07 Waterworks Fitings & Materials to Morrison Supply Morrison Supply, HD Supply
Waterworks, ACT Pipe & Supply and Aguaworks Pipe & Supply, LLC based on unit prices,

DISCLAIMER:
The above bid recommendation is made by Department Directors and the final award is subject to City Council approval.

Department Uiility/Systems
Budgeted Amount Available: $198,000.00

Additional Funds Regquired:

Prepared By Monica L. Perez, Admin. Assi. |l
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BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Title: Waterworks Fittings and Materials

Bid No.: 2016-07

Page 5 of 8
Date Opened; October 19, 2015 @ 3:00 p.m.
Morrison Supply HD Supply Waterworks
Harlingen, Texas McAllen, Texas
UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
ITEM Qry DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
Greup A: Brass Fittings
1 200 [B4" Angle Stop by Gompression ( BA43-232WNL or Equal) 3 30801 % 6,18000)% 33281% 6,656.00
2 100 [{1"X 34" Pack Joint ™" {Y44-243NL or Equal) 3 26881 % 2,598.008 283218 2,832.00
3 100 {1 Angle Stop by Compression { BA43-444W NL or Equal) $ 78451 % 7845000 % 8534 | % 8,534.00
4 150 {[1"x%Ford Angle Stop by Compression { BA43-242WNL or Equal) $ 394588 % 59220008 4295| 8§ 6,442.50
5 100 [[2" Multi "Y" Service {Ford ¥ 11-474NL or Equal) $ 51201 % 51200018 55.22 1% 5,522.00
G 60 [l Bali Corp MIP X PJ (FB1100-7NL or Equal) $ 16400 % 984000108 176723 10,603.20
7 50 |1 Brass Service Plugs {Ford CSP-4-1 or Equal} 3 7931 % 396.501 % BG4 15 432.00
8 100 |} Straight Meter Couplings {Ford £38-23-2-5 NL or Equal) 3 6621 % 662001 % 729| % 729.00
9 100 |4 Pack Joint Compression coupling {C44-33 NL or Equal) 3 124218 12420001 % i3.65 1% 1,369.00
0 100  [[1" Pack Joint Gompression coupling {C44-44 NL or Equat) 5 4291%  1421.001$ 15661 % 1,565.00
11 40 Ji2" Angie Stop x Compression (FV43-777W-NL or equal) $ 165903| % 6637.20||S 18143}% 7,257.20
12 10 1%4" Angle Stop x Compression  (FV43-666W-N& or Equal) $ 1290921 % 129920|% 14133]% 1,413.30
13 30 ||1" Slraight Meter Coupling(C38-44-2.625 or equal) $ 102041 % 30600118 11231 % 338.90
14 400 |[Expansion connections for /8 x 3/4 meter {Ford EC-23 or Equal) $ 13871 % 13870018 15.02 | $ 1,5602.00
16 10  |M"v: Bronze Meter Flange x FIP with accessories {Ford CF31-66 or equal $ 31131 % 314301 § 32481 % 324.80
16 30 [12" Brenze Meter Flange x FI® with accessories (Ford CF31-77 or equal) $ 40641 % 1,219.20)1 % 42411% 1,272.30
Total Group A $  52,395.40 $ 56,791.20
Group B: Copper Fittings
1 50 [[2" X 1" Copper Reducer {For 2" Copper Tubing) for hard copper 5 5081 $ 4540011 § 7.891% 394.50
2 20 |i2" Copper Couplings ( For 27 Copper Tubing) for hard copper $ 5771 § 11540 || $ 4921% $8.40
3 20 |I2" 45° Copper (For 2" Copper Tubing) for hard copper $ 1024 ] % 204804 & 8.07 1% 181.40
4 30 {[2" 90 (For 2" Copper Tubing) for hard copper 5 11481 % 34440 )| § 9771% 293.10
Total Group B $ 1,118.60 $- - 967.40
Group C: Barrel Couplings .
1 20 [}4" 421 top bolt coupling O.D range 4.46-5.60 (Smith Blair, Romac Macrc, or approved equab) NoBidl|$ 1373513 2,747.00
2 12 " 421 top boit coupling C.D range 6.56-7.60 (Smith Biair, Romac Macro, or approved equal) NoBid{|$ 18135]% 2,176.20
3 6 J|8" 421 top boli coupling ©.0 range 8.54-5.85 {(Smith Blair, Romas Macro, or approved equal) NoBid||$ 20538]% 1,232.28
4 3 |110" 421 top bolt coupling ©.D range 11.00-12.20 {Smith Blair,Remac Macto, or approved equat) NoBid||$ 261.33]% 783.99
Total Group C Ne Bid $ 6,939.47
Group D: Service Saddles

1 10 ||4"x3/4" Brass Service Saddle(Single Strap Ford Style 101B or Equal) G.© Range 4.80-5.40 $ 3391} $ 33810 % 3871135 367.10
2 10 J|4" x1" Brass Sesvice Saddle(Single Strap Ford Style 101B or Equal)0.D Range 4.80-5.40 i 33751 % 337.50% 36.71] % 367.10
3 10 |[4" x 2" Brass Service Saddle (Double Sirap Ford Style 2028 or Equal} 0.0 Range 4.80-5.40 $ 77651 % 776.50 || & B4.54 | & 845.40
4 10 !E“XGM' Brass Service Saddle(Single Strap Ford Style 101B Or Equal) O.D Range 6.90-7.50 $ 4148 | % 41480 § 44671 % 446.70
5 16 Jl6"x1" Brass Senvice Saddle (Singie Slrap Ford Stylet01B or Equal) 0.0 Range 6.90-7.50 $  41.03( % 410308 446719 446.70
6 10 "6" x 2"Brass Service Saddle (Double Strap Ford Style 202B or Equal) 0.0 Range 6.90-7.50 $ 90511 5 905101 % G8.551% 985.50
7 10 il "x3/4" Brass Sendce Saddle(Single Strap Ford Style 101B or Equal} 0.D Range 9.05-9.62 $ 52881 % 528.80 || § 56.94 18 569.40

Page 214




BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Title: Waterworks Fittings and Malerials

Bid No.: 2016-07

Page 8 of 8
Date Opened: October 19, 2015 @ 3:00 p.m.
Morrison Supply HD Supply Waterworks
Harilngen, Texas McAllen, Texas
UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
ITEM QryY BESCRIPTICN PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
Group D: Service Saddles {Cont'd)
8 10 {[8' % 1" Brass Service Saddle (Single Strap Ford style 101B or approved Equal) 0.0 Range 9.05-9.62 $ 5229|% 52290i% 569418 569.40
9 10 [|8" x 2"Brass Sesvice Saddle {Double Strap Ford Slyie 2028 or Equal) O.D Range 9.05-8.62 $ 1022115 1,022104$ 11127138 1,112.70
10 10 [112" x 2"Brass Service Saddle {Double Strap Ford Style 202B or Equal) 0.0 Range 13.20-14.38 $§ 1484515 148450045 16162]8% 1,616.20
Total Group D, $ 6,741.60 $ 7,326.20
Group E: Copper Tubing
1 2,000 |}4" Soft Copper Type "K" ( 100" Rolls} $ 2641 % 528000 % 2511% 5,020.00
2 1,000 |1 Soft Copper Typs "K" {100' Rolls) 5 3641 % 364000 % 32715 3,270.00
3 500 2" Hard Copper Type "L" ( 20° Joints) $ 686 % 3,43C0C1% 639]% 3,195.00
4 60 |1 Hard Copper Type "L" [ 20° Joints 5 AT1] § 282600 % 4231% 253.80
Total Group E $ 12,632.60 $  11,738.80
Group F: Meter Boxes
1 35 {15 % 25" Cast Iron Rectangular Box with 2" Inlet and oullet opening and hasp No Bid i $ 66.056]% 2,311.75
2 500 |[Piastic oval meter box with plastic meter lid (DFW 1017 or approved equal) NoBid || $ 20521% 10,2606.00
Total Group F| No Bid % 12,671.75
Group G: Valve Boxes
1 50 {|Complete valve box NoBidil$ 1981485 9,807.00
2 15 alve Box Lid ( Lid Cnly) NoBid)| § 8214 | & 1,232.10
3 15 |[Upper seciion of valve box No Bid || § 13.32 1% 199.80
Total Group G No Bid $ 11,338.90
Group H: Tapping Gate Valves
1 10 {|2" Resilient Gate Valve Muslier A-2360 or AFC2500 Sesies {THD X THD) $ 22102 % 221020)$ 208248 2,082.40
2 5 ||2" Brass Gate Valve (Hammond IB-645 Or Equal Threaded on both ends) $ 106131 % 53065]% 128.35]% 641.95
3 12 |l4" MJ X Flange Resilient Wedge Gale Valve {Mueller A-2380 or AFC 2500 Series) $ 34547f % 41456418 325.95%% 3,911.40
4 12 [l4" MJ X MJ Resilient Wedge Gate Valve (Mueller A-2360 or AFC 2500 Series) $ 36208] % 434496(§ 341.107% 4,093.20
5 6 [[6" MJ X MJ Resilient Wedge Gate Valve {Mueller A-2360 or AFC 2500 Series) $ 46183 % 277098013 43551]% 2,613.06
5 & ||" MJ X Flange Resilicnt Wedge Gale Valve (Muefier A-2360 or AFC 2500 Series) $ 46183 $ 2770985 43551|$% 2,613.06
7 2 |l8" MJ X MJ Resiiient Wedge Gale Valve (Mueller A-2360 or AFG 2500 Series) $ 73554 % 14710818 693081% 1,386.16
8 2 [[2" MJ X MJ Resiiient Wedge Gate Valve (Mueller A-2360 or AFC 2500 Series) $ 14512118 28024215 1,367.13}8 2,734.26
9 2 112" x 4' Tapping Sleeve (©.D 13.12-13.60} Smith Blair 622 or approved equal $ 403751 % 2807501 3514415 702.88
10 2 |[18"X 6' Tapping Sleeve {(0.D 17.40-17.80) Smith Blair 622 or approved equal $ 52043 % 104086)1% 437.03}3% 874.06
Total Group H $ 22,895.27 § 29 ,662.43
Group |: Fire Hydrant Repair Kits
1 5 |liMueller Safely Flange Repair Kit (1988-Present) $ 166861 % 83430 (1% 144851 % 724.30
Total Group | $ 834.30 $ 724.30

Page 215




BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Title: Waterworks Fittings and Materials

Bid No.: 2016-07

Page 7 of 8
Date Cpened: October 19, 2015 @ 3:00 p.m.
Morrisor Supply HD Supply Waterworks
Harlingen, Texas McAllen, Texas
UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
ITEM Qry DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE FRICE
Group .Jl: Fire Hydrant Extension Kit

1 2 {Mueller Super Centerion 250 Extension .5" $ 28710} % 574.201% 137101 % 27420
2 2 |Mueller Super Centerion 250 Extension 1° $ 33930] % 6786015 160.071% 320.14

Total Group J $ 1,262.80 $ 594.34

Group K: Fire Hydrants

4 5 {4 Fire Hydrant { Super Centerion 250 or approved equal) $1,765.001 % 8,825.00] % 1,572.23]3% 7,861.15

Total Group K| $ 8,825.00 $ 7,861.15

Group L: Sanitary Sewer Rings and Covers

1 2 |i8'48" 1.0, 24 opening x 142 wali manhole $1,06222]| $ 2124444 % 1,086911% 2,173.82
2 1 8'x48" 1.D,32" opening x 1/2 wall manhole $1,062.221 % 1,062,220 % 1,086.91 1% 1,086.91
3 2¢  §[24" Piastic Rain Guard with strap No Bid || $ 27751 % 555.00
4 20 {|32" Plastic Rain Guard with sirap No Bid || $ 4247 1% 849.40
5 10 {|24"Manhcle Ring and Cavers (Wilh City of Edinburg Logo} with bolis NoBid||$ 305.251% 3,052.50
§ 40 [|24"Manhele Ring and Covers (With City of Edinburg Logo) NoBidl| $§ 305251% 3,052.50
7 20 [|24" Plastic Adjusting Rings NoBid | $ 1887 41% 377.40
8 20 |Jj30" Plastic Adjusting Rings NoBid || $ 43791 % 875.80
g 2 ||j30" Manhole Ring and Covers ( With City of Edinburg Logo) NoBidjl$ 338461]1% 676,92

Taotal Greup L $ 3,186.66 3 12,700.25

Group M: Repair Clamps

1 6 4" Full circle repair ciamp (O.D Range 4.45-4.75, Width 15"}Smith Blair 226 or approved equal $ 61681 % 370081 % 90.00 § § 540.00
2 6  [4” Full circle repair clamp (0.0 Range 4.45-4.75 Width 7.5)Smilh Blair 225 or approved equal $ 35401 % 212.401(% 4571193 274.26
3 3 |@" Full circle repair clamp (0.0 Range 4.95-5.35 Width 12.5)Smith Blair 226 or approved equal $ 55841 % 179.82 || & 8162 |8 244.86
4 15  ||4" Fuli circle repair clamp (0.0 Range 4.95-5.35 Width 7.5)Smith Blair 226 or approved equal $ 37461 % 569.90 || & 47,8218 717.30
5 § " Fult circle repair clamp (C.D Range 5.22-5.62 Width 7.5)Smith Blair 226 or approved equal 5 38421 & 230521 % 48.43 ] § 250.68
6 6 ||6" Full circle repair clamp (C.D Range 6.84-7.24 Width 7.5)Smith Blair 226 or approved equal 3 42781 § 25668 || § 5584 | % 335.04
7 3 18" Fuil circle repair clamp (O.D Range 6.84-7.24 Widih 15") Smith Blair 226 or approved equat % 75641 % 22692118 103.801% 311.40
8 10 |8" Fuil circle repair clamp (O.D Range 7.05-7.45 Width 7.5)Smith Biair 226 or approved equal $ 43931 % 4393C 1 § 5669%% 566.90
9 6 |8" Full circle repair clamp (0.0 Range 7.05-7.45 Width 12.5)Smith Blair 226 or approved equal $ 68451 % 410704 § 90.791% 544,74
0 3 |B" Full cirde repair clamp {0.D Range 7.26-7.56 Width 7.5)Smith Blair 226 or approved equal $ 72781 % 218.34 | $ 58.14 | % 174.42
11 4 [l8" Full cirdle repair clamp {0.D $.27-9.67 Width 7.5)Smith Blair 226 or approved equal $ 51311 % 20624 11 § 68.291% 273.16
12 2 "8" Full circie repair clamp (0.D 9.27-9.67 Width 12.5)Smith Blair 226 or approved equal $ 82251 % 1645013 1093418 218.68
13 4 |l&" Full circle repair clamp (0.D Range 8.99-9.39 Widih 7.5)Smith Blair 226 or approved equal $ 4966 | $ 198.64 | $ 66.811% 267.24
14 2 8" Full circle repair clamp (Q.D Range 8.99-5.39 Widih 15")Smith Blair 226 or approved equal $ 91.751 § 18365018 127.471]1% 254.94
15 2 |[10" Full ciecle repair clamp (0.D Range 10.75 PVC C900 Width 12.5)Smith Blair 226 or approved equal $ 102011 5 20402 0($% 123.731% 247 .46
16 2 {[12" Full circle repair ciamp (O.D Range 13.10-13.50 Width 15")Smith Blair 226 or approved equal $ 134941 % 260.88 % 1834215 366.84
17 2 |he" Full circle repair ciamp (O.D Range 17.15-17.90 Width 15")Smith Blair 226 or approved equal $ 2136118 42722115 3BO.75}5 761.50

Total Group W -§.4,759.66 $ §,389.32
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BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Title: Waterworks Fittings and Materials
Bid No.: 2016-07

Page 8 of 8
Date Opened: Cctober 19, 2015 & 3:C0 p.m.
Morrison Supoly HD Supply Waterworks
Harlingen, Texas McAllen, Texas
UnNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED LINIT EXTENDED
ITEM Qry DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
Group N: Sewer Francos
1 20 {M" Pvc X 4" Clay $ 3201 % 54,00 || & 311483 62.20
2 20 |l8"x 8" Pvex Clay $ 8201 $ 164.00 || $ 565]% 133.00
3 20 |[B"x 8" PvcxClay $ $1.251 5 225004 % 1023 1% . 20460
Total Group N $ 453.00 $ 399,80
Graoup O: PVC Restraints
i 20 |{|4" Mega Lugs with accessories {Ebba iron or equal) % 28121 & 562.40 11 3288 % 657.60
2 20 |[6* Mega Lugs with accessories(Ebba Iron or equal) 3 35571 % 7114040 % 4151 ] % 830.20
3 12 |I8" Mega Lugs with accessories (Ebba Iron or eGual) $ 49471 % 593641 % 56,1118 673.32
4 12 12" Mega Lugs with accessories (Ebba Iron or equal) 3 88.40| % 1,06080($ 101.96}% 1,223.52
Total Group O $ 292824 $ 3,384.84
Group P: Meter Gaskets
1 1,000 [[%x¥% Straight Meter coupling rubber gasket 3 0081 % 80.00{ $ 006]% 60.00
2 1,000 |i%x% Straight Meter coupling fiber plug $ 003] & 80.001% c081% 80.00
3 1,000 [[1" Straight Meter coupling rubber gasket $ 0.11] & 110.00 || § 0.071% 70.00
4 1,000 |jFord Meter yoke rubber gaskel 3 0221 % 2200011 5 023% 230.00
Total Group P $ 490.00 $ 440.00
TOTAL AMOUNT. .............
LESS DISCOUNT. .............
TOTAL AMOUNT.............. $118,613.13 $161,819.95
TERMS.....................
DELIVERY .......cciiniinnt
RECOMMENDATION:

Award: Bid No. 2016-07 Waterworks Fittings & Materials to Morrison Supply Morrison Supply, HD Supply

Waterworks, ACT Pipe & Supply and Aguaworks Pipe & Supply, LLC based on unit prices.

DISCLAIMER:
The above bid recommendation Is made by Department Directors and the final award Is subject to City Council approval.

Department Utility/Systems

Budgeted Amount Available: $198,000.00

Additional Funds Reguired:

Prepared By Monica L. Perez, Admin. Asst. |l
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