BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Title: Purchase of City Vehicles

Bid No.: 2016-48
Date Opened: 11/30/15 Page 1 of 6
Silsbee Ford Caldwell Country Chevrolet Grande Truck Center
TEM|  QUANTITY DESCRIPTION OF GOODS OR SERVICES GIMIT EXTENDED: | UMIT | EXTENGEG | UNIT | EXTENDED
PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
BUILDING MAINTENANCE
1 1 ¥ Ton Pickup Truck $23,202.48 $23,202.48|| $22,415.00 $22,415.00[ $24,226.20 $24,226.20
STREETS
2 2 % Ton Pickup Truck $27,861.48 $55,722.96|| $25,720.00 $51,440.00| $28,414.63 $56,829.26
RECREATION
3 1 15 Passenger Van $35,694.00 $35,694.00/ $39,980.00 $39,980.00| $34,301.87 $34,301.87
PARKS & ROW/ROW DIVISION
4 1 Y2 Ton Pickup Truck $24,120.48 $24,120.48|| $22,490.00 $22,490.00| $24,497.81 $24,497.81
PARKS & ROW/PARKS DIVISION
5 1 Y2 Ton Pickup Truck $22 587.48 $22,587.48|| $21,955.00) $21,955.00| $23,861.38 $23,861.38
CODE ENFORCEMENT
6 2 4 Ton Pickup Truck $20,853.48 $41,706.96[ $25,880.00] $51,760.00) $25,920.01 $51,840.02
SYSTEMS
7 2 Y2 Ton Pickup Truck $20,434.48 $40,868.96|| $19,865.00 $39,730.00|| $20,647.15 $41,294.30
SYSTEMS
8 2 % Ton Pickup Truck $31,939.22 $63,878.44| $33,984.00 $67,968.00( $31,273.06 $62,546.12
SOLID WASTE MANAGEMENT
9 1 % Ton Pickup Truck $32,321.90 $32,321.90|| $37,358.00 $37,358.00|| $36,429.66 $36,429.66
SOLID WASTE MANAGEMENT
10 2 Y2 Ton Pickup Truck $25,243.48 $50,486.96| $22,883.00 $45,766.00| $24,956.85 $49,913.70
SUBTOTAL & vis wasis gui qws s wice oes $390,590.62 $400,862.00 $405,740.32
NET TOTAL.. .o e simm mommnin semin simsn samim
TERMS oo cmw sun spvnmas sor s oan o
BELIVERY . i vov vavi was i wsiais st s5is &
RECOMMENDATION:
Award:  Bid No. 2016-48- Purchase of City Vehicles, to Caldwell Country Chevrolet, (ltems 1, Department: Various
5, 10), Grapevine Chrysler & Dodge (Items 4, 7), Tipton Motors, Inc. (ltem 3), Silsbee Ford Budgeted Amount Available: $402,000
(ltems 6, 9), and Grande Truck Center (Item 8), in the Amount of of $333,645.92. Additional Funds Required: None
Prepared By: Lorena Fuentes, Purchasing Agent
DISCLAIMER: Page 706

The above bid recommendation is made by Department Directors and the final award is subject to City Council approval.




BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Title: Purchase of City Vehicles

Bid No.: 2016-48
Date Opened: 11/30/15 Page 2 of 6
Fiesta Chevrolet Tipton Motors Inc. Grapevine Chrysler & Dodge
ITEM|  QUANTITY DESCRIPTION OF GOODS OR SERVICES VRILT EXIENDED | UNIT | EXTENDED | UNIT | ‘EXTENDED
PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
BUILDING MAINTENANCE
1 1 ¥ Ton Pickup Truck $27,498.00] $27,498.00| $23,178.00] $23,178.00] $22,573.00 $22,573.00
STREETS
2 2 % Ton Pickup Truck $33,040.00] $67,880.00| $27,986.00] $55,972.00[ $24,985.00 $49,970.00
RECREATION
3 1 15 Passenger Van NO BID NO BID|| $33,478.00] $33,478.00 NO BID NO BID
PARKS & ROW/ROW DIVISION
4 1 % Ton Pickup Truck $27,676.00 $27,676.00|| $23,178.00) $23,178.00| $22,488.00 $22,488.00
PARKS & ROW/PARKS DIVISION
5 1 % Ton Pickup Truck $27,676.00] $27,676.00| $22,903.00] $22,903.00 NO BID NO BID
CODE ENFORCEMENT
B 2 ¥ Ton Pickup Truck $29,611.00] $59,222.00| $23,974.00] $47,948.00| $25,614.00 $51,228.00
SYSTENMS
7 2 Y2 Ton Pickup Truck $23,210.00 $46,420.00| $19,760.00)  $39,520.00| $19,426.00 $38,852.00
SYSTEMS
8 2 % Ton Pickup Truck $37,495.00] $74,990.00| $32,573.00] $65,146.00[ $32,519.00 $65,038.00
SOLID WASTE MANAGEMENT
9 1 % Ton Pickup Truck NO BID NO BID|| $35,556.00] $35,556.00 NO BID NO BID
SOLID WASTE MANAGEMENT
10 2 %% Ton Pickup Truck NO BID NO BID|| $24,694.00f  $49,388.00 $28,424.00 $56,848.00
SUBTOTAL « san e scinm svmin acsesn wwsac wowinsiasa $331,362.00 $396,267.00 $306,997.00
NET TOTAL 5 woisvvios s pis o s iy
TERMS ..ottt it iie i cnniannnans
DELIVERY .. iiiiiiiieiianannnnnnns
RECOMMENDATION:
Award:  Bid No. 2016-48- Purchase of City Vehicles, to Caldwell Country Chevrolet, (ltems 1, Department: Various

5, 10), Grapevine Chrysler & Dodge (Items 4, 7), Tipton Motors, Inc. (ltem 3), Silsbee Ford

(ltems B, 9), and Grande Truck Center (ltem 8), in the Amount of of $333,645.92.

DISCLAIMER:
The above bid recommendation is made by Department Directors and the final award is subject to City Council approval.

Budgeted Amount Available: $402,000
Additional Funds Required: None
Prepared By: Lorena Fuentes, Purchasing Agent
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BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Title: Purchase of City Vehicles

Bid No.: 2016-48
Date Opened: 11/30/15 Page 3 of 6
Silsbee Ford Caldwell Country Chevrolet Grande Truck Center
TEM|  QUANTITY DESCRIPTION OF GOODS OR SERVICES LNIT EXTENDED | UNIT | EXTENDED | UNIT | EXTENDED
PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
OPTIONAL ITEMS FOR ITEM 9
1 1 ;’500 Ib, Tommy Lift-System Maurited on Rear $2878.00]  $2.878.00| $1,55000]  $1,550.00]| $2.425.00]  $2,425.00
oX
2 1 4 Wheel Drive Package & Suspension $2,805.00 $2,805.00 $2,995.00 $2,995.00] $2,475.00 $2,475.00
3 1 Ranch Hand Steel Front Grille $489.00 $489.00 $645.00 $645.00 $458.00 $458.00
4 1 Steel Head Rack with Tubular Rails $635.00 $635.00 $575.00] $575.00 $674.00 $674.00
5 1 Weatherguard Low Profile Tool Box $735.00 $735.00 $785.00 $785.00 $775.00 $775.00
6 1 Head Rack Mounted Whelen Light Bar $1,425.00 $1,425.00] $2,955.00 $2,955.00| $1,675.00 $1,675.00
7 ’ Strobes Mounted on the Factory Installed Front $495.00 $495.00 $775.00 $775.00 $520.00 $520.00
and Rear Truck Lights
Optional ltems Total without ltem #1 $6,584.00 $8,730.00 $6,577.00
Item 9 Total from Page 1 $32,321.90 $37,358.00 $36,429.66
SUBTOTAL : s cioe rvs sa sl fais miita o $38,905.90 $46,088.00 $43,006.66
NET TOTAL....ciiiiiiiennnnnnranss
TERMS . ¢ 2o avis wmw s s vas ow evm &
BELIVERY i cive wwie iiwis s o s siis vatv was

RECOMMENDATION:
Bid No. 2016-48- Purchase of City Vehicles, to Caldwell Country Chevrolet, (Items 1,
5, 10), Grapevine Chrysler & Dodge (ltems 4, 7), Tipton Motors, Inc. (Item 3), Silsbee Ford

Award:

(ltems 6, 9), and Grande Truck Center (ltem 8), in the Amount of of $333,645.92.

DISCLAIMER:
The above bid recommendation is made by Department Directors and the final award is subject to City Council approval.

Department. Various

Budgeted Amount Available: $402,000

Additional Funds Required: None

Prepared By: Lorena Fuentes, Purchasing Agent
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BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Title: Purchase of City Vehicles

Bid No.: 2016-48
Date Opened: 11/30/15 Page 4 of 6
Fiesta Chevrolet Tipton Motors Inc. Grapevine Chrysler & Dodge
ITEM|  QUANTITY DESCRIPTION OF GOODS OR SERVICES UNIT EXTENDED (| UNIT | EXTENDED || UNIT | EXTENDED
PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
OPTIONAL ITEMS FOR ITEM 9
1 1 ;'500 Ib. Tofifi LIt Systend MOUISA o Reer NO BID NoBID| $3000.00] $3.000.00f NOBID NO BID
oX
2 1 4 Wheel Drive Package & Suspension NO BID NO BID|| $2,041.00 $2,041.00 NO BID NO BID
3 1 Ranch Hand Steel Front Grille NO BID NO BID| $521.00 $521.00 NO BID NO BID
4 1 Steel Head Rack with Tubular Rails NO BID NO BID $719.00 $719.00 NO BID NO BID
5 1 Weatherguard Low Profile Tool Box NO BID NO BID $746.00] $746.00 NO BID NO BID
6 1 Head Rack Mounted Whelen Light Bar NO BID NO BID||  $3,819.00 $3,819.00 NO BID NO BID
7 1 Strobes Mounted on the Factory Installed Front NO BID NO BID $547.00 $547.00 NO BID NO BID
and Rear Truck Lights
Optional ltems Total without ltem #1 NO BID $8,393.00 NO BID|
Item 9 Total from Page 2 NO BID $35,556.00 NO BID
SUBTOTAL . csc sassass ams swii aimi ias NO BID $43,949.00 NO BID
NET TOTAL cux comn sons smin mmmswermmns v
TERMS i inc wion vl simn sios)n mwow wias soua
DELIVERY"; s s ssen v s s o avisi o

RECONMENDATION:
Bid No. 2016-48- Purchase of City Vehicles, to Caldwell Country Chevrolet, (Items 1,
5, 10), Grapevine Chrysler & Dodge (ltems 4, 7), Tipton Motors, Inc. (ltem 3), Silsbee Ford

Award:

(ltems 6, 9), and Grande Truck Center (ltem 8), in the Amount of of $333,645.92.

DISCLAIMER:
The above bid recommendation is made by Department Directors and the final award is subject to City Council approval.

Department. Various

Budgeted Amount Available: $402,000
Additional Funds Required: None
Prepared By: Lorena Fuentes, Purchasing Agent
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BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Title: Purchase of City Vehicles

Bid No.: 2016-48
Date Opened: 11/30/15 Page 5 of 6
Silsbee Ford Caldwell Country Chevrolet Grande Truck Center
ITEM QUANTITY DESCRIPTION OF GOODS OR SERVICES UNIT EXTENDED JNIT EXTENDED UNIX EXTENDED
PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
OPTIONAL ITEMS FOR ITEM 10
1 2 4 Wheel Drive Package & Suspension $3,425.00 $6,850.00] $2,955.00 $5,910.00| $2,962.00 $5,924.00
2 2 Ranch Hand Steel Front Grille $369.00 $738.00 $645.00 $1,290.00 $458.00 $916.00
3 2 Steel Head Rack with Tubular Rails NO BID NO BID $575.00 $1,150.00 $725.00 $1,450.00
4 2 \Weatherguard Low Profile Tool Box NO BID NO BID $785.00 $1,570.00 $775.00 $1,550.00
5 2 Head Rack Mounted Whelen Light Bar NO BID NO BID||  $2,955.00 $5,910.00)] $1,675.00 $3,350.00
6 > Strobes Mounted .on the Factory Installed Front NO BID NO BID $775.00 $1.550.00 $520.00 $1.040.00
and Rear Truck Lights
Optional Items Total $7,588.00 $17,380.00 $14,230.00
Item 10 Total from Page 1 $50,486.96 $45,766.00 $49,913.70
SUBTOTAL . swvs = cvn v ana & snven wecns $58,074.96 $63,146.00 $64,143.70
NET TOTAL . ovverieieciennrnnnnnns
TERMS ;< ¢ vsic s vavi i v emss seas & ode
DELIVERY ...t iiiiieeciasinnannns
RECOMMENDATION:
Award:  Bid No. 2016-48- Purchase of City Vehicles, to Caldwell Country Chevrolet, (Items 1,

5, 10), Grapevine Chrysler & Dodge (Items 4, 7), Tipton Motors, Inc. (Item 3), Silsbee Ford

(Items 6, 9), and Grande Truck Center (Item 8), in the Amount of of $333,645.92.

DISCLAIMER:
The above bid recommendation is made by Department Directors and the final award is subject to City Council approval.

Department: Various
Budgeted Amount Available: $402,000
Additional Funds Required: None

Prepared By: Lorena Fuentes, Purchasing Agent
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BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Title: Purchase of City Vehicles

Bid No.: 2016-48
Date Opened: 11/30/15 Page 6 of 6
Fiesta Chevrolet Tipton Motors Inc. Grapevine Chrysler & Dodge
ITEM|  QUANTITY DESCRIPTION OF GOODS OR SERVIGES UNIY EXTEMDED. | UMIT | EXIENDED | UNIT | EXTENDED
PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
OPTIONAL ITEMS FOR ITEM 10
1 2 4 Wheel Drive Package & Suspension NO BID NO BID|| $2,928.00 $6,856.00] $3,034.00 $6,068.00
2 2 Ranch Hand Steel Front Grille NO BID NO BID $521.00 $1,042.00 $795.00 $1,580.00
3 2 Steel Head Rack with Tubular Rails NO BID NO BID $719.00 $1,438.00 $685.00 $1,370.00
4 2 Weatherguard Low Profile Tool Box NO BID NO BID $746.00 $1,492.00 $650.00 $1,300.00
5 2 Head Rack Mounted Whelen Light Bar NO BID NO BID||  $3,819.00 $7,638.00[ $1,685.00 $3,370.00
6 2 Slrohas Nolihied aretiia Factafy Instalied Front NO BID NOBID|  $547.00]  $1.00400| s850.00]  $1,700.00
and Rear Truck Lights
Optional Items Total NO BID $18,560.00 $15,398.00
Item 10 Total from Page 2 NO BID $49,388.00 $56,848.00
SUBTOTAL ......iiiiiiinennnnannns NO BID $67,948.00 $72,246.00
NET TOTAL s siews cwws vomn ¢ awms v ass
TERMS . ... i e iiciineaaans
DELIVERY . . i vonv swan et smen s
RECOMMENDATION:
Award:  Bid No. 2016-48- Purchase of City Vehicles, to Caldwell Country Chevrolet, (ltems 1, Department: Various

5, 10), Grapevine Chrysler & Dodge (Items 4, 7), Tipton Motors, Inc. (Iltem 3), Silsbee Ford

(ltems 6, 9), and Grande Truck Center (Item 8), in the Amount of of $333,645.92.

DISCLAIMER:

The above bid recommendation is made by Department Directors and the final award is subject to City Council approval.

Budgeted Amount Available: $402,000
Additional Funds Required:

None

Prepared By: Lorena Fuentes, Purchasing Agent
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