CITY OF EDINBURG, TEXAS
BID TABULATION SUMMARY

Title:_MHazardous Material Equipment

Bid No.._2008-50

Date Opened:_April 13,2009 @ 3.00 p.m.

Page 1of4
R.C. Darley Fisher Scientific
ltasca, IL
UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
ITEM | QUANTITY DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1 8 Conspace SR-651 Head Sets for Hazmat 3656.00 $3,936.00 No Bid No Bid
Tea - Level A Suits - Edinburg Radio Macom
P5100 or P7100
2 1 Ampco W-280 - 8 Piece Socket Set Non-Sp. $671.00 $671.00 No Bid No Bid
3 1 Rigid 2A-Heavy Duty Pipe Cutter No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 1 Hazmat Decon Fluid Transfer Pump-10 GPM $272.00 $272.00 $228.65 $228 .65
Model AJOS9 Darley
5 3 Decon Shower Elevated Grid Modet AF038 $198.00 $597.00 No Bid No Bid
Darley
6 1 Parrot Beak Head Truck No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
7 1 Decon Pool DP6000 Al Safe 80"x 60"x 12" $485.00 $485.00 $671.25 $671.25
8 4 Dupont Level A Fully Encapsulated Suit $514.00 $2,456.00( $1,576.32 $6,305.28
g 1 Ajax Rescue Kit Model X11-RK %2,264.00 $2.264.00 $2,22068 $2,220.68
10 4 Morning Pride Reed Hoods PBI XTECH $177.00 $708.00 No Bid No Bid
SUBTOTAL. ... ... ... .. ..., $11,399.00 $3,425.86
LESSDISCOUNT .............
NETTOTAL ............ccl..
TERMS. .. ... i
DELIVERY ..........ccoonnnn
RECOMMENDATICN;
Award Big: No. 2009-50, t¢ R.C, Darely, in the amountof $ 18,402 and to Department: FIRE
Fisher Scientific in the amount of $11,540.46 Budgeted Amount Avaitable: $25,642.46
Additional Funds Required: none

Request Authorization to Re-Advertise [ 1
Reguest Authorization to Negotiate Bid/Contract | |

Prepared By:_Shawn Snider, Fire Chief




CITY OF EDINBURG, TEXAS
BID TABULATION SUMMARY

Title:_Hazardous Material Equipment

Bid No.;_2008-50
Date Opened:_April 13,2009 @ 3:00 p.m.

Request Autherization to Re-Advertise [ ]
Request Authorization to Negotiate Bid/Contract [ ]

Page 2 of 4
R.C. Darley Fisher Scientific
liasca, IL
UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
ITEM | QUANTITY DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
11 4 Morning Pride Gloves Sleevemates wiAdded $145.00 $580.00 No Bid No Bid
Kevlar
12 4 American Firewar Jumpsuit YJGN4000TL $251.00 $1,004.00 No Bid No Bid
13 1 Betts Emergency Unloading Fixture No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
14 1 Paratech Leak Seal Kit $1.065.00 $1,065.00 No Bid No Bid
15 2 Vacuum Wet 25 Gallon Pump No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
16 10 Pelican Cases Seal for Air & Water, 30"x24" $292.00 $2,920.00 $288.83 $2,889.30
w/ wheels & retraciable pull handle
17 1 Foam Nozzle 350 gpm w/ 0-6% concentrate $801.00 $801.00 $901.04 $901.04
selectable w/ pickup fube & wand. Fog &
straight stream 2 1/2" female swivet connt.
18 1 MX Foam Jet Nozzle Master Stream $688.00 $688.00 No Bid No Bid
19 1 Low Expansion Foam Master Stream Nozzle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
20 5 Ultra Spillberm Plus $487.00 $2,435.00 341417 $2,070.85
SUBTOTAL.............. ... $9,493.00 $5,861.19
LESSDISCOUNT .............
NETTOTAL ............. ...
TERMS...... ... .o,
DELIVERY ..................
RECOMMENDATION:
Award 8ig: No. 2008-50, to R.C. Darely, in the amount of $ 18,402 and 1o Departrment: FIRE
Fisher Scientific in the amount of $11,540.46 Budgeted Amount Available: $29.942.46
Additionat Funds Required: none

Prepared By._Shawn Snider, Fire Chief




Title: Hazardous Material Equipment

CITY OF EDINBURG, TEXAS

Bid No.:_200%-50

Date Opened._April 13, 2009 @ 3:00 p.m.

BID TABULATION SUMMARY

Page 30f4
R.C. Darley Fisher Scientific
ltasca, il
UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
ITEM | QUANTITY DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

21 2 Ultra Drain Seal 36" x 368" $235.00 $470.00 $227.63 $455.26
22 2 Uitra Drain Seal 54" x 54" $571.00 $1,142.00 $479.40 $958.80
23 2 Ultra Drain Seal 20" Diameter $148.00 $296.00 $104.60 $209.20
24 2 Ultra Drain Seal 42" Diameter $320.00 $640.00 $285.15 $570.30
25 1 Ultra Grate Lifter $486.00 $486.00 $476.80 $476.90
26 3 Ultra Popup Pools $146.00 $438.00 No Bid MNo Bid
27 2 Cooi U-Misting Fan Deluxe Wheeled Cart Poly $578.00 $1,156.00 No Bid No Bid

Tank 20 gallon, 110 volt motor fan, electric

water pump, water mist jets and meunied on

to fan cage
28 12 C2127BGY CaselZipper Saranax Tychem $184.50 $2,214.00 No Bid No Bid
29 1 Case Dry Base Shaker Bottles-Part 450001 No Bid No Bid $93.02 $93.02

10 count
30 1 Case Dry Acid Shaker - Part 440001 - 10 ct. No Bid No Bid $105.18 $105.16

SUBTOTAL. ....covveniinn, $6,852.00 $2,868.64

LESSDISCOUNT .............

NETTOTAL .................

TERMS. ...

DELIVERY ....... .ot vnns

RECOMMENDATION:
Award [ Award Bid: No. 2008-50, to R.C. Darely, in the amount of § 18,402 and to Department: FIRE
Fisher Scientific in the amount of $11,540.45 Budgeted Amount Availabie: $29,942.46
Additicnal Funds Required: none

Reques Reguest Authorization to Re-Advertise [ ]
Regues Reguest Authorization to Negotiate Bid/Contract [ ]

Prepared By:_Shawn Snider, Fire Chief




CITY OF EDINBURG, TEXAS
BID TABULATION SUMMARY

. Title: Hazardous Material Equipment

Bid No.._2009-50
Date Opened:_April 13, 2009 @ 3:00 p.m.

Page 4 of 4
R.C. Darley Fisher Scientific
ltasca, 1L
UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
ITEM } QUANTITY DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

31 1 Case Liquid Acid Gallon - Part 440004 - 4 Ct, No Bid No Bid $116.88 3$116.88
32 1 Case Liquid Base Gel Gal - Partd30004 - 4 Ct. No Bid No Bid $121.62 $121.62
33 1 Megger Meter No Bid No Bid] $1,023.84 $1,023.84
34 18 Level B Suits - Style C-B185T $116.00 $2,088.00 $453.35 $8,160.30
35 2 Portaple Wind Stock Mode! Windtracker 621 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Wheel Stand Plate, Roof Mount Plate

SUBTOTAL. ......... . ..ot $2,088.00 $0,422.64

LESS DISCOUNT .............

NETTOTAL .......... ...t $29,832.00 $27,578.33

TERMS, . ... . et

DELIVERY . ........ovinans

RECOMMENDATION:
Award t Award Bid: No. 2008-50, 1o R.C. Darely, in the amount of § 18402 and to Department: FIRE
Fisher Scientific in the amount of $11,540.46 Budgeted Amount Available: $29,942.46
Additional Funds Required: none

Reques Request Authorization to Re-Advertise [ }
Reques Request Authorization io Negotiate Bid/iContract { ]

Prepared By. _Shawn Snider, Fire Chief




