Title: Swimming Pool Chemicals

Bid No. : Bid # 2010-02

Date Opened: September 28, 2008

CITY OF EDINBURG, TEXAS
BID TABULATION SUMMARY

Page 1 of 2

UNIVAR U.S.A. VALLEY SOLVENTS & | ACETYLENE OXYGEN
DALLAS, TX CHEMICALS COMPANY
HARLINGEN, TX MCALLEN, TX
TEM QTY DESCRIPTION UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1 11,000 gal. | Sodium Hypochlorite (Estimated $1.92 gL $21,120.00 $1.90 $20,900.00 No Bid
Annual Amount)
2 825 gal. Muriaic Acid {Estimated Annual 3174 gb. $1,43550 | $2.1274 gl. $1,755.11 No Bid
Amount)
3 1,000 Ibs, | Cailcium Hypochiorite $1.58 b, $1,580.00 $1.45 b $1,450.00 $1.19 $1.190.00
4 500 Ibs. Cyanuric Acid (Stabilizer) $0.88 Ip. $440.00 $1.03 b, $515.00 No Bid
5 1,000 Ibs. | Sodium Bicarbonate $0.25Ib. $250.00 $.2851b. $285.00 No Bid
6 100 Ihs. Copper Sulfate $1.58 b $158.00 $1.951b $195.00 No Bid
GROSS TOTAL. ..., $24,983.50 $25,100.11 $1,180.06C
LESS DISCOUNT ..o,
NET TOTAL. ..o $24,983.50 $25,100.11 $1,190.00
TERMS....cooiiiee
DELIVERY ..o
RECOMMENDATIONS: Department: _ Parks & Recreation Depariment

Award Low Bid Meeting Specifications: Recommend low bid meeting.

Specifications

Request Authorization {o Re-Advertise { )
Request Authorization to Negotiate Bid/Contract { )

<wpSiwpSTiombidiom, pg

Budgeted Amount: _$33.800

Additional Funds Required: _-0-
Luis Rodriquez

Prepared By:




Tifle: Swimming Pool Chemicals

Bid No. : Bid # 2010-02

Date Opened: September 28, 2009

CITY OF EDINBURG, TEXAS
BID TABULATION SUMMARY

Page 2 of 2

Leslie’s Swimming
Pool Supplies
Phoenix, AZ
ITEM Qry DESCRIPTION UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
PRICE PRICE PRIGE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1 11.000 gal. | Sodium Hypochlorite (Estimated $2.32 $25.520.00
Annual Amount) '
2 825 gat. Muriaic Acid (Estimated Annual $3.87 $3.192.75
Amount) '
3 1,0001bs. | Calcium Hypachiorite $1.55. $1 550.00
. o $1.20 $600.00
4 500 Ibs. Cyanuric Acid {Stabilizer)
. ) $0.44 $440.00
5 1,000 Ibs. | Sodium Bicarhonate
No Bid No Bid
6 100 Ibs. Copper Sulfate
$31,302.75
GROSSTOTAL.ccevvier v,
LESS DISCOUNT ...t
$31,302.75
NET TOTAL o
TERMS...e
DELIVERY....ccooveninnianiinicninnne,
RECOMMENDATIONS: . .
Award Low Bid Meeting Specifications: Recommend low bid meeting gﬁg:g{gg%nOﬁr?{-ksséigggeamn Department
”Snggﬁc_gfﬁl_c_ation_s' . : Additional Funds Required; _-0-
equest Authorization to Re-Advertise ( ) Prepared By: Luis Rodiiquez

Reques{ Authorization fo Negotiate Bid/Centract ( )

chwpSihipStformibidform.pg




