CITY OF EDINBURG, TEXAS
BID TABULATION SUMMARY

Title:_Cold Water Meters

Bid No.._2010-03

Date Opened:_Sentember 28, 2008 @ 3:00 p.m.,

Page 1 0of 2

Badger Meter, in¢ Hersey Meters HD Supply Waterworks
Milwaukee, WI Cleveiand, NC McAlien, TX
UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
ITEM | QUANTITY DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
Group "A"
1 2000 %" Water Meters (Elliptical) (U.S. Gallons) $34.54 $69,080.00 $60.00 $120,000.00 $44.00 $88,000.00
Serial #2008001-20091999
2 300 1" Water Meters (U.S.Gallons) $78.83 $23,649.00 $79.95 $23,885.00 $90.00 $27,000.00
Serial #20092010-2009290
Total Group “A" $92,729.00 $143,985.00 $115,000.00
Group "B"
1 10 2" Compound Meters wi/strainers U.S. Gallons $1,111.83 $11,116.30 No Bid No Bid $806.00 $8,660.00
{Single Register) Serial #2009310-2009320
2 4 3" Compound Meters wistrainers U.S. Gailons $1,408.13 $5,632.52 No Bid No Bid $1,640.00 $6,560.00
(Singie Register) Serial #2009325-2009328
3 4 4" Compound Meters wistrainers U.S. Gallons $2,232.88 $8,931.52 No Bid No Bid $2,100.00 $8,400.00
(Single Register) Serial #2009330-2009332
Total Group "B" $25,680.34 No Bid $23,020.00
GROSSTOTAL. ... ... ..ol *| $118,409.34 ] $143,985.00 ” $138,020.00
LESSDISCOUNT ......... ... *Did not meet specifications, bidded on Dual Register
NETTOTAL . ................
TERMS, ... e
DELIVERY ... ..o vveivi e aen s
RECOMMENDATION:

Award: Bid No. 2010-03 to Badger Meter, Inc. for Group A in the amount of $92,729

and to Hersey Meters for Group C in the amount of $7,600, for a total bid amount

of $100,328.

Request Authorization to Re-Advertise [ §
Request Authorization to Negotiate Bid/Contract [ ]

Department: Utility/Systems Division

Budgeted Amount Available:

$177,058 FY 2008-10

Additicnal Funds Required: None

Prepared By: Patricia Sanchez, Adm. Asst. i




CITY OF EDINBURG, TEXAS
BID TABULATION SUMMARY

Title:_Cold Water Meters

Bid No.:_2010-03

Date Opened:_September 28, 2009 @ 3:00 p.m.

Page 2 of 2

Badger Meter, Inc Hersey Meters HD Supply Waterworks
Milwaukee, W Cleveland, NC McAllen, TX
UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
ITEM § QUANTITY DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
Group "C"
1 10 2" Water Meters, Turbo w/strainers (Single $598.G0 $5,880.00 $400.00 $4,000.00 $389.00 $3,890.00
Register) Serial #£2009335-2000445
Z 10 14" Water Meters, Turbo wistrainers (Single $571.58 $5,715.80 $360.00 $3,600.00 $373.00 $3,730.00
Register) Serial #2009550-2008680
Toltal Group "C" $11,695.80 $7,600.00 $7,620.00
GROSSTOTAL. .............. $11,685.80 $7,600.00 $7,620.00
LESSDISCOUNT ...... ... ...
NETTOTAL ................. $130,105.14 $151,585.00 $145 640.00
TERMS. . ... i
DELIVERY . ... .. ... et See Schedule ARO 40 Days ARO 2 Wks
RECOMMENDATION,

Award: Bid No. 2010-03 to Badger Meter, In¢. for Group A in the amount of $92,729

and to Hersey Meters for Group € in the amount of $7,600, for a total bid amount

of $100,328.

Request Authorization to Re-Advertise [ ]
Request Authorization fo Negotiate Bid/Contract [ ]

Department: Ulility/Systems Division

Budgeted Amount Available:

$177,058 FY 2009-10

Additional Funds Required: None

Prepared By: Patricia Sanchez, Adm. Asst.




