CITY OF EDINBURG, TEXAS
BID TABULATION SUMMARY

Title: Waterworks Fillings and Materials

Bid No.: 2010-04

Pagefof6
{3ate Opened: September 28, 2008 @ 3:00 p.m.
Morrison Supply Co. ACT Pipe & Supply Agusworks Pipe & Supply
Harlingen, TX Pharr, TX Brownsville, TX
UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
ITEME QTY DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
Group A: Brass Fittings
1 200 {[4" x %" Meter Adapters, Expansion Conneclions, Ford EC23 £9.55 $4,910.00 $38.35 $1,870.00 $0.25 $1,850.00
2 100 {|2" Corporation Stop, Male iron Pipe Thread Infet by Packing Joint Quilet $101.80 $10,160.00 $100.54]  $10,054.C0 $100.65 $10,065.00
3 200 {|1" Straight Meter Coupling $7.08 $1.416.00 $7.07 51,414.00 $5.20 $1,040.00
4 50 {[3” Flange and Bolt kits $4.50 $225.00 $154.258 $7,712.50 $14.70 $735.00
5 40 |l1%" Pack Joint x ron Pipe by meler flange Angle Stop $81.25 $3,250.00 $80.41 $3.216.40 $80.45 $3,218.00
& 50 |i2” Flange and Boll kils $4.00 $200.00 $37.08 §1.854.50 $44.85 $2,242.50
7 100 |1%4" Female lron Pipe Thread Inlet by meter Swivel Nut Outlet $14.85 $1,485.00 $14.52 $1,452.00 $13.80 $1,380.00
3 50 111%" Flange and Bolt Kits $4.00 $200.00 $33.20 $1,660.00 $40.90 $2.045.00
9 200 11" Pack Joint Couplings Copper or Plastic Tubing £9.98 $1,596.00 $9.74 $1,948.00 $8.50 $1,800.00
10 300 11" x % Pack Joint X Pack Joinl Couplings $10.13 $3,038.60 $9.89 $2,967 .00 $5.60 $2,880.00
Total Group A £23,881.00 $34,148.40 $27,355,50
Group B: Meter Boxes
1 40 |14 x 26" C.1 Meler Boxes: 2* Porthole. Hasp Handie on Lid No Bid No Bid $66.60 $2,664.00 $71.40 $2,856.00
2 | 1,000 [loval Plastic Meter Boxes with Metal Lids Mo Bid No Bid $29.57] $29570.00]  $28.50]  $28,600.00
Total Group B No Bid $32,234.00 $31,456.00
Group C: Service Saddies

1 20 |4 x 1" 1P, Tap Service Saddie, single strap wilh nuts, range 4.80" fo 5.40" O.D. for class C800, PVC, AC. Pipe $29.84 $5096.80C $28.92 $576.40 $30.45 $609.00
2 20 il4"x 2" LP. Tap Service Saddie. Double Strap with Nuts, Range 5.10" to 5.40" O.D. for Class C900. PVC Pipe $68.00 $1,360.00 $66.60 $1,332.00 $70.16 $1,403.20
3 10 i[8" x 1" 1P, Tap Service Saddle for ciass 800 PVC Pipe, single strap winuls 0.D. Range from 9.05" to 9.62" $39.23 $392.30 $38.41 $384.10] $47.24 $472.40
4 10 10" x 2" LP. Double Strap, Service Saddle, 0.D. Range 11.10" to 12.12", €800 $114.12 $1,141.20 $111.76 $1,117.60 $117.71 $1,177.10
5 10 10" x 1" LP. Double Strap, Service Saddle, 0.0, Range 11.10" 10 12.12", G800 $96.74 $967.40 $94.74 $947.40 $98.80 $998.00
6 5 12" x 2" 1P, Tap Service Saddle, double strap O.0. Range13.20" fo 14.38" $130.00 $650.00  $127.32 $636.80]  $136.20 $681.00
7 10 12" x %" Single Strap winuts Q.0 Range 13.20" to 14,38" $64.00 %640.00 $62.51 $625.10 $65.84 £658.40
8 & 116" x 2" 1.P. Double Strap brass saddle Q.0. Range 17.40" to 17.60" $325.10 $1,625.50 $318.38 $1,591.90 $341,35 $1,706.75
9 5 |HM8" x 1" LP. Double Strap brass saddle 0.D. Range 17.40" te 18.40" $325.10 $1.,625.50 $318.38 $1,591.90 $341.35 $1,706.75
Total Group G $8,898.70] $8,805.00 $9,412.60




CITY OF EDINBURG, TEXAS
BID TABULATION SUMMARY

Title: Walerworks Fillings and Materials

Bid No.: 2010-04

Page 2 of 6
Date Cpened: September 28, 2009 @ 3:00 p.m.
Morrison Suppiy Co. ACT Pipe & Supply Aguaworks Pipe & Supply
Harlingen, TX Phair, TX Brownsville, TX
UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
ITEM RUANTIT DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
Group D: Full Gircle Clamps
1 8§ |i2"x 7%" full circle clamp, single band, range 2.35" to 2.63" O.D. $27.54 $220.32 $27.25 $218.00 $42.86 $342.88
2 6 |2 x 715" full circle clamp, single band. range 2.70" lo 3.00" O.D. $29.27 $175.62 $28.96 $173.76 $45.62 $273.72
3 8 ||2" % 12" full circle clamp, single band, range 2.79" to 3.00" 0.0. $45.69 $274.14 $45.21 $271.26 $79.31 $475.86
4 10 ||[3" x 7%" full circle clamp, single band, range 3.46" 10 3,70" C.D. $28.47 $284.70 $28.17 $281.70 $49.85 $498.50
5 20 ||4" x 7V full circle clamp, single band, range 4.457 10 4.73" 0O.D. $30.33 $606.60 $30.01 $600.20 $52.95 $1,059.20
& 10 |8 % 7% full circle clamp, single band, range 4.74" 10 5.14" 0.0, £32.99 $329.90 $32.65 $326.50 $52.96 $528.60
7 5 8" x 12" full circle clamp, single band, range 4.74" to $.14" 0.D. 48,52 $242.60 $48.01 $240.05 $60.45 $452.25
3 10 |4 x 7% full circle clamp, single band, range 4.95" (o 5.25" 0.0 $35.67 $356.70 $35,28 $352.90 $52.96 $529.80)
g | 10 |l¢"x7% full circle clamp. single band, range 5.22" to 562" O.0. $35.67 535670  $35.29 $352.90  $52.95 $529.60
10 10 |6 x 7%" fuil circle clamp, single band, range 8.56" to 6.96" Q.D. $34 .65 $346.50 $34.28 $342.80 $60.65 $606.50
11 5 8" x 12" {ull circle clamp, singie band, range 6.56" 10 6.86" O.0. §53.95 $269.75 $53.32 $266.95 $589.08 $495.30
12 10 HE" x 7" full circle clamp, single band, range 6.84” to 7.24" O.D. $40.78 $407.80 $40.36 $403.60 $60.65 $606.50
13 10 Hﬁ x 7" full circle clamp, single band, rangs 7.05" {0 7.45” 0.0, $40.78 $407.80 $40.36 $403.60 $60.65 $608.50
14 5 HB" % 12" width fult circle clamp, single band, range 7.05" (o 7.45" 0.0, $60.11 $300.55 $59.48 $267.40 $99.08 $485.30
15 5 |15" x 12" width circle clamp, single band, range 8.98" to 9.39" 0.D. $51.80 $309.00 $59.87 3209.35l  $113.18 $565.90
16 10 ”6 % TYe" width fuil circle clamp. singie band, range 8.997 to 9.39" 0.D. $40.50 $405.00 $39.87 $398.70 $69.41 $694 .10
17 10 ”S“ x 7% full circle clamp. single band, range 2.27" 16 8.67" O.D. $40.00 $400.00 $39.50 $395.00 $69.41 §694.10
18 5 18" 12" width full circle clamp, single band, range 9.27" to 9.67" 0.0. $61.92 $309.60] $61.27 $306.35 $113.18 $565.90
19 5 {l8" 1 7w width full circle clamp, single band, range 8.56" t0 8.98" 0.0, $40.00 $200.00 No Bid $0.00 $69.41 $347.05
2 5 10" x 12" full circle clamp, single band, range 11.34" 10 11.74” 0.0, $77.65 $388.25 $76.76 $383.80 $138.21 $696.05:
24 6 I[12°x 12" full cirgle clamp, single band, range 13.10" {0 13.50" 0.D. $89.83 $538.98 $88.89 $533.24 $159.08 $954.30
22 6 il12"x 12" full circle ctamp, single band, range 13.60" lo 14.40" O.D. $94 .75 $568.50) $93.64 $561.84 $158.05 $954,30
23 5 |6 fulf circle clamp, single band, range 7.28" 10 7.62" 0.0, $40.78 $203.80 $40.36 $201.80 $99.06 $495.30
24 | 20 |l4" Mechanicai Joint Restraints $18.29 $365.80 $8.70 $174.00  $20.05 $401.00
25 | 20 |4" Mega Lugs wiaccessories $26.00 $520.00 $26.08 $521.60 $26.60 $532.00
25 § 20 |l8" Mechanical joints $13.06 $261.20 31277 $255.40 $12.85 $257.00}
27 30 6" Mega Lugs w/accessoties $31.66 $949.80 33407 $1,022.10 $36.00 $1,080.00
28 20 |[8" Mechanicsl Joinls $13.89 $277.80 $13.59 $271.80 $13.65 $273.00
29 20 {|10" Mechanical Joints $19.45 $389.00 $19.02 $380.40 $19.15 $383.00
30 30 {10 Mega l.ugs wiaccessonies $73.93 $2,217.90 $70.00 $2,100.00 $83.25 $2,497 .50
31 20 J12" Mechanical Joints $21.39 3/152'7.80i $20.92 $418.40 $21.05 $421.00




CITY OF EDINBURG, TEXAS
BID TABULATION SUMMARY

Title: Walerworks Fittings and Materials
Big No.: 2010-04
Date Opened: September 28, 2009 @ 3:00 p.an.

Page 30f6

Marrison Supply Co.

ACT Pipe & Supply

Aguaworks Pipe & Supply

Harlingen, TX Pharr, TX Brownsville, TX
URIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
ITEM RUANTIT] DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
Group D Full Circte Clamps
32 20 |{12" Mega Lugs wiaccessories $78.21 $1.564.20 $76.10 $1.582 .00 $87.20 $1,744.00
33 10 I[16" Mega Lugs waccessories $164.39 $1,643.90 $148.80 $1.488.00 $182.60 $1,826.00
34 20 {i6” Quantum Barrels $95.69 $1,913.80 $98.81 $1,976.20 $101.25 $2,025.00
35 10 112" Quantum Barrels $179.46 $1,794.60 $185.31 $1,853.10 $179.20 $1,792.00
36 20 Ji8" Quantum Barrels $118.85 $2,377.00 $122.70 $2,454.00 $120.50 $2,410.00
37 10 4" Quanium Barrels $72.00 $720.00 $74.32 $743.20 $71.80 $718.00
38 10 10" Quanlum Barrels $152.08 $1,520.80 $157.04 $1,570.40 $148.50 $1,485.00
Total Group D $24,846.51 $24,422.40 $31,312.81
Group E: Copper Tubing
2,000 fi* Copper Tubing, Type "K" (100 Foot Rolls) soft $5.75]  $11,500.00 $3.13 $6,260.00 $3.20 $6,400.00
Total Group E $11,500.00 $6,260.00 $3.20 $6.,400.00
GROSSTOTAL. .............. $69,226.21 3105,869.80 $105,936.91
LESSDISCOUNT .............
NETTOTAL.................
TERMS. .. . e i
DELIVERY ... ..ivvien i 2 Wks ARQ 5-10 Days As Negded
RECOMMENDATION:
Award: Bid No. 2010-04 to Morrison Suppiy for Group A in the amouni of $23,881; fo Aguaworks Pipe & Supply for Group 8 Department: Utility/Systems

in the amount of $31.456; to ACT Pipe & Supply for Groups C, D and E in the amount of $39,487 .40, for a tolal bid

of $94.824 40.

Request Autharizalion to Re-Adverlise [}
Reguest Authorization to Negotiate BidiConftract [ ]

Budgeted Amount:
Additiona! Funds Required:

Prepared By:

$117.000 for FY 2008-2010

None

PPatricia Sanchez, Adm. Asst. |l




CITY OF EDINBURG, TEXAS
BID TABULATION SUMMARY

Tille: Watenworks Fitlings and Materials

Bid No.: 2010-G4

Page 4 of 6
Date Opened: Septleniber 28, 2008 @ 2:00 p.m.
HD Supply Waterworks [ Ferguson Waterworks
McAllen, TX Mission, TX
UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
ITEM RUANTIT DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
Grogp A: Brass Fittings
1 200 (4" x %" Meter Adapters, Expansion Connactions, Ford EC23 $9.97 $1,994.00 $14.48 $2,886.00
2 100 [|2" Corporation Slop, Male ren Pipe Thread Intet by Packing Joint Qutlet $107.18f  $10,718.00 $104.00f  $10,400.00
3 200 {H" Straight Meter Coupling §7.45 $1,480.00 $7.28 $1,456.00
4 80 |13" Flange and Bolt kits $3.88 $184.00 $101.04 $5,052.00
5 40 [ Pack Joint x Iron Pipe by meter flange Angle Stop $95.48 $3,619.20 $104.40 $4,176.00
6§ 50 [i2" Flange and Boll kiis $30.78 $1,539.50 $41.48 $2.073.00
7 100 §34" Femaie lrom £2ipe Thread inlel by meter Swivel Nut Qutiet $22.74 $2,274.00 $16.06 $1,606.00
8 50 {11'%4" Flange and Bolt Kits $24.34 $1,217.00 $37.11 $1,855.50
g 200 " Pack Joint Couplings Copper or Plastic Tubing $10.38 $2,076.00 $3.55 $1,910.00
10 300 1" x %" Pack Jeint X Pack Joint Couplings $10.54 $3,162.00 $9.66 $2,898.00
Total Group A $28,483.70 $34,322.50
Group 8: Meter Boxes
b 40 14" x 28" C.1. Meter Boxes: 2" Porthole. Hasp Handie on Lid $82.35 $3,264 .00 $80.00 $3.200.00
2 1,000 {Oval Plastic Meter Boxes with Metal Lids $28.24] $28,240.00 $29.00] $29,000.00
Total Group B $31,534.00 $32,200.00
Group C: Service Saddles
i 20 |Jj¢" x 1" 1L.P. Tap Service Saddle, single strap with nuts, range 4.80" 10 5.40" 0.0 for clags C900, PVC, A.C. Pipe $22.15 $443.00 $31.00 $620.00
2z 20 (" x 2" 1P Tap Service Saddie. Double Strap with Nuts, Range 5.10" 1o 3.40* C.D. for Class C200 PVC Pipe $55.3G8 $1,107.80 $58.60 $1,172.00
3 10 |I8" x 1" LP. Tap Service Saddie for class 800 PVC Pipe, single strap winuts 0.0, Range from $.05" to §.62" $42.34 $423.40 $48.00 $480.00
4 10 {[10" x 2" L.P. Double Strap, Service Saddle, 0.0, Range 11.10" to 12.12", G800 $123.18 $1,231.80 $112.00 $1,190.00
5 10 |116" x 1" LP. Deuble Strap, Service Saddie. O.D. Range 11.10% 10 12,12", C900 $123.35 $1,233.50 $100.00 $1,000.00
5 5 |12"x 2" P, Tap Service Saddle, doubie strap 0.0. Range13.20" to 14.38" $140.34 $701.70 $136.00 $680.0C
7 10 12" x %" Single Strap w/nuts 0.D. Range 13.20" 1o 14.38" $58.91 $689.10 $67.00 $670.00
8 5 |[18" x 2" 1.P. Double Strap brass saddie 0.D. Range 17.40" to 17.80" $350.95 $1,754.75 $353.00 $1,765.00
9 §  |it8" x 1" I.P. Double Slrap brass saddie 0.0. Range 17.40" to 18.40" $350.85 $1,754.75 $353.00 $1,765.00
Total Group C $8,338.90 $9,342.00




CITY OF EDINBURG, TEXAS
BID TABULATION SUMMARY

Title: Walenvorks Fitlings and Materials

Bid No.» 2010-04

Page § of 6
Date Opened: September 28,2000 @ 3:00 p.m.
HD Supply Waterworks || Ferguson Waterworks
MeAllen, TX Mission, TX
UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
ITEN DUANTIT] DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
Group 1: Full Gircle Clamps

1 8 |j2"x 7" full circle clamp, single band, range 2,35" t¢ 263" O.0, $33.81 $270.48 $30.98 $247.92
2 6 12" x 7" full circle clamp, single band, range 2,70" te 3.06" O.0. $36.72 $220.32 $33.66 $201.96
3 8 12" x 12" full circle clamp. single band, range 2.70" to 3.00" 0.0. $63.22 $379.32 558.56 $351.38
4 10 13" x 739" full circle clamp, single band, range 3.46" to 3.70" 0.D. $40.17 $401.70 $36.83 $368.30
5 20 Jd"x 7" fuil circle clamp, single band, range 4,45" 1o 4 73" Q.D. $44.11 $882.20 340,44 $808.80
6 10 4" x 7% fult gircle clamp, single band, range 4.74" 1o 5.14* 0.0, $45.67 $456.70) $42.31 $423.10
7 5 4" x 12" full circle clamp, single band, range 4,74" to 5,14" G.D, $74.84 $374.20 $568.61 $343.05
8 10 f[4" % 7% Uil circle clamp, singie band, range 4.85"t0 5.35" 0.D. $46.15 $461.50 $42.75 $d427 50
g 10 |4" x 73" full Gircle clamp, single band, range 5.22" 10 562" 0.0. $46.74 $467.40 $42.85 $428.50
10 10 [i6" x 744" fulf circle clamyp, single band, range 6.56" Lo 6.96" O.0. $52.74 $527.40 $48.35 $483.50
11 5 "8 x 12" full chicle clamp, single band, range 6.56" 1o 5.96" 0.0, $84.97 $424.85 $78.71 $393 85
i2 10 "5 x 744" fulf circle clamp, single band, range 6.84" 10 7.24" O 0. $53.90 $538.00 $49.41 $494.10
13 | o J5"x 7% ful circie clamp, single band, range 7.05" to 7.45" 0.0, $54.70 $547.00 $50.68 $506.80
14 5 ll5" x 12" width full circle clamp. single band, range 7.05" to 7.45" 0.D. $87.61 $428.05 $81.16 $405.80
15 5 ”B x 12" width ciccle clamp, single band, range 8.89" 10 9.38° 0.0, $103.24 $516.20 $94.64 $473.20
18 10 6" x 7" width full circle clamp, single band, range 8.99" 10 9.39" 0.D. $64.48 $644.80 $58.72 $5097.30
17 10 H8"x 794" full circle clamp, single band, range 9.27" {0 9.67" Q.D. $65.90 $659.00 $61.05 $6810.50
18 5 18" x 12" width full circle clamp, single band, range 9.277 o 8.67" 0.D. $105.51 $527.55 $87.74 $488.70
19 5 |I3"x 74" width fuit circle clamp, single band, range £.56" 10 6.96" 0.D. $84.08 $420.40 $77.89 $389.45
20 5 110" x 127 full circte clamp, single band, range 11.34" 10 11.74" Q.0 $126.91 $634.55 $117.56 $587.80
21 & i1z x 12" ful circle clamp, single band, range 13.10" to 13.50" Q.0 $142.45 $854.70 $131.86 $781.76
22 G i[12"x 12" full circle clamp, single band, range 13.60" fo 14.40" O.D. $108.25 $1,189.50 $183.65 $1,101.90
23 5 {I8" full circle clamp, single band, range 7.26" {o 7.62" 0.0, $56.11 $280.55 $51.98 $259.90H
24 | 20 14" Mechanical Joint Resiraints $9.41 $188.20 $23.62 $472.40;
25 20 {4 Mega Lugs wlaccessories $30.14 $602.80 $28.70 $584.00
26 20 |p" Mechanical Jeints $12.35 $247.00 $25.92 $518.40
27 30 38" Mega Lugs w/accessories $37.98 $1,138.70 $42.10 $1,263.00
28 20 8" Mechanical Joints $14.12 $282.40 $38.34 $766.80
29 20 40" Mechanical Joints $18.82 $376.40 368.45 $1,369.00
30 30 |it0" Mega Lugs w/acoessores $88.28 $2,669.40 %92.57 $2.777.10
31 20 |112" Mechanical Joinls $21.18 $423.60H 364 .46 $1,289.20




CITY OF EDINBURG, TEXAS
BID TABULATION SUMMARY

Title: Waterwarks Fitlings and Malerials
Bid No.: 2010-04

Page 6 of 6
Date Cpened: September 28, 2008 @ 3.00 p.m,
HD Supply Waterworks || Ferguson Waterworks
McAllen, TX Mission, TX
UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
ITEM PUANTIT] DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
Group D: Fuli Circle Clamps
32 20 {12" Mega Lugs w/accessories $93.38 $1,867.80 $97 .09 $1,941.80
33 10 {[168" Mega Lugs wiaccessories $185.30 $1,853.00 $200.75 $2,007.50
34 20 {[6" Quantum Barrels $120.48 $2,409.80 $111.62 $2,232.40
35 10 {12 Quantum Barrels $208.05 $2,090.50 $192.65 $1,936.50;
36 20 8" Quantum Barrels $140.59 $2,811.80 $1258.55 $2,591.00
37 10 |la” Quantum Barrels $85.45 $854.50 $77.93 $779.30]
38 10 |[10” Guantum Barrels $176.73 §1,767.30 $160.33 $1.603.30
Total Group D $31,701.57 $33,326.45
Group E: Copper Tubing
2.000 i Copper Tubing, Type "K" (100 Foot Rolls) soff $3.98 $7,850.00 $3.31 $6,620.80
Total Group E $7.,960.00! $6,620.60
GROSSTOTAL. .. ............ $109,019.17 $115,811.55
LESS DISCOUNT . ......ovvun
NETTOTAL . ... ... ... ...y
TERMS. ... ..o
DELIVERY . v v vv e e e et Stock 10 Days 5.6 Days

RECOMMENDATION:

Award: 8id No. 2010-04 fo Morrison Supply for Group A in the amouni of $23,681; to Aguaworks Pipe & Supply for Group B

in the amount of $31,456; fo ACT Pipe & Supply for Groups C, D and E in the amount of $39.487.40, for 2 total bid

of $94,824.40,

Reguest Authorization to Re-Advertise [ |
Request Authorization to Negotiale Bid/Contracl { ]

Department:

Budgeted Amount:
Additional Funds Required:

Prepared By:

Utility/Systems

$117.000 for FY 2009-2010

Nong

Patricia Sanchez, Adm, Asst. |




