CITY OF EDINBURG, TEXAS
BID TABULATION SUMMARY

Title:_Water Plant Chemicals
Bid No.:_2010-0G5
Date Opened:_September 28, 2008 @ 3:00 p.m.
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General Chemical
Acetylene Oxygen Co. Ferformance Products, LLC Brenntag Southwaest, [ac.
Harlingen, TX Parsippany, NJ McAllen, TX
UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
ITEM QUANTITY DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1 175 con. INSF Chlorine Gas (1 Ton Cantainers) $720.00 $126,000.00 No Big No Bid No Bid No Bid
2 18 cyls. |[NSF Chlorine Gas (150 Ib Cylinders) $115.00 $2,070.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 18 cyls. [INitrogen, Compressed (150 Ib Cytinders) 517555 $3,159.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 15,000 gals. ||Liquid Ammenia Suifate No Bid No Bid $0.7038 $10,557.00 No Bid Na Bid
{4,500 gaflons Minimum Shiprment)
5 5,000 Ibs. liCopper Suifate (Large Crystal) month suppy No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.450 $7,250.00
Delivery Time: 24-72 Hrs 2-5 Days ARO 48 Hrs
Emergency Response Time: 2-4 Hours As required 4 Hrs
GROSSTOTAL. .......ivee... $131,229.90 $10,557.00 $7,250.00
LESS DISCOUNT..... e
NETTOTAL................. $131,229.90 $10,557.00 $7,250.00
TERMS. .. i
DELIVERY ... .. ... v,

RECOMMENDATION:  Award Item No. 1, 2, & 3 to Acetylene Oxygen Cormpany, for

a total amount of $131,229.90; kem No. 4 to General Chemical Performance Products,

LLC, in the armount of $10,567.00; and item No. 5 to Brenntag Southwest, Inc., in the

amount of $7,250.00, for a total bid amount of $148,036.90,

Request Authorization to Re-Advertise { ]
Request Authorization to Negotiate Bid/Contract | ]

Department: Water PlantiWWTP

Budgeted Amount: $174,530

Additional Funds Required:

None

Prepared By: Patricia Sanchez, Adm. Asst. il




CITY OF EDINBURG, TEXAS
BID TABULATION SUMMARY

a total amount of $131,229.90; ltem No. 4 to General Chemical Performancs Products,

LLG, in the amount of $10,557.00; and Item No. 5 to Brenntag Southwest, inc., in the

amount of $7,250.00, for a total bid amount of $14€,036.90.

Request Authorization fo Re-Advertise [ ]
Request Authorization to Negotiate Bid/Contract[ |
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Title:_Water Plant Chemicals
Bid No.._2010-05
Date Opened:_September 28, 2009 @ 3:00 p.m.
Chemrite,inc, Univar USA, Inc. Amchem, Inc.
Buford, GA Dallas, TX Los Fresnos, TX
UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
ITEM QUANTITY DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1 175 con. INSF Chlorine Gas (1 Ton Containers) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2 18 cyls. INSF Chlorine Gas {150 Ib Cylinders) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ne Bid No Bid
3 18 cyls. |[Nitrogen, Compressed (150 Ib Cylinders) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 18,000 gals. iLiquid Ammenia Suifate No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
{4,500 gations Minimum Shipment}
5 5,000 Ibs. [ Copper Sulfate (Large Crystal) month supply $1.540 $7,700.00 $1.580 $7,900.00 $1.680 $8,400.00
pe:776972
Delivery Time: 3-7 Days ARQ || Large NSF 2-5 Days Within 72 Hrs
Emergency Response Time: 24 Hrs Phone 800-765-7300 immediately
GROSSTOTAL............... $7.700.00 $7,900.00 $8,400.00
LESS DISCOUNT . ............
NETTOTAL ........oo.oo... 37,700.00 $7,800.00 $8,400.00
TERMS. ... ...
DELIVERY .......cinvvennn..
RECOMMENDATION:  Award ltem No. 1,2, & 3to Acetylene Oxygen Company, for Pepartment. Water Plant/WWTP

Budgeted Amount; $174,530

Additional Funds Required:

None

Prepared By: Patricia Sanchez, Adm. Asst. [




CITY OF EDINBURG, TEXAS
BID TABULATION SUMMARY

Title:_Water Plant Chemicals

Bid No.._2010-05

Date Opened:_September 28, 2000 @ 3:00 p.m.
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Altivia Corporation CPC Industries, inc.
Houston, TX Corpus Christi, TX
UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
ITEM QUANTITY DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1 175 con. INSF Chlorine Gas (1 Ton Containers) No Bid No Bid $800.00 $140,000.00
2 18 cyls. INSF Chlorine Gas (150 Ib Cylinders) No Bid No Bid 3$120.00 $2,160.00
3 18 cyls. |INitrogen, Compressed (150 Ib Cyiinders) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 15,000 gals. |[Liquic Ammenia Sulfate $0.069 $14,535.00 No Bid No Bid
(4,500 gaitons Minimum Shipment)
5 5,000 fbs. |ICopper Sulfate {Large Crystal) month supply No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Delivery Time: 2-4 Days 3-5 Days
Emergency Response Time: 24 Hours 10 Hrs
GROSSTOTAL............... $14,535.00 $142,180.00
LESS DISCOUNT ......... i
NETTOTAL ..........cc.oun. $14,535.00 $142,160.00
TERMS. .ot
DELIVERY . ... it enes
RECOMMENDATION:  Award item No. 1, 2, & 3 to Acetylene Oxygen Company, for Department: Water Plant/WWTP

a total amount of $131,229.90; item No. 4 to General Chemical Performance Products,

LLC, in the amount of $10,857.00; and #tem No. 5 to Brenntag Southwest, Inc., in the

amount of $7.250.00, for a total bid amount of $149,036.90.

Request Authorization to Re-Advertise [ ]
Reguest Authorization to Negotiate Bid/Contract[ |

Budgeted Amount: $174,530

Additional Funds Required:  None

Prepared By. Patricia Sanchez, Adm. Asst. il




