CITY OF EDINBURG, TEXAS
BID TABULATION SUMMARY

Titte:_Annual Polymer Suppiy
Bid No.:_2010-07
Date Opened:_September 28, 2008 @ 2.00 p.m.
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Ashland Hercules Water Atlantic Coast
Technologies Fort Bend Services, Inc. Polymers Ine.
Dublin, OH Stafford, TX Austin, TX
UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
ITEM | QUANTITY DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1 Annual Polymer Supply (Estimate Amount)
12 (1) Tote (300 gallons) $2,737.00 $32,844.00| $2.642.70 $31,712.40
$2.875.00 $34,500.00
48 {1} Drum (55 gallons) $553.85 $26,584.80) $535.50 $25,704.00i $660.675 $31,712,40
$562.50 $27,000.00
Frice #1 Factory Direct
Price #2 Stafford, TX
TOTAL AMOUNT. ............. $26,584.80
LESS DISCOUNT. .............
TOTALAMOUNT. ............. $26,584.80
TERMS. ... o Price #1 14-21 Days
DELIVERY .................. 4-5 Business Day||Price #2 3-5 days
RECOMMENDATION:
Award: Bid No. 2010-07, Annual Polymer Supply o Fort Bend Services, Inc., the Depariment; Utility/Wastewater Treatment Plant
lowest bidder meeting specifications, in the amount of $25,704 for 48 Drums. Budgeled Amount Available:  $40,000 for FY 2008-2010

Additional Funds Reguired:
Prepared By: Patricia Sanchez, Adm. Asst. ||

Request Authorization to Re-Advertise [ ]
Request Authorization to Negotiate Bid/Contract [ ]




CITY OF EDINBURG, TEXAS
BID TABULATION SUMMARY

Title:_Annual Polymer Sunply
Bid No.: 2018-07
Date Opened._September 28, 2009 & 3:.00 n.m.

Page 20of 3
Brenntag Southwest, Inc. Acetylene Oxygen Company Polydyne, Inc
McAllen, TX McAllen, TX Riceboro, GA
UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
ITEM | QUANTITY DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1 Annual Polymer Supply {Estimate Amount)
12 (1) Tote {300 gallons) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
48 {1} Drum (55 galions) $679.50 $32,616.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
TOTAL AMOUNT. ............. $32,616.00 No Bid No Bid
LESSDISCOUNT..............
TOTALAMOUNT. ............. $32,616.00
TERMS. ... . i
DELIVERY ............. o0t 48 Hours
RECOMMENDATION:
Award: Bid No. 2010-07, Annual Polymer Supply to Fort Bend Services, Inc., the Department: Utily/Wastewater Treatment Plant
lowest bidder meeling specifications, in the amount of $25,704 for 48 Drums. Budgeted Amount Available;  $40,000 for FY 2008-2010

Additional Funds Required:

Prepared By: Patricia Sanchez, Adm. Asst. |l

Reguest Authorization to Re-Advertise |
Request Authorization to Negotiate Bid/Contract [ ]



CITY OF EDINBURG, TEXAS
BID TABULATION SUMMARY

Title: Annual Polymer Supply

Bid No.:_2010-07
Date Opened:_September 28, 2009 @ 3:00 p.m.

Award: Bid No. 2010-07, Annual Polymer Supply to Forl Bend Services, inc,, the
towest bidder meeling specifications, in the amouni of $25,704 for 48 Drums.

Request Authorization to Re-Advertise [ ]
Request Authorization to Negotiate Bid/Contract [ ]
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Kemira Water
Lawrence, KS
UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
[TEM | QUANTITY DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1 Annual Polymer Supply (Estimate Amount)
12 (1) Tote (300 galions) No Bid No Bid
48 (1) Drum (55 gallons) No Bid No Bid
TOTAL AMOUNT. ............. No Bid
LESSDISCOUNT..............
TOTAL AMOUNT.............. No Bid
TERMS. ....... .o oo
PDELIVERY ......... ... o0t
RECOMMENDATION:

Department: Utility/Wastewater Treatment Plant
Budgeted Amount Available:
Additional Funds Required:

Prepared By: Patricia Sanchez, Adm. Asst. I}

$40,000 for FY 2009-2010




