BID TABULATION SUMMARY

Title:  FUEL, MOTOR OIL AND LUBRICANTS Page 1 of 2
Bid No.- 2010-08
Date Opened:  9/28/2009
MANSFIELD OIL NAPA HOLLON OIL
COMPANY AUTO PARTS COMPANY
TEM QUANTITY DESCRIPTION OF GOODS OR SERVICES UNIT | EXTENDED | UNIT | EXTENDED | UNIT | EXTENDED
PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1| 250,000 GALLONS _ UNLEADED FUEL 52.0619] $565475.00|  NO BID NOBID|  NOBID NO BID
2 | 100,000 GALLONS DIESEL ULTRA LOW SULFUR GLEAR $2.2911] $229,110.00|  NOBID NOBID| NOBID NO BID
3 | 270,000 GALLONS DIESEL ULTRA LOW SULFUR DYED $2.2884] $617.868000 NOBID NOBID|  NOBID NO BID
4 50 DRUMS HYDRAULIC FLUID 55 GALLON DRUMS NO BID NnOBID||  s39471| s1973550] $287.95] $14.397.50
5 50 DRUMS 15-W 40 MOTOR OIL IN 55 GALLON DRUMS NO BID NOBID|  s4sg00|  $22.950.00]  $346.50]  $17.325.00
6 4 DRUMS DELO 400 15W-40 MOTOR OIL NO BID NOBIDJ  sec9.00]  $2.796.00]  $s6378]  $2.255.12
7 | 4000 GALLONS PREMIUM 40W MOTOR OIL NO BID noBID| *s4sa0s] s3s.402.08 $5.18]  $20,720.00
8 55 DRUMS SAE 30W NO BID NOBID|  s4s156] so648580]  sat656] $22.91080
9 6 DRUMS SAE 50W NO BID NOBID|  NOBID NOBID|  $416.56|  $2.499.36
10 | 1,000 GALLONS DEXRON/MERCON-ATE (G) NO BID NOBID| *$439.00]  $7.902.00 sa79|  $4.790.00
11 2 DRUMS 70-90W SYNTHETIC OIL NO BID NOBID| $122375] $2.44750]  s9ve.00]  $1.958.00
12 | 14,000 GALLONS TRACTOR HYDRAULIC FLUID NO BID NO BID|| ** $578.98] $147.639.90 $3.52]  $49,280.00
13 3 DRUMS ANTIFREEZE (50/50) NG BID NOBID|  $a7s.27]  $112581]  $247.50 $742.50
ANTIFREEZE (LONG LIFE PREMIUM WITH
14 3 DRUMS ADDITIVE TO PREVENT ELECTROLYSIS) NO BID NOBIDf  $ses.00]  s1707.00]  $363000  $1.089.00
SUBTOTAL. ... ..............
NETTOTAL ..o $1,412,453.00 $268,191 59 $137,967.28
TERMS. .o oo
DELIVERY . .. .\ovvveen .

RECOMMENDATION: Award Bid to Oil Patch Fuet & Supply, inc. and Hollon Oil Company

Note: Submitled Bid On:  * 73-55 gal, ** 18-55 gal, and *** 255-55 gal

Request Authorization to Re-Advertise [ ]
Reguest Authorization to Negotiate Bid/Contract [ ]

Department: Public Works / Streets
Budgeted Amount Available: Amount from severa! funds
Additionat Funds Required:
Prepared By Velma Gomez, Senior Secretary 1

None




BID TABULATION SUMMARY

Title: FUEL, MOTOR OIL AND LUBRICANTS Page 2 of 2
Bid No.: 2010-08
Date Opened:  9/28/2008
GOLD STAR PETROLEUM OIL PATCH FUEL &
PETROLEUM, INC. [ TRADERS CORPORATION SUPPLY, INC.
ITEM QUANTITY DESCRIPTION OF GOODS OR SERVICES UNIT | EXTENDED | UNIT [ EXTENDED | UNIT | EXTENDED
PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1 | 250,000 GALLONS UNLEADED FUEL $2.15181  $537,950.00)  $2.2080] $552,000.00f $2.067¢] $516.750.00
2 | 100,000 GaLLONS DIESEL ULTRA LOW SULFUR CLEAR $2.2176] $221,760.00f  $2.2176] $221,760.00]  $2.1080] $210.800.00
3} 270,000 GALLONS DIESEL ULTRA LOW SULFUR DYED $2.0331] $548,037.00]  S2.1576f $582,552.000  $19120] $516.240.00
4 50 DRUMS HYDRAULIC FLUID 55 GALLON DRUMS NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID|  $31975] $15,987.50
5 50 DRUMS 15-W 40 MOTOR OIL IN 55 GALLON DRUMS NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID]  $376.75] $18.83750
6 4 DRUMS DELO 400 15W-40 MOTOR OIL NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID|  $280.00f  $1,856.00
7 4000 GALLONS PREMIUM 40W MOTOR OIL NO BID NG BID NO BID NO BID $6.99)  $27,960.00
8 55 DRUMS SAE 30W NG BID NO BID NO BID NOBID| 5431750 $23.746.25
9 6 DRUMS SAE 50w NO BID NOBIDI  NOBID NOBID|  $489.001  $2,934.00
10 | 1,000 GALLONS DEXRON/MERCON-ATF (G) NO BID NOBID| NOBID NO BID $6.09]  $6,080.00
11 2 DRUMS 70-90W SYNTHETIC OIL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
12 | 14,000 GALLONS TRACTOR HYDRAULIC FLUID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $6.09]  $97,860.00
13 3 DRUMS ANTIFREEZE (50/50) NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID||  $160.90 $482.70
ANTIFREEZE (LONG LIFE PREMIUM WITH
14 3 DRUMS ADDITIVE TO PREVENT ELECTROLYSIS) NO BID NO BID NO BiD NOBID|  $209.20 $897.60
SUBTOTAL. . ... ...\ .....
NETTOTAL oo $1,308,647.00 $1,356,312.00 $1.440,541 55
TERMS. oo
DELIVERY .. oot

RECOMMENDATION: Award Bid fo Oil Patch Fuel & Supply, Inc. and Hollon Ol Company

Request Authorization to Re-Advertise [ ]
Reguest Authorization to Negotiate Bid/Contract{ ]

Depariment: Public Works / Streets
Budgeted Amount Available: Amount from several funds
Additional Funds Required:
Prepared By: Velma Gomez, Senior Secretary 1

None




