BID TABULATION SUMMARY

Tite:  CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS Page 1 of 2
BidNo..  2010-09
Date Opened: ©/28/2009
MARC FRONTERA INTERNATIONAL
LOPEZ MATERIALS, INC. MATERIALS LLC
TEM QUANTITY DESCRIPTION OF GOODS OR SERVICES UNIT | BXTENDED § - UNIT | EXTENDED | UNIT  § EXTENDED
PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1 6000 TONS TYPE "D" HOT MIX NO BID NO BID $43.67] $262.020.00]  NO BID NO BID
2 350 TONS COLD MiIX NO BID NO BID 580.00] $28.000.00  NOBID NO BID
3 5400 TONS CRUSHED CALICHE $3.750  $20.250.00 s200]  $15,660.00 $3.90]  $21,060.00
SUBTOTAL. . ...,
NETTOTAL ................. $20.250.00 $305.680.00 $21.060.00
TERMS. oo oo
DELIVERY . oo

RECOMMENDATION: Award Bid {o Frontera Materials, In¢ in the amount of $305,680.00

Request Authorization to Re-Advertise [ ]
Request Authorization to Negotiate Bid/Contract [ ]

Department: Public Works / Streets

Budgeted Amocunt Available: $780,000.00

Additionat Funds Required: None

Prepared By: Velima Gomez, Senicr Secretary 1




BID TABULATION SUMMARY

Tile:  CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS Page 2 of 2
Bid No.  2010-09
Date Opened:  9/28/2009
ROY'S HAULING VALLEY CALICHE
SERVIGES, INC. PRODUCTS, INC.
ITEM QUANTITY DESCRIPTION OF GOODS OR SERVIGES UNIT | EXTENDED UNIT — f EXTENDED - UNIT | EXTENDED
PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
r 6000 TONS TYPE "D HOT MIX NO BID NO BID $47.75] $286.500.00
2 350 TONS COLD MIX NO BID NOBID|  NO BID NO BID
3 5400 TONS CRUSHED CALICHE $325]  $17,550.00 s3.10]  $16.740.00
SUBTOTAL. .. .. .............
NETTOTAL . oo $17.550.00 $303.240.00
TERMS. oo
DELIVERY . oo,

RECOMMENDATION: Award Bid to Frontera Materials, Inc in the amount of $305,68C.00

Request Authorization to Re-Advertise [ ]
Request Authorization {¢ Negotiate Bid/Contract [ ]

Departmeni: Public Works / Streels

Budgeted Amount Available: $780,000.00

Additional Funds Reguired:  None

Prepared By: Veima Gomez, Senior Secretary 1




