Title:

BID TABULATION SUMMARY

Heliday Decorations

Bid No.:

2010-10

Date Opened: 9/28/2009

Page 1 of 2

DEKRA-LITE ARNETT NORTHERN LIGHTS
INDUSTRIES, INC. | MARKETING, LLC DISPLAY, LLC
ITEM| QUANTITY DESCRIPTION OF GOODS OR SERVICES UNIT [EXTENDED)  UNIT JEXTENDED) UNIT JEXTENDED
PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1 1 Sequoia Tres - 24 ft (24 x 12) wiLED C-7 Buibs (2,306 - 3,000} $12,998.00] $12,8%9.00 No Bid  #$11,925.00] $11925.00
2 20 Omament Clusters (Classic Sets) - 34" (Shiny-Red, Green & Gold) with mini lights $95.921 $1,918.40 No Bid No Bid
3 1 Tree Top Star - 40° (Patterned) $382.001  $382.00 No Bid $309.001  $309.00
4 3 Red Ribbon w/Silver Spheres (35"} x 197", 416 walts) $4,076.051 $12,22875 No Bid No Bid
5 1 Shipping & Handling (estimate} $1,800.00F $1,800.00 No Bid $1,145.000  $1,145.00
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SUBTOTAL. ...........co vt $29,328.15 $13,379.00
DISCOUNT...................
10/15/09 or 20 days 18 days affer order
DELIWERYDATE., ................. afier bid is awarded is placed
TOTAL ..o i e $29,328.15 No Bid $13,379.00
RECOMMENDATION: Award Bid to Dekra-Life Industries, Inc., in the amount of $29,328.15.
Award; Department: _Public Werks Administration

Request Authorization to Re-Advertise [ ]
Request Authorization to Negotiate Bid/Contract [ ]

Budgeted Amount Available:

$20.006.00

Additionat Funds Required: $9,328.15
Prepared By: Adelaida Cordero, Admn. Aide




BID TABULATION SUMMARY

Title: Holiday Decorations Page 2 of 2
Bid No.: 2010-10
Date Opened. 9/28/2009
WILBURN BLACHERE DISPLAY
MARKETING ILLUMINATION USA SALES
TEM{ QUANTITY DESCRIPTION OF GOODS OR SERVICES UNIT |EXTENDED)  UNIT |EXTENDED) UNIT [EXTENDED
PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1 1 Sequoia Tree - 24 ft (24 x 12} w/L.ED C-7 Bulbs (2,300 - 3,000) $11,970.00] $11,970.00 NoBid  ||$14,819.00] $14,818.00
2 20 Ornament Clusters (Classic Sets) - 34" (Shiny-Red, Green & Gold) with mini lights No Bid No Bid $16.95 $339.00
3 1 Tree Top Star - 40" [Patterned) No Bid §300.00 | $900.00 $0.00 $0.00
4 3 Red Ribbon wiSilver Spheres (3%5") x 197", 416 wails) $4,042.00 | $12,126.00 | $3,100.00 | $9,300.00 No Bid
5 1 Shipping & Handling (eslimate) $2,500.001 $2,500.00 || $500.00 $500.60 $687.00 $687.00
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SUBTOTAL. ..., $26,596.00 $10,700.00 $15,845.00
DISCOUNT. ......ciiiiea i
30 days from 30 days from 20 days from
DELIVERYDATE. ............. ..., receipt of order receipt of order receipt of order
TOTAL ..o $26,596.00 $10,700.00 $15,845.00
RECOMMENDATION: Award Bid to Dekra-Lite industries, Inc. in the amount of $29,328.15.
Award: Department: Public Works / Administration

Request Authorization to Re-Advertise [ ]
Reguest Authorization to Negotiate Bid/Contract [ ]

Budgeted Amouni Available: $20,008.00
Additional Funds Required: $9,328.15

Prepared By:

Adelaida Cordero, Adm. Aide




