BID TABULATION SUMMARY

Title; HAULING SERVICES Page 1 of 2

Bid No..  2010-12

Date Opened:  9/28/200%

LJC EQUIPMENT & INTERNATIONAL SUNBELT EXPHESS
SUPPLY, INC. WMATERIALS, LLC SERVICE, INC.
ITEM QUANTITY DESCRIPTION OF GOODS OR SERVICES UNIT EXTENDED UNIT - EXTENDED i  UNIT | EXTENDED
PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1 6000 TONS SERVICES TO HAUL HOT HIX FROM FRONTERA
MATERIALS INC. TO ANY LOCATION WITHIN GITY OF
EOINBURG CITY LIMITS
FROM: LAS VIBORAS PLANT WEST OF LA JOYA ON FM 2221 *86.83 $13,660.00 £9.50 $57,000.00 $6.25 $37.500.00
{JARA CHINAS ROAD) 5 MILES NORTH OF BUS. 83
AND/OR FROM: PROGRESO PLANT ON FM 1015 AND *$7.88 $15,760.00 $12.40 $74,400.00 $6.25 $37,500.00
MILITARY ROAD
ANDOR FROM:VALLEY CALICHE PRODUCTS, INC.-3 MILE *$6.56 $13,120.00 $8.501 $51,000.00 $6.25 $37,500.00
% GOODWIN ROAD
2 5400 TONS SERVICES TO HAUL CRUSHED CALICHE FRCM VALLEY *$5.25 $14,175.00 $7.50 $40,500.00 $3.42 $18,468.00

CALICHE PRODUCTS, ING. MANN PIT SAN MANUEL
AND/OR FROM: FRONTERA MATERIALS FM 490 PIT *$4.20 $11,340.00 $7.20 $38,880.00 $3.42 $18,468.00
SUBTOTAL. .................
NETTOTAL................. $68,055.00 $261,780.00 $149,436 00
TERMS. ... .,
DELIVERY . ..o o

* Does not meet specifications.
RECOMMENDATHON: Award Bid to Sunbelt Express Service, Inc. in the amount of $149.438.00

Request Authorization to Re-Advertise { ]
Reguest Authorization to Negotiate Bid/Contract [ ]

Department: Public Works / Streefs

Budgeted Amount Avaitable: $780,000.00

Additional Funds Required: None

Prepared By: Velma Gomez, Senior Secretary 1




Title: HAULING SERVICES

Bid No..  2010-12

Date Cpened:  8/28/2009

BID TABULATION SUMMARY

Page 2 of 2

ROY'S
HAULING

ITEM

QUANTITY

DESCRIPTION OF GOOQDS OR SERVICES

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED UNIT

EXTENDED UNIT
PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

6000 TONS

SERVICES TO HAUL BOT HIX FROM FRONTERA

MATERIALS INC. TO ANY LOCATION WITHIN CITY OF

EDINBURG CITY LIMITS

FROM: LAS VIBORAS PLANT WEST OF LA JOYA ON FM 2221

NO BID

NO BID

(JARA CHINAS ROAD) 3 MILES NORTH OF 8US. 83

AND/OR FROM: PROGRESO PLANT ON FM 1015 AND

NO BID

NO BID

IMILITARY ROAD

AND/OR FROM:VALLEY CALICHE PRODUCTS, INC.-3 MILE

NO BID

NO BID

& GOODWIN RCAD

5400 TONS

SERVICES TO HAUL CRUSHED CALICHE FROM VALLEY

$3.85

$21,330.00

CALICHE PRODUCTS, INC. MANN PIT SAN MANUEL

AND/OR FROM: FRONTERA MATERIALS FM 420 PIT

$3.95

$21,330.00

RECOMMENDATION: Award Bid to Sunbelt Express Service, Inc. in the amount of $149,436.00

Request Authorization to Re-Advertise [ ]
Reguest Authorization to Negotiate Bid/Contract [ ]

Department: Public Works / Sireets

Budgeted Amount Available: §780,000.00

Additional Funds Required; None

Prepared By Veima Gomez, Senior Secrefary 1




