Title:_Cold Water Meters (Compound)
Bid No.:_2010-16
Date Opened:_Ocleber 26, 2009 @ 3:00 p.m.

CITY OF EDINBURG, TEXAS
BID TABULATION SUMMARY
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* Did not meet specs, dual register, not single register

Award: Bid No. 2010-16 to Aguaworks Pipe & Supply, LLC, the lowest bidder
meeting specifications, in the amount of $27,446.68,

Request Authorization to Re-Advertise [ ]
Request Authorization to Negofiate Bid/Contract [

Department: Utility/Systems Division

Aguaworks Pipe & Supply, LLC HD Supply Waterworks Badger Meter, Inc
Brownsville, TX McAllen, TX Milwaukee, W
UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
ITEM | QUANTITY DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

1 10 2" Compound Meters w/strainers U.S. Gallons 51,150.00 $11,500.00 $797 50 $7.975.00 No Bid No Bid
{Single Register) Serial #2009310-2009319

2 4 3" Comaound Meters wistrainers U.S. Gallons $1,456.67 $5,826.68] $1,62250 $6,490.00 No Rid No Bid
{Single Register) Seriai #2000325-2009328

3 4 4" Compound Meters wistrainers U.S. Gations $2,530.00 $10,120.00]| $2,079.00 $8,318.00 No Bid No Bid
(Single Register) Serial #2000330-2009333
GROSSTOFTAL..........cu..n $27.446.68 * $22,781.00 No Bid
LESSDISCOUNT.............
NETTOTAL ................. $27 446,68 $22,781.00 No Bid
TERMS. ... ..l
DELIVERY ... ... iniaant, 5-10 Wrk Days 2-4 Wks
RECOMMENDATION:

Budgeted Amount Available:

$80,662 £Y 2009-10

Additional Funds Required: None

Prepared By: Patricia Sanchez, Adm. Asst. i




