BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Title: Commercial Metal Contalners

Bid No.: 2015-10
Date Opened. 10/6/2014
ROLL-OFFS USA Wastequip Mfg. Co. LLC || Otto Environmental System
rEM|  QUANTITY DESCRIPTION OF GOODS OR SERVICES UNIT | EXTENDED || - UNIT | EXTENDED j  UNIT | EXTENDED
PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1.2 10 1.5 yd Commercial Metal Side Load/3 piece metal $365.00 $444,42 No Bid g
and poly lid pius freight
1.2 10 2 yd Commercial Metal Side Load/3 piece metal $424.00 $478.98 No Bid
and poly lid plus freight ‘ _
1.8 10 3 yd Commersial Metal Side Load/3 plece metal $458.00 $572.06 No Bid
and poly lid plus freight ‘
1.4 10 4 yd Commerical Metal Side Load/3 piece metal $535.00 $640.55 No Bid
and poly lid plus freight _
1.5 10 1.6 yd Commercial Metal Side Load/3 piece metal $380.00 No.Bid No Bid
lid plus freight ‘
1.6 10 2 vd Commercial Metal Side Load/3 piece metal $439.00 No Bid No Bid
tlid plus freight
1.7 10 3 yd Commercial Metal Side Load/3 piece metal $473.00 No Bid No Bid
lid plus freight _ o
1.8 10 4 yd Comnerical Metal Side Load/3 piece metal $550.00 No Bid No Bid
lid plus freight :
2.1 10 2 yd Commercial Metal Front Load/3 piece metal and $403.00 $418.90 No Bid
poly plus freight
SUBTOTAL. vvvverercnnnnn..
NETTOTAL.....0ovvienansn ,
TERMS. .t cvvviviviniiinnees ' —_
DELIVERY .. oviitvininanenns
RECOMMENDATION: )
Award:  Bid 2015-10 to ROLL-OFFS USA the Lowest over all bidder meeting minimum

specifications and freight per load.

DISCLAIMER:

The above bid recommendation is made by Depariment Directors and the final award is subject to City Council approval.

Department: Solid Waste Management
Budgeted Amount Available: $167,500

Additional Funds Required: ‘
Prepared By: Dalinda L. Cardenas, Senior Secretary |l
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BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Title:  Commerclal Metal Containers
Bid No.:  2015-10
Date Opened: 10/6/2014
ROLL-CFFS USA Wastequip Mfg, Co. LLC || Otto Environrnental System
ITEM|  QUANTITY DESCRIPTION OF GOODS OR SERVICES UNIT | EXTENDED | UNIT | EXTENDED ) UNIT ~ § EXTENDED
PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
2.2 10 3 vd Commaercial Metal Front Load/3 plece metal $486.00 $513.33 : No Bid
and poly lid plus freight :
2.3 10 4 yd Commerical Métal Front Load/3 piece metal $539.00 $582,97 No Bid
and poly lid plus freight
2.4 10 2 yd Commerclal Metat Front Load/3 piece metal $423.00 No Bid No Bid
lid plus freight '
2.5 10 3 yd Commetrcial Metal Front Load/3 piece metal $506.00 No Bid No Bid]
lid pius freight
2.6 10 4 yd Commercial Metal Front Load/3 piece metal $559.00 No Bid No Bid
lid plus freight
3.1 10 8 yd Low Profile or Slanted Type Commerclal  $787.00 $1,044.88 No Bid
Metal Front Load/2 piece poly lid plus freight
4,1 10 8 vd Standard Type Commercial Metal Front Load $807.00 $959.56 Neo Bid
’ /2 piece poly lid plus freight _ _
5.1 .10 10 yd Commercial Metal Front Load/2 piece poly $989.00 $1,276.56 No Bid
lid plus frelght
6.9 10 20 Cublc Yard "T" Style or Tub Style Roll Off Container $3,362.00 $3,757.83 No Bid
plus freight
SUBTOTAL. ....viv i i
NETTOTAL ............c..se
TERMS. .. v i v r v v i iinnas
DELIVERY .....c.ccivivnnnn
RECOMMENDATION: )
Award:  “Bid 2015-10 1o ROLL-OFFS USA the Lowest over all bidder meeting minimum =

specifications and freight per load.

DISCLAIMER:
The above bid recommendation is made by Department Directors and the final award is subject to City Council approval.

Department: Solid Waste Management
Budgeted Amount Available: $167,500

Additional Funds Required:
Prepared By: Dalinda L, Cardenas, Senior Secretary il
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BID RECOMMENDATION EORM

Title: Commercial Matal Containers

specifications and frelght per load.

DISCLAIMER:

The above bid recommendation is made by Department Directors and the final award iIs subject to City Council approval

Department: Solid Waste Management
Budgeted Amount Avsilable: $167,500

Additional Funds Required:
Prepared By: Dalinda L. Cardenas, Senior Secretary {l

Bid No.: 2015-10
Date Opened: 10/6/2014
ROLL-OFFS USA Wastequip Mfg. Co. LLC || Otto Environmental System
TEM|  QUANTITY DESCRIPTION OF GOODS OR SERVICES UNIT | EXTENDED |  UNIT | EXTENDED |  UNIT | EXTENDED
PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
8.2 10 30 Cubic Yard "T" Style or Tub Style Roll Off $3,636.00 $4,100.83 No Bid
Container plus freight
6.3 10 40 Cubic Yard "T" Style or Tub Style Roll Off $4,673,00 $4,854.75 No Bid
Container plus freight
7.1 10 Replacement 2,3 & 4 yd Hinged Metal Lid - 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid
{ipiece Metal Lid - 1 complete set
7.2 10 [Replacement 2,3 & 4 yd Hinged Metal Lid piece No Bid No Bid No Bid
lof 2 3 plece lid '
7.3 10 Replacement 2,3 & 4 yd 2 single wall UHM No Bid *$128.30 No Bid
polyethylene lids of the 3 piece lid. (Set of 2) '
7.4 10 Replacement 2,3 & 4 yd 2 single wall UHM No Bid *$20.88 No Bid
polyethylene lids of the 2 ptece iid. (Set of 2 - Full '
ILength)
1L7.5 10 IRepfacement 8 & 10 yd 2 single wall UHM No Bld *$20.97 No Bid
’ polyethylene lids (set of 2)
* lINo freight chares apply IF shipped with containers
if shipped aloneg charges are based on weight
and will be added to extended price
SUBTOTAL. ... i vveenaans
" NETTOTAL ....ivvievcncnnn.
TERMS...... faraea Srrunes ‘e
DELIVERY v ovcvavnncinvnanns
RECOMMENDATION:
Award:  Bid 2015-10 to ROLL-OFFS USA the Lowest over ail bidder rheeting minimum

Page 430




Title:

BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Commercial Metal Containers

Bid No.:

Date Opened: 10/6/2014

2015-10

ROLL-OFFS USA Wastequip Mfg. Co. LLC j Otio Environmental System
EM|  QUANTITY DESCRIPTION OF GOODS OR SERVICES UNIT | EXTENDED | UNIT | EXTENDED | ~ UNIT = | EXTENDED
PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
8.1 10 1.5yd side load prefabricated 10ga primed bottom with $147.00} *$200.00 No Bid
6" lip, caster pad, and drain plug
" 8.2 10 2yd side load prefabricated 10ga primed bottormn with $157.00 *$200.00 No Bid
li6" lip, caster pad, and drain plug
8.3 10 3yd slde load prefabricated 10ga primed bottorm with $162.00] *$206.00 No Bid
6” lip, caster pad, and drain plug
8.4 10 4yd side load prefabricated 10ga primed bottor with $162.00 *§208.00 No Bid
6" lip, caster pad, and drain plug .
8.5 10 2yd front load prefabricated 10ga primed bottom with $167.00 *3$150.00 No Bid
- 6" lip, caster pad, and drain plug '
8,6 10 " Ji8yd front load prefabricated 10ga primed bottom with $171.00 *$172.00 No Bid
5" lip, caster pad, and drain plug '
8.7 10 4yd front load prefabricated 10ga primed bottom with $202.00
8" lip, caster pad, and drain plug *$201.00 No Bid
8.8 10 Byd low profile or slanted type commerical metal front $262.00
load prefabricated 10ga primed bottom with 6" lip, *$192.00 Ne Bid
caster pad, and drain plug '
NO freight chares apply IF shipped with containers
If shipped alone charges are based on weight
land will be added to extended price
SUBTOTAL......... P
NETTOTAL..........ocenne.
TERMS. .. ovirerinncnnanns.
DELIVERY . .vvvvivvrernnnns
RECOMMENDATION:
Award:

Bid 2015-10 to ROLL-OFFS USA the L.owest over all bidder meeting minimum

specifications and freight per load.

DISCLAIMER:
The above bid recommendation is made by Department Directors and the final award is subject to City Council approval,

Department.  Solid Waste Management
Budgsted Amount Available:
Additional Funds Required:

Prepared By: Dalinda L. Cardenas, Senior Secretary I

$167,500
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BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Title: Commercial Metal Containers

Bid No.:

2015410

Date Opened:  10/6/2014

ROLL-OFFS USA

Wastequip Mfg. Co. LLC

Otto Environmental System

ITEM

QUANTITY

DESCRIPTION OF GOODS OR SERVICES

UNIT EXTENDED
PRICE PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

8.9

10

8yd standard type commerical metal front load

$249.00

*$200.00

No Bid

llprefabricated 10ga primed bottomn with 6" Hip,

caster pad, and drain piug

8.10

10

10yd commercial metal front load prefabricated 10ga

$285.00

*$203.00

No Bid

primed bottom with 6" caster pad, and drain plug

8.11

10,

200y "T style or tub style roll off contalner prefabricated

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

10ga primed bottom with 6" lip, caster pad, and drain

lplug (5'8"x19'11%")

8,12

10

30y "T' style or tub style roll off contalner prefabricated

No Bid

No' Bid]

No Bid

10ga primed bottom with 6" lip, caster pad, and drain

plug (5'6"x18'1114")

B.13

10

20¢y "Rectangular style or tub style roll off contianer

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

prefabricated 10ga piimed bottom with 8" lip, caster

pad, and drain.plug (6112187 ")

8.14

10

30cy "Rectangular” style or tub style roll off contlaner

Na Bid

No Bid

No Bid

iorefabricated 10ga primed bottom with 8" lip, caster

pad, and drain plug (7'x21'8% ")

NQ frelght chares apply IF shipp;ed with containers

If shipped alone charges are based on weight

land will be added to extendad price °

RECOMMENDATION:
Bid 2015-10 to ROLL-OFFS USA the Lowest over all bidder meeting minimum
specifications and freight per load. :

Award:

SUBTOTAL. .... cresreaa NN

DELIVERY ............. N

DISCLAIMER:

The above bid recommendation is made by Department Directors and the final award is subject to City Council approval.

Department.  Solld Waste Management

Budgeted Amount Available: $167,500
Additional Funds Required; :
Prepared By: Dalinda L. Cardenas, Senior Secretary [l

Page 432




BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Title:  Purchase of Commercial Metal Containers
Bid No..  2015-10 '
Date Opened:  10/6/2014
ROLL-OFFS USA Wastequip Mfg. Co. LLC || Otto Environmental System
ITEM | © QUANTITY DESCRIPTION OF GOODS OR SERVICES UNIT | EXTENDED | UNIT | EXTENDED |  UNIT | EXTENDED
PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
8.15 10 20cy roll off container prefabricated 10ga primed No Bid No Bid No Bid}
bottom with 6"lip, caster pad, and drain plug )
{7'4"x19"11Y "
8.16 10 30cy roll off container prefabricated 10ga primed No Bid] No Bid No Bid
bottom with 6"lip, caster pad, and drain plug
(7'3¥ "%x20"
SUBTOTAL. ......coviviianas
NETTOTAL........cvvvevens
TERMS. ..o v v ieiicnnnnnas
DELIVERY o vvvv e i nns PN
RECOMMENDATION:
Award: Bid 2015-10 to ROLL-OFFS USA the Lowest over all bidder meeting minimum Department:  Solid Waste Management

specifications and freight per load,

DISCLAIMER:

Budgeted Amount Available: $187,500
Additional Funds Required:
Prepared By: Dalinda L. Cardenhas, Senior Secretary 1l

The above bld recommendation Is made by Department Directors and the final award Is sublect to City Council approval.
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