Title: New Tires, Retread, and Flat Repair Services

BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Bid No.: 2015-11
Date Opened: 10/6/2014
NEW TIRES GOODYEAR
ITEM|  QUANTITY DESCRIPTION OF GOODS OR SERVICES UNIT | EXTENDED | MOUNT& | BALANCE | MANF | WARRANTY
PRICE PRICE DISMOUNT | PRICE PRICE
STEER AXLE TIRES
10.1 12 10.00R20 NO BID NO BID NOBID] NOBID NO BID] GoodyearDuniop
10.2 62 11R22.5 $316.08 $19,596.96 $20.00 $19.50 Duniop| GoeodyearDunlop
10.3 44 12R22.5 $432.44 $19,027.36 $20.00 $19.50 Dunlop| GoodyearDunlop
10.4 78 315/80R22.5 $531.12 $41,427.36}) $22.00 $20.50 Dunlop{ Goodyear/Duniop|
10,5 8 385/65R22.5 $573.43 $4,587.44 $22.00 $20.50 Dunlop] GoodyearDuniop)
10.8 8 425/85R22.5 $641.12 $5,128.96 $22.00 $20.50 Dunlop| Goodyearbuntop}
10.7 2 445/65R22.5 $780,99 $1,561.98 $22.00 $20.50 Goodyear] Goodyear/Dunlop
SUBTOTAL. v vvvvnveverernenn -
NETTOTAL .evvivrvninenen.
TERMS. . teinininenennnnnns
DELIVERY . .vvvniivnenes e | ]
RECOMMENDATION: ) a
Award:  Bid 2015-11 New Tires based on lowest price per unit. Department: Solid Waste Management
Budgeted Amount Available:
Additional Funds Required:
Preparad By; Laura Olivarez, Adminsitrative Alde
DISCLAIMER:

The above bid recommendation is made by Department Directors and the final award is subject to City Council approval.
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Title: New Tires, Refread, and Flat Repair Services

BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Bid No.: 2015-11

Date Opened: 10/6/2014

NEW TIRES SOUTHERN TIRE MART
mem|  QUANTITY DESCRIPTION OF GOODS OR SERVICES UNIT | EXTENDED | MOUNT& | BALANCE | MANF | WARRANTY
PRICE PRICE DISMOUNT | PRICE PRICE
_ STEER AXLE TIRES _
10.1 12 10.00R20 NOBID NOBID| NOBID] NOBID| NOBID NO BID
10.2 62 11R22.5 $468.00 $29,016.00| $20.00 $20,00|BRIDGESTONE
10.3 44 12R22.5 $577.00 $25,388.00) $20.00 $20,00[BRIDGESTONE
10.4 78 315/80R22.5 $572.00 $44,616.00] $20.00 $20.00|BRIDGESTONE
10.5 8 385/85R22.5 $581.00 $4,648.00 $20.00 $20.00|BRiDGESTONE
10.6 8 425/65R22.5 [ s$s67.00 $5,336.00 $20.00 $20.00|BRIDGESTONE
10.7 2 445/65R22.5 $738.00 $1,476.00 $20.00 $20.00|BRIDGESTONE
T SUBTOTAL........00000000ns L
NETTOTAL .. oveeeeeaennnn.
TERMS. . e o vvvnrenennrnnen.
DELIVERY . .vvvevevnvinnnens I
RECOMMENDATION: .
Award:  Bid 2015-11 New Tires based on lowest price per unit. Department: Solid Waste Management
Budgeted Amount Available:
Additional Funds Required: _
Prepared By, Laura Qlivarez, Adminsitrative Alde
DISCLAIMER:

The above bid recommaendation is made by Department Directors and the final award is subject to City Council approvail.
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BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Title: Mew Tires, Retread, and Flat Repair Services

Bid No.: 2015-11
Date Opened: 10/6/2014
NEW TIRES TIRE CENTERS LLC
TEM{  QUANTITY DESCRIPTION OF GOODS OR SERVICES UNIT | EXTENDED || MOUNT3 | BALANGE || MANF | WARRANTY
PRICE PRICE DISMOQUNT PRICE PRICE
STEER AXLE TIRES ,
10.1 12 10.00R20 $423.71 $5,084.52 $20.00 $30.00ff MICHELIN| MANUFACTURE
10.2 62 11R22.5 $551.62 $34,194.24 $20.00 $30.00 MICHELIN| manurACTURE]
10.3 44 12R22.5 3646.76 $28,457 .44 $20.00 $30.00f MICHELIN] MANUFACTURE
10.4 78 315/80R22.5 $720.68 $56,213.04 $20.00 $30.00) MICHELIN] MANUFACTURE
10.5 8 385/65R22.5 $710.89 $5,687.12 $20.00 $30.00[f MICHELIN| MANUFACTURE
10.6 8 425/65R22.5 $819.44 $6,555.52 $20.00 $30.00) MICHELIN} MANUFACTURE
10.7 2 445/65R22.5 $876.94 $1,753.88 $20.00 $30.00l| MICHELIN} MANUFACTURE
SUBTOTAL. .evevvnrnvnnnnnns ]
NETTOTAL.....covvvvvnnnn,
TERMS, .. iienivinencininssnes
PELIVERY ....... hrresasasas
RECOMMENDATION:
Award:  Bid 2015-11 New Tires based on lowest price per unit. Department:  Solid Waste Management
Budgeted Amount Available;
Additional Funds Required:
Prepared By: Laura Olivarez, Adminsitrative Aide
DISCLAIMER:

The above bid recommendation is made by Department Directors and the final award is subject to City Councll approval.
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BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Title: New Tires, Retread, and Flat Repair Services

Bid No..  2015-11
Date Opened: 10/6/2014
NEW TIRES GOODYEAR
UNIT EXTENDED || MOUNT& | BALANCE MANF WARRANTY
UANT DESCRIPTION OF GOODS OR SERVICES
ITEM QUANTITY PRICE PRICE DISMOUNT PRICE PRICE
DRIVE AXLE TIRES _
11.14 94 11R22.5 $440.52 $41,408.80; $20.00 $19.50 Dunlop] Goodyear/Dunlop
o “SUBTOTAL............ s i
NETTOTAL.......covinnnnan
TERMS. ...ovviiricnninnnns
DELIVERY ......ccivvnnna.s.
RECOMMENDATION:
Award:  Bid 2015-11 New Tires based on lowest price per unit. Department: Solid Waste Management
Budgeted Amount Available:
Additional Funds Required:
Prepared By: Laura Olivarez, Adminsitrative Aide
DISCLAIMER:

The above bid recommendation is made by Department Directors and the final award is subject to City Council approval.
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BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Title: New Tires, Retread, and Fiat Rapair Services

Bid No.. 2015-11

Date Opened: 10/6/2014

i

NEW TIRES 281 TIRE SHOP
mem|  QuANTITY DESGRIPTION OF GOODS OR SERVICES UNIT | EXTENDED } MOUNT& | BALANGE | MANF | WARRANTY
PRICE PRICE DISMOUNT PRICE PRICE
DRIVE AXLE TIRES
11.1 94 11R22.5 $22.50
SUBTOTAL...... firrrtaranas
NETTOTAL ....... Cekenaeae
TERMS. . ..ivvvinansn seeeaes
DELIVERY .......ocviivanins
RECOMMENDATION:
Award:  Bid 2015-11 New Tires based on lowest price per unit. Department: Solid Waste Management
Budgeted Amount Available:
Additional Funds Required:
Prepared By: Laura Olivarez, Adminsitrative Aide
DISCLAIMER:

The above bid recommendation is made by Department Directors and the final award is subject to City Council approval,
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Title: New Tires, Retread, and Flat Repair Services

Bid No.. 2015-11

Date Opened: 10/6/2014

BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

NEW TIRES

DISCLAIMER:

The above bid recommendation Is made by Department Directors and the final award is subject to City Council approval.

SQUTHERN TIRE MART

mem|  QuanTITY DESCRIPTION OF GOODS OR SERVICES UNIT | EXTENDED | MOUNT& | BALANGE | MANF | WARRANTY

PRICE PRICE DISMOUNT PRICE PRICE
DRIVE AXLE TIRES
11.1 94 11R22.56 467 $43,898.00 $20.00 $20.00|RRIDGESTONE

SUBTOTAL....... vereae deran
NETTOTAL ......cvovncneeann
TERMS. .. it iivtanaranans
DELIVERY ......ciciivanuna

RECOMMENDATION:

Award:  Bid 2015-11 New Tires based on lowest price per unit.

Department. _Solid Waste Management

Budgeted Amount Available:

Additional Funds Required:

Prepared By: Laura Olivarez, Adminsitrative Alde
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BID RECOMMENDATION FORM
Title: New Tires, Retread, and Flat Rapair Services
Bid No.. 2015-11 _
Date Opened: 10/6/2014

NEW TIRES TIRE CENTERS LLC
ITEm|  QUANTITY DESCRIPTION OF GOODS OR SERVICES UNIT | EXTENDED | MOUNTS& | BALANCE | MANF | WARRANTY
PRICE PRICE | pismount | PRICE PRICE
DRIVE AXLE TIRES
11.14 94 11R22.5 $550.71 $51,766.,74 $20.00 $30.00] MICHELIN] MaNUFACTURE

RECOMMENDATION:
Award:  Bid 2015-11 New Tires based on lowest price per unit.

Department: Solid Waste Management

Budgeted Amount Available:

Additional Funds Required:

Prepared By, Laura Olivarez, Adminsitrative Aide

DISCLAIMER:
The above bid recommendation is made by Department Directors and the final award is subject to City Council approval.
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BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Title: New Tires, Refread, and Flat Repalr Services
Bid No.. 2015-11
Date Cpened: 10/6/2014
NEW TIRES GOODYEAR
ITEM|  QUANTITY DESCRIPTION OF GOODS OR SERVICES UNIT | EXTENDED j| MOUNT& | BALANCE) MANF | WARRANTY
PRICE PRICE DISMOUNT PRICE PRICE
CONSTRUCTION/AGRICULTURE EQUIPMENT _
13.1 6 B8X9 $172.51 $1,035.06 $45.00 N/Al SOLIDEAL] SOLIDDEAL
13.2 2 6.00-9 $90.49 $180.98 $10.00 N/A TITAN GDYR FARM
13.3 2 7.00-12 3133.42 $266.84 $10.00 NIA TITAN GDYR FARM
13.4 8 8.25-20 NO BID NO BID|j NO BiD NO BID NO BID NO BID
13.5 2 9,5-16 $284.03 $568.08]| $12.00 N/A|l GoODYEAR GDYR FARM
13.6 2 11L-158L $174,03 $348.086 $12.00 N/A GDYR| GDYR FARM
13.7 4 11L-18 $167.09 $668.37 $12.00 N/A GDYR} GDYR FARM
13.8 4 12.5-80-18 $401.01 $1,604.04 $12.00 N/A GDYR] GDYR FARM |
13.9 2 13.8-28 $408.07 $812.14 $22.00 N/A GDYR] GDYR FARM
13.10 2 16.9-24 $596.31 $1,192,62 $25.00 N/A GDYRI GDYR FARM
13.11 2 16.9-28 $595.18 $1,190.36 $25.00 N/A GDYR] GDYR FARM
13.12 2 17.51.-24 $562.87 $1,125.74 $25.00 N/A GDYR] GDYR FARM
13,13 8 17.5R25 $1,247.23 $7,483.38 $30.00 N/A TITAN] GDYR FARM
13.14 4 19,5L-24 $889.16 $3,556.64 $30.00 N/A GDYR| GDYR FARM
13.15 20 23,6R25 $2,175.40]  $43,508.00 $50.00 N/A TITAN] GDYR FARM
13.16 2 34X9.25-16 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SUBTOTAL. ..vvvvrnnenennens
NETTOTAL . ................
TERMS. ...vieveivnnsnrnnss
DELIVERY .. vvivvv i ranunss
RECOMMENDATION:
Award:  Bid 2015-11 New Tires based on lowest price per unit. Department.  Solid Waste Management
Budgeted Amount Available;
Additional Funds Required:
Prepared By: Laura Olivarez, Adminsitrative Aide
DISCLAIMER:

The above bid recommendation is made by Department Directors and the final award is subject to City Council approval.
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BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Title: New Tires, Refread, and Flat Repair Services

Bid No.. 2015-11
Date Opened: 10/6/2014
NEW TIRES SOUTHERN TIRE MART
EM|  QUANTITY DESCRIPTION OF GOODS OR SERVICES UNIT | EXTENDED j| MOUNT& | BALANCE| MANF [ WARRANTY
PRICE PRICE pISMOUNT | PRICE PRICE
CONSTRUCTION/AGRICULTURE EQUIPMENT
13.1 5 6X9 NO BID NO BID NOBID] NOBIDj NOBID NO BID
13.2 2 6.00-9 NO BID NO BID NoBiD| NosiD| NOBID NO BID
13.3 2 7.00-12 $165.00 $310.00 $6.00 N/All DEESTONE
13.4 6 8.25:20 $191.00]  $1,146.00] $20.00 N/Al  SAMSON
135] 2 9.5-16 $372.00 $744.00j $20.00 N/AlIGOODYEAR
13.6 2 11L-158L $194.00 $388.00 $45.00 N/AIFIRESTONE
13.7 4 11116 $182.00 $728.00 $20.00 N/AlIFIRESTONE
13.8 4 12.5-80-18 $348.00]  $1,392.00 $6.00 N/AIFIRESTONE
13.9 2 13.6-28 $446.00 $892.00 $75.00 N/AFIRESTONE
13.10 2 16.9-24 $682.00]  $1,364.00 $75.00 N/A[FIRESTONE
13.11 2 16.9-28 $770.00]  $1,540.00] $75.00 N/AIFIRESTONE
13.12 2 17.5L-24 $663.00]  $1,326.00] $75.00 N/A|[FIRESTONE
13.13 2 17.5R25 $1,380.00]  $2,760.00} $45.00 N/AIBRIDGESTONE
13.14 4 19.51-24 $740.00]  $2,960.00 $55.00 N/AIFIRESTONE
13.15 20 23.5R256 $2,445.00 $48,800.00 $75.00 N/AIBRIDGESTONE
13.16 2 34X9,25-16 iNO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID|  NOBID NO BID
SUBTOTAL. +evveenrcrnennnns
NETTOTAL vvnvrnrnnrnnsens
TERMS. e v veernaenaenannn,
DELIVERY .o vvnvennnnsnn e
RECOMMENDATION:
Award:  Bid 2015-11 New Tires based on lowest price per unit. Department:  Solid Waste Management
Budgeted Amount Avaitable:
Additional Funds Required:
Prepared By: Laura Olivarez, Adminsitrative Aide
DISCLAIMER:

The above bid recommendation is made by Department Directors and the final award Is subject to City Council approval.
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BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Title: New Tires, Retread, and Flat Repair Services

Bid No.:  2015-11
Date Opened: 10/6/2014
NEW TIRES TIRE CENTERS LLC
ITEM|  QUANTITY DESCRIPTION OF GOODS OR SERVICES UNIT | EXTENDED || MOUNT& | BALANCE) MANF | WARRANTY
PRICE PRICE DISMOUNT PRICE PRICE
CONSTRUCTION/AGRICULTURE EQUIPMENT
13.1 6 6X9 NO BID NO BIDJ NO BID NO BID]| NO BID NO BID
13.2 2 6.00-9 $231.46 $462.92 $45.00 N/Al MICHELIN MANUF
13.3 2 7.00-12 $358.97 $717.94 $45.00 N/AfE MIGHELIN MANUF
13.4 5] 8.25-20 N/A
13.5 2 9,5-16 $207.06 $414.12 $35.00 NIAIl  CARLOSE MANLUIF
13.6 2 11L-158L $178.25 $356.50 $35.00 N/AIGOODYEAR MANUF
13.7 4 11L-16 $166.07 $664.28 $35.00 NIAIIGOODYEAR MANUF
13.8 4 12.5-80-18 $487.63 $1,950.72 $35.00 N/AlGOODYEAR MANUF
13.9 2 13,6-28 $1,267.50 $2,635.00( $45.00 N/AlL MICHELIN MANUF
13,10 2 16.9-24 $1,480.70]  $2,961.40 $45.00 N/AL MICHELIN MANUF
13.11 2 16.9-28 $1,377.36 $2,754.70 $45.00 N/A[ MICHELIN MANUF
13,12 2 17.61.-24 $550.46 $1,118.92 $45.00 NIA|| GOODYEAR MANUF
13.13 2 17.5R25 $1,498.00 $2,998.00 $65.00 N/Aj MICHELIN MANUF
13,14 4 19.5L-24 $1,060.80 $4,243.20 $65.00 N/All MICHELIN MANUF
13.158 20 23.5R25 $3,029.00]  $60,680.00] $65.00 NIA" MICHELIN MANUF
13.16 2 34X9.25-16 NO BID NO BID NOBID] NO BIDILNO BID NO BID
SUBTOTAL. . ..vvrvenrensnnns [ [ ]
NETTOTAL .....coivivninnns
TERMS. ....... ... .ot
DELIVERY . ..ooivennennnnn, [
RECOMMENDATION:
Award:  Bid 2015-11 New Tires based on lowest price per unit. Department. Solid Waste Management
Budgeted Amount Available:
Additional Funds Required:
Prepared By: Laura Olivarez, Adminsitrative Aide
DISCLAIMER:

The above bid recommendation is made by Department Directors and the final award is subject to City Council approval.
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BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Title: New Tires, Retread, and Flat Repair Services
Bid No.: 2015-11
Date Opened:  10/6/2014
T NEW TIRES GOODYEAR
TEM |  QUANTITY DESCRIPTION OF GOODS OR SERVICES UNIT | EXTENDED j MOUNT & | BALANCE || MANUF | WARRANTY
PRICE PRICE DISMOUNT
EMERGENCY SERVICE/LAW ENFORCEMENT
14.1 40 P225/60R16 EAGLE RSA 97V $93.98 $3,758.20 GDYR EAGLE] GDYR/DUNLOP
14.2 130 P235/556R17 EAGLE RSA 98W $112.27}  $14,595.10 GDYR EAGLE} GDYR/DUNLOP
14.3 8 GOODYEAR P235/50R18 EAGLE RSA $130.41 $1,043.28 GDYR EAGLE] GDYR/DUNLOP
14.4 75 P245/55/R18 EAGLE RSA $130.41 $9,780.75 GDYR EAGLE] GDYR/DUNLOP
14.5 16 GOODYEAR P265/60R17 EAGLE RSA $129.28 $2,068.48 GDYR EAGLE] GDYR/DUNLOP)
SUBTOTAL.......... Ceeveees
NETTOTAL........iovivunan
TERMS. ... ciiiiiinnenens
DELIVERY .. ivevininennnnns
RECOMMENDATION:
Award: Bid 2015-11 New Tires based on lowest price per unit. Department. Solid Waste Management
Budgeted Amount Available:
Additional Funds Required:
Prepared By: Laura Olivarez, Adminsitrative Aide
DISCLAIMER:

The above bid recommendation is made by Department Directors and the final award is subject to Clty Council approval.
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BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Title: New Tires, Retread, and Flat Repair Services
Bid No.: 2015-11
Date Opened:  10/6/2014

NEW TIRES SOUTHERN TIRE MART W
TEM |  QUANTITY DESCRIPTION OF GOODS OR SERVICES UNIT | EXTENDED II MOUNT & | BALANCE || MANUF { WARRANTY
_ PRICE PRICE DISMOUNT
EMERGENCY SERVICE/LAW ENFORCEMENT i
14.1 40 P225/60R16 EAGLE RSA 97V ~$90.00 $3,600.00 FIRESTONE
14.2 130 P235/55R17 EAGLE RSA 98W $103.00 $13,390.00 IFIRESTONE
14.3 8 GOODYEAR P235/50R18 EAGLE RSA $130.00 $1,040.00] FIRESTONE
14.4 75 P245/56/R 18 EAGLE RSA $121.00]  $9,075.00] FIRESTONE
14.5 16 GOODYEAR P265/60R17 EAGLE RSA $115.00 $1,840.00" HFIRESTONE
SUBTOTAL........oiivvensns
NET TOTAL...... e .
TERMS....... Seeavaansenaae
DELIVERY ...t vvvnnrtvnners
RECOMMENDATION:
Award: Bid 20156-11 New Tires based on lowest price per unit. Department: Solid Waste Management
Budgeted Amount Available:
Additional Funds Required:
Prepared By: Laura Olivarez, Adminsitrative Aide
DISCLAIMER:

The above bid recommendation is made by Department Directors and the final award is subject to City Council approvat,
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BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Title: New Tires, Retread, and Flat Repair Services
Bid No.: 2015-11
Date Opened:  10/6/2014
NEW TIRES TIRE CENTER LLG ||
mem | QuANTITY DESCRIPTION OF GOODS OR SERVICES UNIT | EXTENDED || MOUNT & | BALANCE | WANUF | WARRANTY
PRICE PRICE DISMOUNT -
EMERGENCY SERVICE/LAW ENFORCEMENT
14.1 40 P225/60R16 EAGLE RSA 97V NO BID NO BID NQ BID NO BiD NO BID NO BID}
14,2 130 P2356/55R17 EAGLE RSA 98W NO BID NO BIiD NQ BiD NO BID NO BID NO BID
14,3 8 GOODYEAR P235/50R18 EAGLE RSA NO BID NO BID NO BID NQ BID NO BID NO BID
14.4 75 P246/56/R18 EAGLE RSA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID|t NOQ BID NO BID
14.5 18 GOODYEAR P265/60R17 EAGLE RSA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID|| NO BID NO BID
SUBTOTAL.............. veus
NETTOTAL ..........c....s
TERMS. ... cv i it iiiaraas
DELIVERY ....ovvnvnen Cesnas
RECOMMENDATION;
Award: Bid 2015-11 New Tires based on lowest price per unit. Department: Solid Waste Management
Budgeted Amount Available:
Additional Funds Required:
Prepared By: Laura QOlivarez, Adminsitrative Aide
DISCLAIMER:

The ahove bid recommendation is made by Department Directors and the final award is subject to City Council approval,
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BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Title: New Tires, Retread, and Flat Repair Services
Bid No.: 2015-11
Date Opened: 10/6/2014
NEW TIRES GOODYEAR
mEm | QuANTITY DESCRIPTION OF GOODS OR SERVICES UNIT | EXTENDED j MOUNT& ] BALANCE j|  MANUF | WARRANTY
PRICE PRICE DISMOUNT
SPECIALTY TIRES "PICK UP TRUCKS"
15.1 4 7.00-15LT *DNMS
15,2 4 31X10.50R15 $136.63 $546.52 N/C $10.00iGDYR/DURATRAC] GDYR/DUNLOP
15.3 8 LT225/75R16 $145.08 $870.48 NIC $10.00||GDYR/DURATRAC]  GDYR/DUNLOP
15.4 34 LT235/85R16 $148.20 $5,038.80 N/C $10.00{GDYR/DURATRAC] GDYR/DUNLOP
15.5 16 LT245/70R17 $1568.93 $2,542.88 N/C $10,00| GDYRIDURATRAC] GDYR/IDUNLOP
15.6 10 LT245/75R17 $173,36 $1,733.60 N/C $10.001GDYR/DURATRACT  GDYR/DUNLOP
15.7 4 LT265/70R16 $135.19 $5640.76 N/IC $10.00/|GOYRAURATRAC]  GDYR/DUNLOP
15.8 4 LT265/70R17(MT) $192.24 $768.96] NIC $10.00/|GOYR/IDURATRAC]  GDYR/DUNLOP
15.9 4 LT275/66R18 $208.91 $835,64 N/C 310,00GDYR/DURATRAC]  GDYR/DUNLOP
15.10 4 P205/75R15 NO BID NO BID! NQ BID NO BID NO BID NQ BID
15,11 4 P225/70R15 NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
15,12 32 P236/70R16 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID|} NO BID NO BID
15.13 4 P235/70R17 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID} NO BID NO BID
15.14 4 P235/75R17 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID) NO BID NO BID
15.15 4 P265/70R16 NO BID NO BID NQ BID NQ BID NOQ BID NQ BID
15.16 2 ST205/76R14 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID - NO BID
SUBTOTAL. ..o veivnancnnsn . ]
NETTOTAL .......ccivnvennn
TERMS. ..o errivrnranrannns
DELIVERY ...conuvens Pananas
RECOMMENDATION: *Did Not Meet Specifications
Award: Bid 2015-11 New Tiras based on lowast price per unit. Department. _Solid Waste Management
Budgeted Amount Available;
Additional Funds Required:
Prepared By: Laura Olivarez, Adminsitrative Aide
DISCLAIMER:

The above bid recommendation s made by Department Directors and the final award is subject to City Council approval,
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BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

The above bid recommendation is made by Department Directors and the final award is subject to City Council approval.

Title: New Tires, Retread, and Fiat Repair Services
Bid No.: 2015-11
Date Opened:  10/6/2014
NEW TIRES SOUTHERN TIRE MART
ITEM |  QUANTITY DESCRIPTION OF GOODS OR SERVICES UNIT | EXTENDED §i MOUNT & { BALANGCE || MANUF | WARRANTY
PRICE PRICE || DISMOUNT
SPECIALTY TIRES "PICK UP TRUCKS" _
15.1 4 7.00-15LT $76.00 $304.00 $20.00 $20.00/ SUPERMAX
15.2 4 31X10.50R15 $125.00 $500.00] $6.00 $20.00|FIRESTONE
15.3 6 LT225/75R16 $112.00 $672.00 $6.00 $4.00/[FIRESTONE
15.4 34 LT235/85R16 $117.00]  $3,978.00] $6.00] $4.00|FIRESTONE
155 16 LT245/70R17 $119.00]  $1,904.00| $6.00| $4.00[FIRESTONE
15.6 10 LT245/75R17 $122.00]  $1.220.00] $6.00] $4.00JFIRESTONE
15.7 4 L.T265/70R16 $135,00 $540.00] $6.00 $4.00|FIRESTONE
15.8 4 LT265/70R17(MT) $151.00 $604.00 $6.00 $4.00|[FIRESTONE
| 15,9 4 LT275/65R18 $147.00 $588.00 $6.00 $4.00||[FIRESTONE
15.10 4 P205/75R15 $89.00 $356.00 $6.00 $4.00[FIRESTONE
15,11 4 P225/70R15 $86.00 $344.00 $6.00 $4.00|[FIRESTONE
15.12 32 P235/70R16 $112.00]  $3,584.00 $6.00 $4.00||FIRESTONE
15.13 4 P235/70R17 $102.00 $408.00| $6.00 $4.00||FIRESTONE
15.14 4 P235/75R17 $108.00 $432.00] $6.00} $4.00[FIRESTONE
15.15 4 P265/70R16 $122.00 $488.00}) $6.00] $4.00|FIRESTONE
15.18 2 ST205/75R14 $64.00 $128.00] $6.00 $4.00|| SUPERMAX
SUBTOTAL. ...\ eevinieennen
NETTOTAL .. neonennnannn
TERMS. ..o oeeereerennnn.
DELIVERY . . oo veeeeeennenn.
RECOMMENDATION:
Award: Bid 2015-11 New Tires based on lowest price per unit, Department. Solid Waste Management
Budgeted Arnount Available:
Additional Funds Required:
Prepared By: Laura Olivarez, Adminsitrative Aide
DISCLAIMER:
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BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Title: Mew Tires, Retread, and Flat Repalr Services

Bid No.  2015-11

Date Opened:  10/6/2014

NEW TIRES TIRE CENTER LLC
TIRE CENTER LLC
ITEM QUANTITY DESCRIPTION OF GOODS OR SERVICES UNIT | EXTENDED | MOUNT & | BALANCE || MANUF | WARRANTY
PRICE PRICE | DISMOUNT
SPECIALTY TIRES "PICK UP TRUCKS"

151 4 7.00-15LT NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID{ NOBID NO BID
15.2 4 31X10.50R15 $140.78 $563.12 $0.00 $15.00|[sF coopricH} MANUF
15.3 6 LT225/75R16 $147.44 $884.64 $0.00 $15.00[lBF GooDRICH MANUF
15.4 34 LT235/85R16 $146.24]  $4,972.16 $0.00 $15.00[|BF coODRICH MANUF
15.5 16 LT245/70R17 $183.29 $2,932 .64 $0.00 $15.00{leF coobricH MANUF
15.6 10 LT245/75R17 $150.22]  $1,5092.20 $0.00 $15.00|[5F GoODRICK MANUE
15.7 4 LT265/70R16 $213.28 $853,12 $0.00 $15.00{|BF GOODRICH MANUF
15.8 4 LT285/70R17(MT) $243.50 $974.00 $0.00 $15.00||er coopricH MANUF
15.9 4 LT275/65R18 $204.41 $817.64 $0.00 $15.00|leF coooricH] MANUF
15.10 4 P205/75R15 *DNMS |
15.11 4 P225/70R15 $107.84 $431.36 $0.00 $15.00{|8F coopricH| MANUE
15.12 32 P235/70R16 $114.81 $3,673.92 $0.00 $15.00[lzF coooricH] MANUF
15.13 4 P235/70R17 $138.51 $554.04 $0.00 $15.00||BF GOODRICH MANUF
15.14 4 P235/75R17 $139.16 $556.64 $0.00 $15.00|\BE GOODRICH MANUF
15.15 4 P265/70R16 $133.38 $633.52 $0.00 $15.00{|BF GOODRICH MANUF
15.16 2 ST206/75R14 *DNMS

SUBTOTAL. ... \nrvrnrnennrs
NETTOTAL «vivivinnnnnennnn
TERMS. «vvvvnenenennnenenen
DELIVERY + e v cvenennrnrnnes

RECOMMENDATION: * Did Not Meet Specifications

Award:

Bid 2016-11 New Tires based on lowest price per unit.

DISCLAIMER:

The above bid recommendation is made by Department Directors and the final award is subject to City Council approval.

Department: Solid Waste Management

Budgeted Amount Available:

Additlonal Funds Required:

Prepared By: Laura Olivarez, Adminsitrative Aide
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BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Title: NEW TIRES, RETREAD, AND FLAT REPAIR SERVICES
Bid No.:  2015-11
Date Opened: 10/6/2014
11R22.5 GOODYEAR
PRICE FOR TREAD LOAD CASING SECTION ||TURNAROUND] WARRANTY
ITEM MOLD TYPE
RETREAD DEPTH RANGE COST REPAIR TIME
12.1 $145.00 ~ PRECURE 32/32NDS G $80.00 $25.00 7 DAYS] GOODYEAR
SUBTOTAL. .. .cnrnvrrnnnran
NETTOTAL .......ccconuensn
TERMS..... feressrrraseanes
DELIVERY ......coiivnnennns
RECOMMENDATION:
Award: Bid 2015-11 Retreads to Goodyear based on lowest price per unit. Department:.  Solid Waste Management
Budgeted Amount Availabie:
Additional Funds Required:
Prepared By, Laura Qlivarez, Adminsitrative Alde
DISCLAIMER:

The above bid recommendation is made by Department Directors and the final award is subject to City Council approval.
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BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Title: NEW TIRES, RETREAD, AND FLAT REPAIR SERVICES

Bid No.. 2015-11

Date Opened: 10/6/2014
11R22.5 SOUTHERN TIRE MART
TEM PRICE FOR MOLD TYPE TREAD LOAD CASING SECTION | TURNAROUND| WARRANTY
RETREAD DEPTH RANGE COST REPAIR TIME
12.1 $185.00 BDM 26132 N/A $75.00 $14.50 7 DAYS| sEE ATTACHED

RECOMMENDATION:

Award: Bld 2015-11 Retreads to Goodyear based on lowest price per unit.

SUBTOTAL
NET TOTAL

------------------

-----------------

------------------

DISCLAIMER:

The above bid recommendation is made by Department Directors and the final award is subject to City Counci approval.

Department: Solid Waste Management

Budgeted Amount Available:

Additional Funds Required:

Prepared By: Laurg Olivarez, Adminsitrative Aide
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BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Title: NEW TIRES, RETREAD, AND FLAT REPAIR SERVICES
Bid No.:  2015-11
Date Opened. 10/6/2014
11R22.5 TIRE CENTER LLC
TEM PRICE FOR MOLD TYPE TREAD LOAD CASING SECTION TURNAROUND WARRANTY
RETREAD DEPTH RANGE COST REPAIR TIME
12.1 $184.42 XDY 26/32] DEPENDING $75.00 $35.00] ONE WEEK] MANUFACTURE]
SUBTOTAL. . v vviiinrrcnnvns
NETTOTAL......coovvvinnns
TERMS. ... v intsnatcaans
DELIVERY .vvnvnvevsnrviniss
RECOMMENDATION:

Award: Bid 2015-11 Retreads to Goodyear basad on lowest price per unit.

Departrment.  Solid Waste Management

Budgeted Amount Avallable:
Additional Funds Required:

Prepared By: Laura Olivarez, Adminsitrative Aide’

DISCLAIMER:
The above bid recommendation is made by Department Directors and the final award is subject to City Council approval.
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BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Title: NEW TIRES, RETREAD, AND FLAT REPAIR SERVICES
Bid No.: 2015-11
Date Opened: 10/6/2014

11R22.5 OYERVIDES
TIRE SERVICE
PRICE FOR TREAD LOAD CASING SECTION TURNAROUND ] WARRANTY
ITEN RETREAD WMOLD TYPE DEPTH RANGE COST REPAIR TIME
12.1 NO BID NO BID NO BiD NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NQ BID
SUBTOTAL. .o v s vrinannns
NETTOTAL ...cvvvivanencnen
TERMS. . ... . iiiiiiiivaan
DELIVERY ......iiviviiannns
RECOMMENDATION:
Award: Bid 2015-11 Flat Repairs to Goodyear based on lowest price per unit. Department: Solid Waste Management
Budgeted Amount Available:
Additional Funds Required:
Prepared By: Laura Olivarez, Adminsitrative Aide
DISCLAIMER:

The above bid recommendation is made by Department Directors and the final award is subject to City Council approval. Page 513




Title:
Bid No.:

BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

NEW TIRES, RETREAD, AND FLAT REPAIR SERVICES
2015-11 '

Date Opened: 10/6/2014

11R22.6 281 TIRE SHOP
ITEM PRICE FOR MOLD TYPE TREAD LOAD CASING SECTION | TURNAROUND| WARRANTY
RETREAD DEPTH RANGE COST REPAIR TIME
12.1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NQ BID, NO BID NO BID#
I
SUBTOTAL..........c.c.0vnn
NETTOTAL.................
DELIVERY .. ivvvvrninnnnanes
RECOMMENDATION:
Award: Bid 2015-11 Retreads to Goodyear based on lowest price per unit. Department: Solid Waste Management
Budgeted Amount Availabie:
Additional Funds Required:
Prepared By. Laura Olivarez, Adminsitrative Aide
DISCLAIMER:

The above bid recommendation is made by Department Directors and the final award is subject to City Council approval. Page 514




BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

The above bid recommendation is made by Department Directors and the final award is subject to City Council approval.

Title: New Tires, Relread, and Flat Repair Services
Bid No.: 2015-11
Date Opened: 10/6/2014
FLAT REPAIRS GOODYEAR
TEM DESCRIPTION OF GOODS OR SERVICES FLATREP | FLATREP || MOUNT& | SWITCH | ORING VALVE
| sami7eM | 7PmieAM || DISMOUNT ouT COST STEM
16.1 10.00R20 $20.00 $20.00 $20.00 $10.00 N/A $5.00
16.2 ~ 11R22.5 $20.00 $20.00 $20.00 $10.00] N/A $5.00
16.3 12R22.5 $20.00 $20,00} $20.00]  $10.00| N/A $5,00|
16.4 315/80R22.5 $22.00 $22.00| $22.00 $10.00] N/A $5.00[i
16,5 385/65R22.5 $22.00 $22.00}) $22.00 $10.00 N/A $5.00
16.6 425/65R22.5 $22.00 $22.00 $22.00 $10.00 N/A $5.00
16.7 445/65R22.5 $22.00 $22.00 $22.00 $10.00 N/A $5.00
16.8 6X9 N/A N/A $45.00 $10.00 N/A N/A
169 6.00-9 $15.00 $15.00 $10.00 $10.00 N/A NC
16.10 7.00-12 $15.00 $15.00j $10.00] $10.00]t N/A NC
16.11 8.26-20 $20.00 $20,00 $10.00 $10.00 N/A NC
16.12 9.5-16 $15.00 $15.00 $10.00 $10.00 N/A NC
16.13 14L-16SL $15.00 $15.00 $10.00 $10.00 N/A NC
16.14 11L-16 $15.00 $15.00 $10.00 $10.00 N/A NG
16.15 12.5-80-18 $15.00 $15.00§ $10.00 $10.00 N/A NC
16.16 13.6-28 $28.00 $28.00|| $28.00 $14.00 N/A $15.00
16.17 16.9-24 $30.00 $30.00] $30.00]  $15.00 N/A $10.00]!
116.18 16.9-28 $30.00 $30.00] $30.00] _ $15.00] N/A $10.00}
SUBTOTAL. .o vvvenrnnens eves
NETTOTAL .oovvrinininnnnn.
TERMS. .t ivrerienrenenannss
DELIVERY v vvvvvvrnnnnns e
RECOMMENDATION: _
Award:  Bid 2015-11 Flat Repairs to Goodyear based on lowest price per unit. Department:  Solid Waste Management
' Budgeted Amount Avallable;
Additional Funds Required:
Prepared By. Laura Qlivarez, Adminsitrative Aide
DISCLAIMER:
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BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Title:  New Tires, Refread, and Flat Repair Services
Bid No.. 2015-11
Date Opened: 10/6/2014

FLAT REPAIRS SOUTHERN TIRE MART
ITEM DESCRIPTION OF GOODS OR SERVICES FLATREP | FLATREP | MOUNT& | SWITCH | ORING VALVE
SAM/TPM | 7PM/GAM || DISMOUNT out COST STEM
16.1 10.00R20 NO BID NO BID| NosiD] wnNoBID|  NOBID NO BID
16.2 | 11R22.5 $25.00 $25.00 $20.00 $12.00 N/A $6.00
16.3 12R22.5 $25.00 $25.00 $20.00 $12.00 N/A $6.00
16.4 315/80R22.5 $25.00 $25.00 $20.00]  $12.00] N/A $6.00]|
16.5 386/65R22.5 $25.00 $25.00 $20.00 $12.00 N/A $6.00]|
16.6 425/65R22.5 $25.00 $25.00 $20.00 $12.00 N/A $6.00]|
16.7 445/65R22.5 $25.00 $25.00 $20.00 $12.00] N/A $6.00};
16.8 BX9 NO BID NO BID| NOBID] NOBID] NOBID NO BID
16.9 6.00-0 NOBID NOBID[ NOBIB] NOBIDf NOBID NO BID
16.10 7.00-12 $10.00 $10.00| $6.00]  $e.00f  NA N/A
16.11 8.25-20 $25.00 $25.00] $20.00 $6.00] N/A N/A
16.12]  9.5-16 $85.00 $85.00]] $75.00 $25.00 N/A $6.00
16.13 11L-15SL $25.00 $25.001 $45.00 $25.00 N/A $6.00
16.14 11L-16 $25.00 $25.00 $20.00 $6.00 N/A $6.00
16.15 12.5-80-18 $10.00 10,00 $6.00 $6.00[ - N/A $6.00
16.16 13.6-28 $85.00 $85.00 $75.00]  $25.00] N/A $6.00
16.17 16.9-24 $85.00 $85.00 $75.001 $25.00 N/A $6.00
16.18 16.9-28 $85.00 $85.00 $75.00 $25.00 N/A $6.00
SUBTOTAL. ... evvvrirennn. . ‘
NETTOTAL ..\vvvviveaennnn.
TERMS....... e
DELIVERY . ..vveieeennnnnn.
RECOMMENDATION:
Award: Bid 2015-11 Flat Repairs to Goodyear based on lowest price per unit. Department:  Solid Waste Management
Budgeted Amount Available:
Additional Funds Required:
Prepared By: Laura Olivarez, Adminsitrative Aide
DISCLAIMER:

The above bid recommendation is made by Department Directors and the final award is subject to City Council approval. Page 516




BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Title: New Tires, Retread, and Flat Repair Services
Bid No.:  2015-11
Date Opened: 10/6/2014

FLAT REPAIRS TIRE CENTERS LLC
FLATREP | FLAT REP MOUNT & SWITCH O RING VALVE
ITEM DESCRIPTION OF GOODS OR SERVICES GAMI7TPM | 7PM/GAM DISMOUNT OUT COST STEM
16.1 10.00R20 $65.00 $85.00 $10.00 $6.00
16.2 11R22.5 $65.00 $85.00 $10.00 $6.00|}
16.3 12R22.5 , i $65.00 $85.00 $10.00 $6.00
16.4 315/80R22.5 $65.00 $85.00 l $10.00 $6.00
16.5 385/65R22.5 $65.00 $85,00 $10.00 $6.00
16.6 425/65R22.5 $65.00 $856.00 $10.00 $6.00
16.7 445/65R22.5 _ $65.00 $85.00 $10.00 $6.00|t
16.8 6X9 $65.00 $85.00 $10.00 $6.00
16.9 _ 6.00-9 $65.00 - $85.00| $10.00 $6.00
16.10 L 7.00-12 $65.00 $85.00}} $10.00] $6.00
1841 8.25-20 $65.00 $85.00] $10.00 $6.00
16.12 -  9.5-18 $65.00 $85.00 $10.00} $8.00
16,13 11L-158L. $65.00 $86.00 $10.00 $6.00
16.14 11L-16 $65.00 $85.00] $10.00 $6.00||
16.15 12.5-80-18 || $s5.00 $85.00|| $10.00 $6.00]
16.16] 13.6-28 $65.00 $85.00 $10.00 $6.00
{16.17 16.9-24 $85.00 $85.00 $10.00 $16.00
116.18 16.9-28 $65.00 w$8{">.00 $10.00| $16.00
SUBTOTAL......oviviieranas
NETTOTAL .....cinivnnannnn
CTERMIS. et ivinerir e e
DELIVERY ...... trarerevave '
RECOMMENDATION:
Award:  Bid 2015-11 Flat Repairs to Goodysar based on lowest price per unit. Department: Solid Waste Management
Budgeted Amount Available;
Additional Funds Required:
Prepared By: Laura Olivarez, Adminsitrative Aide
DISCLAIMER:

The above bid recommendation is made by Department Directors and the final award is subject to City Council approval. Page 517




BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Title:  New Tires, Retread, and Flat Repair Services
Bid No.:  2015-11
Date Opened:  10/6/2014
FLAT REPAIRS OYERVIDES TIRE SERVICE
ITEM DESCRIPTION OF GOODS OR SERVICES FLATREP | FLATREP | mount& | switcH | ORING VALVE
saMi7PM | 7PmieaM | DISMOUNT ouT COST STEM
16.1 10.00R20 $10.00 $10.00 $10.00 $5.00 N/A N/A
16.2 11R22.5 $25.00 $25.00 $20.00 $10.00 N/A $2.00
16.3 12R22.5 $10.00 $10.00 $10.00 $10.00} N/A $2.00
18.4 315/80R22.5 $25.00 $25.00 $20.00 $10.00] N/A $2.00
16.5 385/65R22.5 $20.00 $20,00} $20.00 $10.00] N/A $2.00
16.6 425/65R22.5 $20.00 $20.00]  $20.00 $10.00]| N/A $2.00
16.7 445/65R22.5 $10.00 $10.00] $10.00 $10.00| N/A $2.00
16.8 X9 $5.00 $5.00] $5.00 $5.00|| N/A $0.50(
16.9 6.00-0 $10.00 $10.00] $10.00 $5.00| N/A $0.50]
16.10 7.00-12 $10.00 $10.00)| $10.00 $5.00f) N/A N/A|
16.11 8.25-20 $10.00 $10.00 $10.00 $5.00 N/A N/A|
16.12 9.5-16 $10.00 $10.00 $10.00 $5.00 N/A $0.50|
16.13 11L-15SL $15.00 $16.00 $15.00 $10.00 N/A $0.50]
16,14 11L-16 $15.00 $15.00 $15.00 $10.00 N/A $0.50]!
16.15 12.5-80-18 $15.00 $15.00 $15.00  $10.00| N/A $0.50]!
16.16 13.6-28 $30.00 $30.00 $30.00 $15.00i N/A - $2.00
16.17 16.9-24 - $25.00 $25.00] $20.00]  $20.00 N/A $2.00
16.18] 16.9-28 $30.00 $30.00]] $25.00 $20.00] N/A $2.00
N SUBTOTAL.....c0vuuss eeens '
NET TOTAL .o vvnvnninennnes
TERMS. « e vreneeenennannnns
DELIVERY « v ovvivernrnnens
RECOMMENDATION:
Award: Bid 2015-11 Flat Repalrs to Goodyear based on lowest price per unit. Department:  Solid Waste Management
Budgeted Amount Available;
Additional Funds Required:
Prepared By: Laura Qlivarez, Adminsitrative Aide
DISCLAIMER:

The above bid recommendation is made by Department Directors and the final award is subject to City Council approval.
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BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Title: New Tires, Retread, and Flat Repair Services
Bid No.: 2015-11
Date Opened: 10/6/2014

FLAT REPAIRS 281 TIRE SHOP
ITEM DESCRIPTION OF GOODS OR SERVICES FLATREP | FLAT REP MOUNT & SWITCH O RING VALVE
_ SAM/7TPM 7PM/GAM DISMOUNT QUT COST STEN
16.1 10.00R20 $45.00 $55.00
16,2 11R22.6 i $28.50 $30.00 $12.50
16.3 12R22.5 $30.00 $32.00 _ $12.50
16.4 315/80R22.5 $30.00 $32.,00 $12.50
16.5 385/65R22.5 $30.00 $32.00] $12.50
16.6  425M85R225 $30.00 $32.00! $12.50
16.7 445/65R22,5 $32.00 $35.00]} $12.50
16.8 6X9
16.9 6.00-9
16.10 7.00-12
16.11 8.25-20
16.12 9,5-16
16.13 _ 11L-15SL $22.00 $25.00 $8.00
16.14 11L-16 $22.00 $25.00] $8.00
16.15 12.56-80-18-
16.16 _ 13.8-28
16.17 16.9-24
16.18 16.9-28
SUBTOTAL........
NETTOTAL ....coovanuene .
TERMS. ..t ittt chani e i
DELIVERY ..o vvevvinvavanns
RECOMMENDATION:
Award: Bid 2015-11 Flat Repairs to Goodyear based on lowest price per unit. Department. Solid Waste Management
Budgeted Amount Available:
Additional Funds Required:
Prepared By: Laura Qlivarez, Adminsitrative Aide
DISCLAIMER:

The above bid recommendation is made by Department Directors and the final award Is subject to City Council approval. Page 519




BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Title: New Tires, Retread, and Flat Repair Services
Bid No..  2015-11
Date Opened:  10/6/2014
FLAT REPAIRS GOODYEAR
ITEM|  QUANTITY DESCRIPTION OF GOODS OR SERVICES || T -ATREP | FLATREP | MOUNT& | SWITCH § ORING | VALVE
GAM/7PM | 7PM/GAM || DISMOUNT ouT COST STEM
16.19 17.51-24 $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 $17.50 N/A $12.50
16.20 17.5R25 $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 $17.50 N/A $12,50
16.21 19.5L-24 $35.00 $35.00| $35.00f  $17.50] N/A $12.50)]
16.22 23.5R25. $45.00 $45.00] $45.00 $22.50] N/A $15.000
16.23 34X-0.25-16 $20.00 $20.00]] $20.00 $10.00 N/A $10.00
16.24 P225/60R16 $8.50 ~ $8.50 NC NC N/A NC
16.25 P235/55R17 $8.50 $8.50 NC NG N/A NG
16.26 P235/50R18 $8.50 $8.50 NC NC N/A NG
18.27 P245/55R18 $8.50 $8.50 NC NC N/A NG
16.28 P265/60R17 $8.50 $8.50 NG NG N/A NG
16.29 7.00-15LT $8.50 $8.50]! NG NC N/A NG
16,30 31X10.50R15 $8.50 $8.50/1 NG NC N/A NG
16.31 L T225/75R16 $8.50 $8.50} NC NG N/A NC
16.32 LT235/85R16 $8.50 $8.50 NC NG ‘N/A NG
16.33 LT245/70R17 $8.50 $8.50 NG NG N/A NC
16.34 LT245/75R17 $8.50 $8.50| NC NG N/A NC
16.35 LT265/70R16 $8.50 $8.50|| NC NG N/A NG
16.36 | LT265/70R17(MT) $8.50 $8.50| NC NC NIA NC
SUBTOTAL. ..vievnvrnrnns .
NETTOTAL ..evneisinnncnns
TERMS. . cevvreenenannnnnn
DELIVERY + e v vnvenennronsns i N
RECOMMENDATION: o
Award:  Bid 2015-11 Flat Repalrs to Goodyear based on lowest price per unit, Department: Solid Waste Management
Budgeted Amount Avatlable;
Additional Funds Required;
Prepared By: Laura Olivarez, Adminsitrative Aide
DISCLAIMER:

The above bid recommendation is made by Department Directors and the final award is subject to City Council approval.
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BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Title: New Tires, Retread, and Flat Repair Services
Bid No.:  2015-11
Date Opened: 10/6/2014
FLAT REPAIRS SOUTHERN TIRE MART
mem|  QUANTITY DESCRIPTION OF GOODS OR SERvicEs || FRATREP | FLATREP | MOUNT& | SWITCH || ORING | VALVE
6AMI7PM | 7PMIGAM | pismounT ouT COST STEM
16.19 17,5L-24 $85.00 $85.00 $75.00 $25.00(1 $12.00 $6.00
16.20 17.5R25 $45.00 $45.00 $45.00 $25.00 $14.00 $6.00
16.21 19.5L-24 $65.00 $65.00 $55.00]  $25.00]  $12.00 $6.00]]
16.22 23.5R25 $85.00 $85.00) $75.00 $25.00] $14.00 $6.00
16.23 34X-9.25-16 NO BID NO BID| NnoBibl  NoBID NO BID NO BID
16.24 P225/60R16 $40.00 $10.00] $6.00 $6.00 N/A $4.00
16.25 P235/55R17 $10.00 $10.00}; $6.00 $6.00 N/A $4.00
16.26 P235/50R18 $10.00 $10.00 $6.00 $6.00 N/A $4.00
16.27 P245/55R18 $10.00 $10.00 $6.00 $6.00 N/A $4.00
16.28 P265/60R17 $10.00 $10.00 $6,00 $6.00] N/A $4.00
16.29 7,00-15LT $10.00 $10.00 $20.00 $6.00}] N/A N/A
16.30 31X10.50R15 $10,00 $10.00} $6.00 $6.00 N/A $4,00
16.31 LT225/75R16 $10.00 $10.00| $6.00 $6.00 N/A $4.00
16.32 {T235/85R16 $10.00 $10,00 $6.00 $6.00 N/A $4.00
16.33 LT245/70R17 $10.00 $10.00 $6.00 $6.00 N/A $4.00
16.34 LT245/75R17 $10.00 $10.00 $6.00 $6.00} N/A $4.00
16.35 LT265/70R16 $10.00 $10.00 $6.00 $6.00]] N/A $4.00
16.36] N LT265/70R17(MT) [ $10.00 $10.00 $6.00]  seo00f  NA $4.00]l
T ~ SUBTOTAL....... evenaniens [ » T
NET TOTAL « v v vvinerananens
TERMS. ..... e eerereenas
DELIVERY ... ovivinnrarnnsn
RECOMMENDATION:
Award:  Bid 2015-11 Flat Repairs to Goodyear based an lowest price per unit. Department.  Solid Waste Management
Budgeted Amount Available:
Additional Funds Required:;
Prepared By: Laura Olivarez, Adminsitrative Aide
DISCLAIMER:

The above bid recommendation is made by Department Directors and the final award is subject to City Council approval.
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BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Title: New Tires, Retread, and Flat Repair Services

Bid No.: 2015-11

Date Opened: 10/6/2014

FLAT REPAIRS TIRE CENTER LLC
ITEM|  QUANTITY DESCRIPTION OF GOODS OR SERvices || F-ATREP | FLATREP § MOUNT& | SWITCH | ORING | VALVE
SAM/TPM 7PMI6AM DISMOUNT OouUT COST STEM
16.19 17.50-24 $65.00 $85.00 $10.00 $16.00
16.20 17.8R25 $65.00 $85.00 $10.00 $16.001
16.21 19,5L-24 $65.00 $85.00 $10.00 $16.00
16.22 23.6R25 $65.00 $85.00 $10.00 $16.00
16.23 34X-9.26-16 $65.00 $85.00 $10.00 $16.00
16.24 P225/60R16 $65.00 $85.00 $10.001 $4.00
16.25 P235/55R17 $65.00 $85.00 $10.00 34,00
16.26 P235/50R18 $65.00 $85.00 $10.00 $4.00
16.27 P245/55R18 $65.00 $85.00 $10.00 $4.00|
16.28 P265/60R17 ~ $65.00 $85.00 $10.00 $4.00]]
16.29 7.00-15LT $65.00 $86.00( $10.00 $4.00[
16.30 31X10.50R15 $65.00 $85.00 $10.00 $4.00
16.31 LT225/75R18 $65.00 $85.00 I $10.00 $4.00
16,32 1.T235/85R 16 $65.00 $85.00 $10.00 $4.00
16.33 LT245/70R17 $65.00 $85.00 $10.00 $4.00
16.34 L.T245/76R17 $65.00 $85.00 $10.00 $4.00}
16.35 LT265/70R16 $65.00 $86.00 $10.00 $4.00]
16.36 LT265/70R17(MT) $65.00 $85.00 $10.00 $4.00]|
SUBTOTAL. . ivivevvnanenens
NETTOTAL.........cccunn.
TERMS. . .vvverreninnnnns
DELIVERY..... Cevesuseraes ]
RECOMMENDATION: T
Award;  Bid 2015-11 Flat Repairs to Goodyear based on lowest price per unit. Department:  Solid Waste Management
Budgeted Amount Available:
Additional Funds Required:
Prepared By: Laura Olivarez, Adminsitrative Alde
DISCLAIMER:

The above bid recommendation is made by Department Directors and the final award is subject to City Council approval.
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BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Title: New Tires, Retread, and Flat Repair Services
Bid No.:  2015-11
Date Opened: 10/6/2014

FLAT REPAIRS OYERVIDES TIRE SERVICE
mem]  QuANTITY DESCRIPTION OF GOODS OR SERVICES FLATREP | FLATREP || MOUNT& | SWITCH ) ORING | VALVE
BAMITPM 7PM/6AM | DISMOUNT ouT COST STEM
16.19 17.51-24 $30.00 $30.00 $25.00 $20.00 $2.50 $2.00
16.20 17.6R25 $35.00 $35.00 $30.00 $25.00f  $2.50 $2.00]
16.21 19,5L-24 $35.00 $35.00 $30.00 $25.00 nal g2.000
16.22 _ 23.5R25 - $65.00 $65.00 $66.00 $50.00 $2.50 $2.00
16.23 34X-9.25-16 $10.00 $10.00|| $10.00 $5.00) N/A $0.50
16.24 P225/60R16 $5.00 $5.00] $5.00 $5.00 NIA $0.50
16.26 P235/55R17 $6.00 $5.00) $5.00 $5.00 N/A $0.50
16.26 P235/50R18 $10.00 $10.00] $10.00 $7.00 N/A $0.50
16.27 P245/55R18 $10.00 $10,00 $10.00 $7.00 N/A $0.50
16,28 P265/60R17 $10.00 $10.00 $10.00 $7.00 N/A $0.50||
16.29 7.00-15LT $10.00 $10.00 $10.00 $7.00 N/A $0.50]}
16.30 31X10.50R15 $10.00 $10.00 $10.00 $7.00] N/A $0.50
16.31 LT225/75R16 $10.00 $10.00] $10.00 $7.00}| N/A $0.50
16.32 LT235/85R16 , $10.00 $10.00( $10.00 $7.00|| N/A $0.50
16.33 LT245/70R17 $10.00 $10.00| $10.00 $7.00}] N/A $0.50
16.34 LT245/75R17 $10.00 $10.00] $10.00 $7.00}] Al $0.50
16.35 LT265/70R16 $10.00 $10.00] $10.00 $7.00 N/A $0.50
16.36 LT265/70R17(MT) $10.00 $10.00] $10.00 $7.00 N/A $0.50
SUBTOTAL. .o vrvrnneensnnes '
NETTOTAL .. cueeeeannnnn..
TERMS. .o eevaeeenrens e
DELIVERY « . vevneneennnns .
RECOMMENDATION:
Award:  Bid 2015-11 Flat Repairs to Goodyear based on lowest price per unit. Department:  Solid Waste Management
Budgeted Amount Available:
Additional Funds Required:
Prepared By: Laura Olivaraz, Adminslirative Alde
DISCLAIMER:

The above bid recommendation is made by Department Directors and the final award Is subject to City Council approval. Page 523




BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Title: New Tires, Retread, and Flat Repair Services
Bid No.:  2015-11
Date Opened:  10/6/2014

FLAT REPAIRS 281 TIRE SHOP
imEM|  QuanTITY DESCRIPTION OF GOODS OR SERVICES || FEATREP | FLATREP § MOUNT& | SWITCH ) ORING | VALVE
6ANITPM 7PNMIGAN DISMOUNT ouT COST STEM

16.19 17.5L-24
16.20 17.6R25
16.21 19.6L.-24
16.22 23.5R25
16.23 34X-9.25-16
16.24 . P225/60R16
16.25 P235/55R17
16.26 P235/50R18
16.27 P245/55R18
16.28 P265/60R17
16.29 7.00-15LTF
16.30 31X10.50R15
16.31'] - LT225/76R16
16.32 LT235/85R16
16.33 LT245/70R17
16.34] LT245/75R17
16.35 _ LT265/70R16
16.36 LT265/70R17(MT)

SUBTOTAL........cvnvvennn,

NETTOTAL.....0convnnanens

TERMS. .. .vvriiiiiineats

DELIVERY .oovvnininanavanns _
RECOMMENDATION: - |
Award:  Bid 2015-11 Flat Repairs to Goodyear based on lowest price per unit. Department: Solid Waste Management

Budgeted Amount Available:
Additional Funds Requlired:
Prepared By: Laura Olivarez, Adminsitrative Aide

DISCLAIMER:

The ahove bid recommendation is made by Department Directors and the final award is subject to City Council approval. Page 524




BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Title: New Tires, Retread, and Flat Repair Services
Bid No.: 2015-11
Date Opened: 10/6/2014

FLAT REPAIRS GOODYEAR
ITEM|  QUANTITY DESCRIPTION OF GOODS OR SERVICES || T -ATREP | FLATREP | MOUNT& | SWITCH j| ORING | VALVE
SAMITPM 7PMI/GAM DISMOUNT ouT COST STEM
16.37 LT275/65R18 $8.50 $8.60 NC NC N/A NC
16.38 o P205/75R15 $8.00 $8.50 NC NC NC NC
16.39 P225/70R15 $8.00 $8.50 NC NC NC NC
16.40 P235/70R16 $8.00 $8.50 NC NC NC NC
16.41 P235/70R17 $8.00 $8.50 NC NC NC NC
16.42 P235/75R17 $8.00 - $8.50 NG NC NC NC
16.43 P265/70R 16 $8.00 $8.50 NC NG NC NC
16.44 8T205/75R 14 $8.00 $8.50 NC NC NC NC
17 SUNDAY PRETRIP INSPECTION $45.00*
5AM PRETRIF INSPECITON $45.00*
REPAIR CALL 7 AM-7 PM $45.00*
REPAIR CALL 7 PM-7 AM $45.00*
*$10.00 FUEL SURCHARGE/2 HR MINIMUM
J‘ : F——— —f
SUBTOTAL.....vvvanss
NETTOTAL.........oivenen.
TERMS. ..o ieviicirronsans
DELIVERY ....ciivivivaravan
RECOMMENDATION:
Award:  Bid 2015-11 Flat Repairs to Goodyear based on lowest price per unit. Department. Solid Waste Management
Budgeted Amount Available:
Additional Funds Required:
Prepared By: Laura Olivarez, Adminsitrative Aide
DISCLAIMER:

The above bid recommendation is made by Department Directors and the final award s subject to City Councit approval. Page 525




Title:  New Tires, Retread, and Flat Repair Services

BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Bid No.:  2015-11
Date Opened:  10/6/2014
FLAT REPAIRS SOUTHERN TIRE MART
TEM|  QUANTITY DESCRIPTION OF GOODS OR SERVICES || FLATREP | FLATREP || MOUNT& | SWITCH || ORING |  VALVE
SAM7PM TPMISAM DISMOUNT ouT cosT STEM
16.37 LT275/656R18 $10.00 $10.00 $6.00 $6.00 N/A $4.00
16.38 P205/75R15 $10.00 $10.00 $6.00 $6.00 N/A $4.00
16.39 pP225/70R15 $10.00 $10.00 $6.00 $6.00 N/A $4.00
16.40 P235/70R16 $10.00 $10.00 $6.00 $6.00 N/A $4.00
16.41 P235/70R17 $10.00 $10.00 $6.00 $6.00 N/A $4.00
16.42 P235/78R17 $10.00 $10.00 $6.00 $6.00 N/A $4.00
16.43 P265/70R16 $10.00 $10.00 $6.00 $6.00 N/A $4.00
16.44 ST205/75R14 __$10.00 $10.00 $6.00 $6.00 NIA $4.00
17 SUNDAY PRETRIP INSPECTION $65.00
5AM PRETRIP INSPECITON $65.00
REPAIR CALL 7 AM-7 PM $65.00
REPAIR CALL 7 PM-7 AM $65.00
SUBTOTAL....iitsvncrsnrasn
NETTOTAL ....covivnnrnnans
TERMS, ......c.vun PN
DELIVERY ....ovvvvvnns .
RECOMMENDATION:
Award: Bid 2015-11 Flat Repairs to Goodyear based ot lowest price per unit. Department: Solid Waste Management
Budgeted Amount Avallable;
Additional Funds Required:
Prepared By: Laura Olivarez, Adminsitrative Aide
DISCLAIMER:

The above bid recommendation is made by Department Directors and the final award is subject to City Council approval.
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BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Title: New Tires, Retread, and Flat Repair Services
Bid No.:. 2015-11
Date Opened: 10/6/2014
FLAT REPAIRS TIRE CENTER LLC
ITEM|  QUANTITY DESCRIPTION OF GOODS OR SERvicES | FEATREP | FLATREP || MOUNT& | SWITCH || ORING |  VALVE
SANMI7PM TPNM/GAM DISMOUNT OuT f COST STEM
16.37 LT275/65R18 $65.00 $85.00 $10.00 $4.00
16.38 P205/75R15 $65.00 $85.00 $10.00 $4.00
16.39 P225/70R15 $65.00 $85.00 $10.00 $4.00
16.40 P235/70R16 $65.00 $85,00 $10.00 $4.00
16.41 P235/70R17 $65.00 $85,00 $10.00 $4.00
16.42 P235/75R17 $65.00 $85.00 $10.00 $4.00
16.43 P265/70R16 $65.00 $85.00 $10.00 $4.00
16.44 ST2056/75R14 $65.00 -$85.00 $10.00 $4.00
17 SUNDAY PRETRIP INSPECTION $85.00
5AM PRETRIP INSPECITON $85.00
REPAIR CALL 7 AM-7 PM $65.00
REPAIR CALL 7 PM-7 AM $85.00
IL
SUBTOTAL. ..........c0cvens
NETTOTAL ........oiiiinnns
TERMS..... drrestrirananans
DELIWVERY ....... Cerrararaea
RECOMMENDATION:
Award: Bid 2015-11 Flat Repairs to Goodyear based on lowast price per unit. Department.  Solld Waste Managament
Budgeted Amount Available;
Additional Funds Required:
Prepared By: Laura Olivarez, Adminsitrative Aide
DISCLAIMER:

The above bid recommendation is made by Department Directors and the final award is subject to Gity Council approval.
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BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Title: New Tires, Retread, and Flat Repair Services

Bid No.. 2015-11
Date Opened: 10/6/2014
FLAT REPAIRS OYERVIDES TIRE SERVICE
mEM|  QuANTITY DESCRIPTION OF GOODS OR SERVICES FLATREP | FLATREP j MOUNT& | SWITCH j ORING | VALVE
BANMI7PM 7PNIGAM DISMOUNT OUT COST STEM
16.37 LL.T275/65R18 $10.00 $10.00 $10.00 $7.00 N/A $0.50
16.38 P205/75R15 $10.00 $10.00 $10.00 $7.00 N/A $0.50
16.39 P225/T0R15 $10.00 $10.00 $10.00 $7.00 N/A $0.50
16.40 P235/70R16 $10.00 $10.00 - $10.00 $7.00 NIA $0.50
16.41 P235/70R17 $10.00 $10.00 $10.00 $7.00 N/A $0.50
16.42 P235/75R17 $10.00 $10.00 $10.00 $7.00 N/A $0.60
16.43 P285/70R16 $10.00 $10.00 $10.00 $7.00 N/A $0.50
16.44 5T205/756R14 $10.00 $10.00 $10.00 $7.00 NIA $0.50
17 SUNDAY PRETRIP INSPECTION $70.00
5AM PRETRIP INSPECITON $70.00
REPAIR CALL 7 AM-7 PM $50.00
REPAIR CALL 7 PM-7 AM $50.00
SUBTOTAL....... T 1
NETTOTAL .......cvivvinnen
TERMS. . cociiieirrrarananas
DELIVERY .........
RECOMMENDATION:
Award: Bid 2015-11 Fiat Repairs to Goodyear based on lowest price per unit. Department. Solid Waste Management
Budgeted Amount Avallable;
Additional Funds Required:
Prepared By Laura Olivarez, Adminsitrative Aide
DISCLAIMER:

The above bid recommendation is made by Department Directors and the final award is subject to City Council approval,
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BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

The above bid recommendation is made by Department Directors and the final award is subject to City Council approval.

Title:  New Tires, Retread, and Flat Repair Services
Bid No..  2015-11
Date Opened:  10/6/2014
FLAT REPAIRS 281 TIRE SHOP
ITEM |  QUANTITY DESCRIPTION OF GOODS OR SERVICES || F-ATREP | FLATREP | MOUNT& | SWITCH | ORING | VALVE
BAMI7TPM 7PMI6AM DISMOUNT OuUT COST STEM
16.37 LT275/65R18
16.38 P205/75R15
16.39 P225/70R15
16.40 P235/70R16
16.41 PR35/70R17
16,42 P235/76R17
16.43 P265/70R16
I 16.44 ST205/75R14
17 SUNDAY PRETRIP INSPECTION $45.00
5AM PRETRIP INSPECITON $40.00
REPAIR CALL 7 AM-7 PM
REPAIR CALL 7 PM-7 AM
SUBTOTAL........ouvuen S
NETTOTAL ....icviviusrvans
TERMS. oo v iveinsrnncannes
DELIVERY ....civivvnrannnns
RECOMMENDATION:
Award: Bid 2015-11 Flat Repairs to Goodyear based on lowest price per unit, Department.  Solid Waste Management
Budgeted Amount Available:
Additional Funds Required:
Prepared By: Laura Qlivarez, Adminsitrative Alde
DISCLAIMER:
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