BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Title: Waterworks Fittings and Materials
Bid No.: 2015-20

Date Opened: Qctober 20, 2014 @ 3:00 p.m.

ACT Pipe & Supply HD Supply Waterworks Ferguson Waterworks
Mission, TX McAllen, TX Mission, TX
UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
ITEM | Q1Y BESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
Group A: Brass Fitlings
1 100 i[1"x¥4Ford Angls Stop by Compression ({ BA43-242WNL or Equal) $ 3085} 8% 3.08500($ 3098]% 3,008.00 | % 3376 | $ 3,376.00
2 80 12" Mulli "y Service (Ford Y11-474NL or Equal) $ 52151 % 4,172.00{8 5240[% 4192.00{| 8 51745 4,139.20
3 §0 _|12" Ball Corp MIP X PJ (FB1100-7NL or Equal) $ 166911 % 83455045 167.701{% 8,385.00 || $ 16562 18 85,281.00
4 40 |H" Brass Service Service Plugs (Ford CSP-4-1 or Equal) $ 8151 % 326001 8 82018 328,004 % 81918 327.60
5 400 |4 Straight Meter Couplings (Ford C38-23-2-5 OR Equal) $ 689)8 2756.00[% 69315 2,772.00 | 8 68315 273200
8 30 12" Angle Stop x Compression (FV43-777W-NL or equal} $ 171361 & 51408015 1722018 5.166.001 8 167,201 8 5,016.00
7 10 [{13%" Angle Stop x Compression (FV43-66BW-NL or Equal) $ 133491 % 133400[% 1342018 1,342.00 || 5 130.24 15 1,302.40
8 100 il1" Slraight Meler Counling{C36-44-2.625 or Equal) $ 406218 1,06200(|s 10678 1,067.00 || & 105318 1.053.00
9 50 [{Expansion connaciions for 5/8 x 3/ meler (Ford EC-23 or Equal) 5 i4.18] § 709.00 || $ 14261 % 713,00 § 15771 % 788.50
10 10 H{1"% Bronze Meter Flange x FIP with accessories (Ford CF31-86 or Equal) [ 6650 ] % 665.00H % 30.831% 308301 % 30431% 304.30
11 30 }12" Bronze Meler Flange x FiP with accessorlas (Ford CF31-77 or Equaly $ 7280} % 21750048 40251% 12076018 39.741%  1,192.20
12 | 100 jp4" Angle Stop x Compressien (Ford KvV43-332W-N1. or Equal) $ 2816 % 2816.00|% 28301 % 2830001 § 27951% 2,795.00
Total Group A $ 32,587.20 $ 31,408.80 $ 31,307.20
Group B: Copper Fittings
1 10 [|12" X 1" Copper Reducer {For 2" Copper Tubing) for hard copper No Bid NoBidji$ 102818 102.80 018 117318 117.30
2 10 |2° Copper Couplings { For 2" Copper Tubing) for hard copper Mo Bid No Bid |i $ 6451 % 64.50 )| $ 73718 73.70
3 10 12" 45" Copper {For 2" Copper Tubing) for hard copper No Bid NoBid| & 119015 119.00 i 8 135855 13580
4 30 112" 90 (For 2' Copper Tubing) for hard copper No Bid NoBid|i § 1283 1% 384.90( & 14651 § 439,50
Total Group B No Bid $ 671,20, $  766.30
Group C: Barrel Couplings
1 20 {i4" 421 top boll coupling 0.D range 4.46-5.60 (Sralth Blair,Romac Macro, of approved equal) $ 82851 &% 16570018 130.25]% 2.605.00 1 $ 132,301 5 264600
2 2 14" 462 Quanium 12" long sleeve coupling ©.D 4,46-5.80 {Smith Blair,Ford barel, or approved equal) 5 1136218 227.244% 185001% 37000 [ 187.84 1% 37568
3 10  [lg" 421 lop bolt coupling ©.D range 6.58-7.60 (Smith Blair, Romac Macro or approved equal) $ M2411 8 11241013 172.051% 172050 § 17468 |3 1,746.80
4 2 [i" 462 Quarium 12" long sleeva coupling O.D 5.54-7.65 $ 140018 282,001 21550 $ 431.00 )1 $ 21886 | § 43772
& 8 |I8* 421 top bolt coupling 0.0 range 8.54-8.85 {Smith blair, Romac Macro or approved equal) $ 136.83] % 8209815 194851 % 1,169.10 1 $ 19784 18 1,187.04
Total Group € $ 111,52 $ 6,295.60 $ 6,293.24
Group D: Service Saddles )

1 16 4" x 2" Brass Service Saddle (Doublg Strap Ford Slyle 2028 or Egual) 0.0 Range 4,80-5.40 $ 8189] 8§ 81890 ({8 785018 785004 79.201% 792.00
2 10 |[6” x 2'Brass Service Saddle {Double Strap Ford Style 2028 or Equal) 0.D Range 6.90-7.50 $ 95461 % 95460 (1% 9155]% 915.50 || § 92.301% 923.00
3 6 |[a' X 1" Brass Service Saddle {Single sirap Ford style 1018 or approved EqualjO.[ Range 9.05-9,62 $ 94041 % 564,24 (8 52908 31740 $ 53.311% 319.86
4 26 [ x 2'Brass Service Saddle {Double Slrap Ford Style 2028 or Equal) 0.0 Range 9.05-9.62 $ 107781 5 269450[% 1033518 2,583.75] 8 104208 260500
5 10 {12° x 2Brass Service Saddle (Double Strap Ford Style 2028 or Equal)0.D Range 13.20-14.38 $ 15656 8 1,56560(|% 150.09]5 1,500.90( § 16140t 1.514.00
Total Group D) $  6,597.84 5 6,102.55 $ 6,453.86
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Title: Waterworks Fittinas and Materials
Bid No.: 2015-20

Date Opened: Qctober 20, 2014 @ 3:00 pn.

BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

ACT Pipe & Supply HD Supply Waterworks Ferguson Waterworks
Mission, TX Mcallen, TX Migsion, TX
LINIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
ITEM § QTY DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE FRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
Group E: Copper Tubing
1 1,500 " Soft Copper Typa "K"{ 100 Rolls} No Bld NoBld|| § 416| % 6,225.001 % 3651% 5,475.00
2 1,006 {11" Soft Capper Type "K' (100" Rolls) No Bld NoBid || & 5411% 541000 || & 476 | 4,760.00
3 500 {|2” Hard Copper Type "L" { 20' Joinls) No Bid NoBidi $ 8.801 % 4,900.00 ]| & 109418 5470.00
4 60 [1"% Hard Copper Typa "L" { 20° Joinis Mo Bid No Bid || $ 53318 3798011 % 71118 426,680
Total Group E No Bid $ 16,914.80 § 16,131.60
. Group F: Moter Boxes
1 25 115" x 26" Cast iron Rectangular Box wilh 2” Inlet and oullet opening and hasp No Bid NoBid || § 74381 % 1,859.650 || $ 94921 % 2,353.00
2 400 1|Plastic oval meler box wilh plastic meter fid No Bid NoBidii$  30.00{8% 12,060.00 } § 50.631 § 20,212.00
Total Group F No Bid $ 13,859.50 $ 22,565.00
Group G: Valve Boxes
1 50 liComplale vaive box $ 811118 4055508 211118 1,055.50 1| $ 79801 § 3,884.50
2 15 "Valve:Box Lid { Lid Only) 3 3056 | § 458,404 § 100018 150.00 || $ 20891 § 448.35
3 15 [Upper section of valve box $ 16500] % 24000 | 7221% 1083011 § 119613 179.40
Total Group § $  4,753.90 $ 1,313.80 $ 4,622.28
Imports
Group H: Tapping Gate Valves
1 6 [I2" Reshient Gale Valve Mueller A-2360 ar AFC2500 Serles {THD X THD} $ 21044 5 12626403 21093]% 1,.265.68 1 $ 191.02 1§  1,146.12
2 6 |12” Brass Gale Vaive (Hammond 1B-845 Or Equal Threaded on both ends) $ 9975 § 4987518 165401 % 827.00 || $ 162331 % 811.65
3 6 [|4' MJ X Flange Resiient Wedge Gate Valve {(Mueller A-2360 o AFC 2500 Serias) $ 32022) % 1,975.32(|% 353.371% 21202211 & 209011% 1.704.086
4 6 [l4' MJ X MJ Resilient Wedge Gate Valve (Mueller A-2360 or AFC 2500 Series) $§ 34484135 20690418 3425113 2,055.06 0 % 3129118 187748
5 4 1I6" MJ X M Resilienl Wedge Gale Valve (Musller A-2360 of AFC 2500 Series) $§ 4400418 17601618 4357048 1,742.80 || $ 399.51 1% 1,598.04
5 4 6" sy X Flange Resllient Wedge Gale Valve {Mueller A-2360 or AFC 2500 Serles) 3 44004| %5 17601615 443821% 177628 |3 38951 |8  1,598.04
7 2 |l8" M) X M) Resilient Wedge Gate Valve (Mueller A-2360 or AFC 2500 Series) $ 70088)1 8 1401768 6878013 1375601 % 635.791% 127158
a8 1 [l127 MJ X MJ Resilient Wedge Gale Valve (Mueller A-2360 or AFC 2500 Series) $ 1382911 % 13829018 1,3858013% 13858018  1,254121% 1254.12
g- 2 [l12" % 4 Tapping Sleeve { 0.0 13,13-13.80) Smith Blalr 622 or approved equal $ 344071 8 68814118 390921% 781.84 ] % 359751 % 719.80
Total Group H $ _ 12,798.88 $ 13,329.18 $ 12,070.57
Group It Fire Hydrant Repair Kils )
1 b5 [IMueller Safely Flange Repair Kit (1968-Presant) $ 126001 & 630.00[$ 263.80]3 1319560 | % 14550 % 727.50
Total Group | $ 630,00 $ 1,318.50 $  727.50
Group J: Fire Hydrant Extension Kit
1 2 [Mueller Super Genterion 250 Exlension .8 No Bid NoBid|I§ 40258185 805.16 | § 262941 5  505.88
2 2 [iMueller Super Centerion 250 Extension 1! No Bid { NoBid||$ 47369}% 947.38 1 § 204123 % 58824
Total Group Ji No Bid $ 1,752.54 $ 1,00412
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BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Title: Waterworks Fittings and Materials
Bid No.; 2015-20
Date Opened; October 20, 2014 @ 3:00 pm.

ACT Pipe & Supply HD Supply Waterworks Ferguson Waterworks
Mission, TX McAllen, TX Mission, TX
UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
ITEM | QTY DESCRIPTION PRICE PRIGE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
Group K: Flre Hydrants
1 3 [i¥ Fire Hydrant { Super Centerion 250 or approved equal) $ 1,60869] & 4826.07]% 1,487.36]5 4462.0818 1,383.001 & 4,149.00
2 3 |l4* Fire Hydrant { Super Centerion 250 of approved equal) $ 1687071 % 506121)% 16097218 4829.16 118  1,498.22| $ 4,494.66
3 3 |[5' Fire Hydrant { Super Centerion 250 or approved equal) $ 176545 5 52963518 1710581 8% 513174118 158515 § 4,765.45
' Total Group K| $§ 1518363 $ 14,422,98 $ 13,390.11
Group £: Sanitary Sewer Rings and Covers
1 10 H24"Manhole Ring and Covers {With City of Edinburg Logo) with bolls $305.20}$  3.052.00{ % 32851]% 3,285.10 11 § 30520 § 3.052.00
2 10 i[24*Manhole Ring and Covers (Wilh City of Edinburg Logo} $22076] % 2207605 23463]3 2346301 % 228761 § 220760
3 20 {i24" Plastic Adjusting Rings $26.50] $ 530008 25741% 514.80| 8 27101 §  542.00
4 10 {j30" Plastic Adjusting Rings $41.401 % 41400t 4358¢%5 435801 5 45801 % 45800
B 2 {130" Manhole Ring and Covers ( With Cily of Edinburg Logo) $332.18] § 66436} 3 357568 71512 | & 332191 % 664.38
Total Group 4 $  8,957.96 $ 7,287.12 $ 7.014.98
) Group M: Repair Clamps
1 & |4" Full circle repair clamp (0.0 Range 4.45-4.75, Widlh 15" Smlib Blair 226 or approved equal $ 62988 $ 3778818  B84.32]3 505.92 || § 88131 § 52878
2 5 [4" Full clice repair clamp (0.D Range 4.45-4,75 Width 7.5) Smith 8lair 226 or approved equal $ 36.161 § 2169018 428318 256.98 || 44761 F 26856
3 3 jl4" Ful circle repair clamp (0.0 Renge 4.95-5.36 Width 12,5} Smlih Blair 226 or approved equal $ 61.21] § 183638 764718 2294131 % 7990| 8 239.70
4 18 |i4" Full cirlce repair clamp (0.D Range 4.95-5,35 Widih 7.5) Smith Blair 226 or approved equal § 38251 8% 573.751 8  448015% 67200 & 468118 70215
5 6 {14 Full cirlce repair clamp (0.D Range 6.22-5.62 Widih 7.5} Smith Blair 226 ot approved equal §  3023]8 23538118 453815 2722818 47401 % 28440
& 6 {l8" Fuli circe repair clamp (0.D Range 6,84-7.24 Widih 7.5} Smith Blair 228 or approved equal § 43681 5 26208118 52.321% 313.92 (18 5466 | §  327.96
7 3 lls" Ful cirlee sepair clamp (0.D Range 6,84-7.24 Width 15" Smith Blalr 226 or approved equal $  T72415 231,721 97.261% 201.75 | 8 101601 §  304.80
8 10 "6’ Fuil cirele repalr clamp (C.D Range 7.05-7.45 Width 7.5) Smith Blair 226 or approved equat $ 44861 § 4486011 § 53111 % 531401 % 55491 & 554.90
8 6 |l5” Full clrele repalr clamp (0.0 Rangs 7.05-7.45 Widlh 12,5) Smith Blalr 228 or approved equal $ 698918 41934118 8506 1% 51036 1 § 88901 % 53340
10 3|l Full circle repalr clamp (0.D Range 7.26-7.56 Widlis 7.5) Smilh Blair 226 or approved equal $ 46041 3 1381218  54481% 163.44 |1 § 669118 170.73
11 4 |l8" Full clrcle repair clamp (0.D 9.27-9,67 Width 7.5) Smith Blair 226 or approved squal § 52401 % 209608 639818 25592 i $ 66.85) % 26740
12 2 |l8" Full clrele repair clamp (0.0 9,27-9.67 Width 12.5) Smith Blalr 226 or approved equal $ 8395913 167.98115 1024418 204.88 || 5 1070215 214.04
13 4 [is" Full circle repair calmp (O.D Range B.98-9.29 Width 7.5) Smith Blalr 226 or approved equal § 512318 2049218 626018 260401 8 65401 3  261.60
14 2 " Full clrcle rapale calmp (Q.D Range 8,99-9.39 Width 15") Smith Blalr 226 or approved equal $ 93838 1876643 1104318 238.861 % 124801 $ 24850
15 2 110" Full circle repair caimp (0.0 Range 10.75 PVC G900 Width 12,5} Smith Blair 226 or approved equal $ 10523} 8 21046{1%8 1183415 236.68 || 5 123851 % 247.30
18 2 {[#2" Eull circle repair calmp (0.0 Range 13.10-13.50 Widii 16") Smith Blakr 228 or approved gqual $ 137.78]1 & 2755618 1718518 3437011 § 179601 8§ 35920
17 2 ||#6* Fusl circle repair calmp {0.D Range 17.15-17.80 Widlh 15"} Smilh Blakr 226 or approved equal $ 2181421 § 43624 |3  356.74 1 % 7134815 372821 % 745.64
Total Group M § 477982 $ 5,991.08 $ 6,260.16
_ Group N: Sewer Francos

1 208" Pye X 4" Clay Ne Bid NoBid || $ 43318 86.601 $ 3821 % 76.40
. 20 [i6" x 8" Pvcx Clay Ne Bid No Bid || § 9.261§ 185.20 & 8151 8%  163.00
3 20 |i9" x 8" Pvc x Clay No Bid NoBidlls 142418 204.80 1 % 125518  251.00
Total Group N No Bid $ 556.60 $  490.40
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BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Title: Waterworks Fittinas and Materials
Bid No.; 2015-20
Date Openad: October 20, 2014 @ 3:00 p.m.

ACT Pipe & Supply HD Supply Waterworks Ferguson Waterworks
Mission, TX McAllen, TX Migsion, TX
UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
ITEM | OTY DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
Group O: PVC Restraints
1 20 |l4* Mega Lugs with accessories (Ebba Iron or equal) $§ 30031 % 60060 3 31201% 624001 % 31.231% 524,60
2 20 |8 Mega Lugs with accessories(Ebba lron or equal) $ 3766 % 7532011 % 383918 7878018 39431 % 788,60
3 12 |l8" Mega Lugs with accessorias (Ebba iron or equal) § 5098] % 611.76 )| § 53251 % 839.00 1l & 53301 % 639.60
4 12 |12 Mega Lugs with accesserles (Ebba Iron or equal) $ 9069 & 1,088.284 & 96.76 § & 1161124 & 96.86 1% 1,162.32
Total Group O: $ 3,053.34 $ 3,211.92 $ 3,21512
Group P: Meter Gaskels
1 1,000 ||[%=% Slright Meter coupling rubber gasket $ 0.08F % 800013 007 1% 7000 % 0071 % 70.00
1,000 ||%x% Strighl Mater coupling fiber plug 5 0.131 % 130.00 || $ 025]8% 250.00 1| $ 0.001% 90.00
“Total Group B $ 210.00 $ 320,00 % 160,00
TOTALAMOUNT. . ............
LESS DISCOUNT. ... ovvnurnnns
TOTALAMOUNT. ........cn v $91,664.39 $124,767 17 $132,371.41
TERMS........ faraabdrares
DELIVERY ....ovivirnnnnnnes
RECOMMENDATION:

Award: Bld No. 2015-20, Waterworks Fittings & Materlals to Ferguson Waterworks, HD Waterworks, ACT Pipe

& Suppy, and Aguaworks Pipe & Supply.

DISCLAIMER:

The above bid recommendation is made by Depariment Directors and the final award is subject to City Council approval.

Department Uthity/Systems
Budgeted Amount Available: $181,500.00
Additional Funds Required:

Prepared By Monica L. Perez, Admin. Asst, ||
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BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

“itle; Waterworks Fittings and Materials
Yid No.; 2016-20

Jate Opened: October 20, 2014 @ 3:00 nh.m.

Agua Works Pipe & Supply
Edinburg, TX
UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
ITEM | GQTY DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE FRICE PRICE
Group A: Brass Flitings
1 100 J11"x%Ford Angle Stop by Compression { BA43-242WNL or Equal) b 4864 | & 4,864.00
2 80 |l2" Multi"Y" Servige (Ford Y11-474NL or Equal) $ 60751 &  4.860.00
3 50 [[2" Ball Corp MIP X PJ (FB1100-7NL or Equal) $ 169131 % 8456.50
4 40 |H" Brass Service Service Plugs (Ford CSP-4-1 or Equal} 5 878} % 391.20
5 400 |4 Straight Meter Gouptings iFord ©38.23.2.5 OR Equal) g 8621 & 2,648.00
6 30 |l2" Angle Stop x Compression {(FV43-777W.NL or equal) $ 173541 % 5720620
7 10 J[1%" Angle Stop x Compression (FV43-668W-NL or Equal) $ 1365171 % 135170
3 100 1" Straight Meter Coupling(C38-44-2.825 or Equal) $  1049] %  1,019.00
9 50 [|Expansion connections for 5/8 x 3/4 meler {(Ford EC-23 or Equal) 3 12451 % §22.50
10 10 Ji1"% Bronze Meler Flange x FIP with accessories (Ford CF31-66 or Equal) 3 2671 & 326.70
11 30 |12 Bronze Meter Flange x FIP with accessories {Ford CF31-77 or Equal) $ 42841 % 1,279.20
12 100 |#4" Angle Stop x Compression {Ford KV43-332W-NL. or Equal) $§ 2833} % 2,833.00
Total Group A $ 33,858.00
Group B: Copper Fittings
1 10__||12* X 1* Copper Reducer {For 2" Copper Tubing} for hard copper No Bid No Bid
2 10 _||2" Coppsr Couplings { For 2' Copper Tublng) for hard copper Na Bid No Bid
3 16|12 45 Copper (For 2* Copper Tubing) for hard copper No Bid No Bid
4 30 |i2" 80 (For 2" Copper Tubing} fot hard copper No Bid No Bid
Total Group 8 No Bid
Group C: Batrel Couplings
1 20__|l4” 421 top bolt coupling O.D range 4.48-5.80 (Smilh Blair,Romag Macro, or approved equal) 3 160001 8§ 320180
2 2 |l4" 462 Quantum 2" long slseve coupling ©.D 4.46-5.60 (Smith Blair,Ford barrel, or approved equal) $ 14600] 8§ 292.18
3 10 118" 424 top bolt coupling O.D range 6.56-7.60 {Smilh Blair,Romac Macro of approved equal} $ 211071 % 211070
4 2 |l8* 462 Quantum 12" long sleeve coupling 0.D 6.54-7.66 § 187141 8% 374.28
5 8 [la* 421 lop bolt coupling 0.D range 8.54-9.85 (Smilh blair, Romac Macro or approved equal} $§ 230011 % 143408
Total Group $ 7.413.02
. Group D: Service Saddles
1 10 14" % 2* Brass Service Saddie {Double Strap Ford Style 2028 or Equal) 0.D Range 4.80-5.40 $ B0A45} S 804,50
2 50 18” x 2"Brass Service Saddle (Double Sirap Ford Siyle 2028 or Equal) 0.D Range 8.90-7.50 $ 9382} § 938.20
3 6 |l6'x 1" Brass Service Saddle (Single sirap Ford style 1018 ot approved Equal)0.D Renge 6.05:9,62 $ 924l $ 65446
4 25 |i8* x 2"Brass Service Saddle (Double Strap Ford Slyle 202B or Equal} 0.D Range 9.05.9.62 $ 10400 % 260225
5 10 112" x 2"Brass Service Saddie (Double Strap Ford Style 2028 or Equal)0.D Range 13.20-14.38 $ 151101 % 1,611.00
Total Group D] $ 6,410.41
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BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

itle: Waterworks Fittiﬁgs and Materials
iid No.: 2015-20
late Opened: October 20, 2014 @ 3.00p.m. ...

Agua Works Pipe & Supply
Edinburg, TX
UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
ITEM | QTY DESCRIPTION . PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
Group E: Copyer Tubing
1.} 1,500 {|%" Soft Copper Type "K" { 100° Rolis) $ 4201 $  6,300.00
2 1,000 [{1* Soft Copper Type "K” {100’ Rolls) 5 603 % 603000
3 500 }|2” Hard Copper Type “L" { 20" Joints) $ 18551 % 927500
4 60  |{1"% Hard Gopper Type "L” ( 20' Joints $ 12451 8 747.00
Total Group Ej $ 22,352.00
Group F: Meter Boxes
1 25 [i15" x 25" Cast fron Rectangular Box with 2" Inlet and outlet opening and hasp $ 872001 % 2180.00
2 400 j|Plaslic oval meter box with plastic meter lid $ 45981 % 1838200
Total Group F $ 20,572.00
Group G: Valve Boxes
1 50 JiComplete vatve box $§ 8395} % 4,197.50
2 16__|aive Box Lid ( Lid Only) $  31.05] % 48575
3 15  |Upper seciion of valve box § 126518 189.75
Tota} Group G $ 4,853.00
Group H: Tapping Gate Valves
1 6 2" ResHient Gale Valve Mueller A-2360 or AFC2500 Series {THD X THD) $ 227691 § 1,366.14
2 5 |12" Brase Gale Valve {Hammond 1B-645 Or Equal Threaded on both ends) $ 12241] % 812.05
3 6 |4t MJ X Flange Reslilent Wedge Gate Valve (Mueller A-2360 or AFC 2500 Series) $ 365881 % 213528
4 & 4 MJ X MJ Reshient Wedge Gate Valve {(Mueller A-2360 or AFC 2500 Series) $ 37289 § 223794
5 4 {8" MJ X MJ Resilient Wedge Gale Valve (Muglier A-2360 or AFC 2500 Series) $§ 475751 8  1,903.00
8 4 |ls" MJ X Flange Reslliant Wedge Gate Valve {Mueller A-2380 or AFC 2500 Series) § 475751 %  1.903.00
7 2 |la" M X MJ Resilient Wedge Gate Valve {Mueller A-2360 or AFC 2500 Series) $ 757721 % 1.515.44
] i |H2" MJ X M Resilient Wedge Gate Valve (Mueller A-2360 or AFC 2500 Series) § 149494§ 3 149494
9 2 |[2' x 4' Tapping Sleave { 0.D 13.13.13.60) Smith Blair 822 or approved egual $ 644401 5 1,088.80
Total Group H $ 14,256.59
Group I Fire Hydrant Repair Kits
1 5 |IMueller Safety Flange Repair Kit (1968-Present) $ 146221 3 731,10
Total Group | $ 731.10
Group J: Fire Hydrant Extension Kit
1 2 |Mueller Super Centerion 250 Extenslon 8" $ 375551 % 751.10
2 2 |IMuelier Super Centerion 250 Extension 1' $ 43848] & 876.96
Total Group J § 1,628.06
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BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Title; Waterworks Fittings and Materials
Bid No.: 2015-20
Date Opened: October 20, 2014 @ 3:00 p.m.

Agua Works Pipe & Supply
Edinburg, TX
UNIT EXTENDED LINIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
iTEM | QTY DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE * PRICE
Group K: Fire Hydrants
1 3 |13 Fire Hydrant { Super Centerlon 260 or approved egual) $ 1.704.2561 § 5.112.75
2 3 [l Fire Hydrant ( Super Centerion 250 or approved equal) § 1,787,381 &8 5362.14
3 3 |[5* Fire Hydrant { Super Centerion 260 or approved equal) $ 1870341 & 5611.02
Total Group K $ 16,0859
Group L Sanitary Sewer Rings and Covers
1 10 {le4a"Manhole Ring and Covers (With City of £dinburg Logo) with bolts $308.861 5 3.088.60
2 10 [l24"Manhale Ring and Covers (With City of Edinburg Logo) $232.52¢ 8 2,325.20
3 20 |24 Plastic Adjusting Rings $23.13] & 462.80
4 10 |30" Plastic Adjusting Rings $43.14] § 431.40
5 2 130" Manhole Ring and Covers { With Cily of Edinburg Logo) $336.17]1 8 672.34
Total Group L] $ 693014
) Group M: Repatr Clamps
1 6 |4 Full clrcle repalr clamp (O.D Ranga 4.45-4.75, Widih 15") Smith Blair 228 or approved squal $ 9448] 8 566.88
2 8 |l4* Fuil cirlee repair clamp {0.D Range 4.45.4.75 Width 7.5) Smith Blalr 226 or approved equat $ 47808 % 286.80
3 3 {l4" Full circle repair clamp (0.D Range 4.95-5.35 Width 12.5) Smith Blair 226 or approved squal $ 805918 241.77
4 15 H4" Full cirdce repair clamp (0.D Range 4.95-5.35 Width 7.5) Smith Blair 226 or approved equal $ 478018 717.00
5 6 |1 Full cidea repair clamp (O.D Range 5.22-5.62 Width 7,6) Siith Bfair 226 or approved equal $ 4780 % 286.80
6 6 (16" Full clrice repalr clamp (O.D Range 6.84-7,24 Width 7.5) Smith Blair 226 or approved equal § 6642] % 338.52
7 3 ||6" Full cirlce repair clamp (O.D Ranga 6.84-7.24 Width 16" Smith Blair 226 or approved equal § 1074418 32232
8 10 {l6" Full circle repalr clamp (0.0 Range 7.05-7.45 Width 7.5) Smith Blalr 226 or approved equal 5 66421 % 564.20
g 6  |l6" Full circle repalr clamp (0.0 Range 7,05-7.45 Width 12.5) Smith Blair 2265 or approved equal $ 902318 §41,38
10 3 |l6" Full circle repair clamp {O.D Range 7.26-7.56 Width 7.5) Smillh Blalr 226 or approved equal $ 5842183 169.26
11 4 |13 Full cirdle repait clamp {O.D 9.27-0.67 Widlh 7.5) Smitih Blair 226 or approved equal $ 662318  2m402
12 2 {I8" Fult circle repalr clamp {0.D 9.27-9.67 Width 12.6) Smith Blalr 226 or approved equal $ 108.068] % 21212
13 4 118" Full dircle repalr calmp {0.D Range 8,99-9.39 Widlh 7.5) Smith Bleir 226 or approved equal $ 6623183 264.92
14 2 fl&" Full circle repair calmp {0.D Range 8.99-8.39 Widlh 15"} Smith Blair 226 or approved equal § 12871 § 26742
15 2 |[10" Full circle repair calmp (0.0 Range 10.75 PVC €00 Width 12.5) Smith Blair 226 or approved equal $ 135261 % 270.50
16 2 {112 Full circls repair calmp (0.D Range 13,10-13.50 Width 15%) Smith Blair 226 or approved equal $§ 170431 3 340.86
17 2 16" Full circle repair calmy (0.0 Rangs 17.15-17,90 Width 15%) Smilh Blair 226 or approved equal $ 375101 & 750,20
Total Group M $ 639587
Group N: Sewer Francos

1 20 i Pvc X 4" Clay $ 33619% 67.20
2 20 JB"x 8" Pvex Clay 3 71918 143.80
3 20 [la*x 8 Pvex Clay $  11.06]8% 221.20

Totat Group N $ 432.20]
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BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Title: Waterworks Fittings and Materials
Bid No.: 2015-20
Date Opened: October 20, 2014 @ 3:00 p.m.

Agua Works Pipe & Supply
Edinburg, TX
LNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
ITEM § QTY DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
Group O: PVC Restraints
1 20 {l4" Mega Lugs with accessories (Ebba fron or equal) $ 3036] % 607.20
2 20 6" Mega Lugs with accessoriss{Ebba lron or equal) $ 38331 8% 766.60
3 12 {la~ Mega Lugs with accessories {Ebba Iron or equal) $ 51811 % 6§21.72
4 12 {12" Mega Lugs with accessories {Ebba iron of equal} $ 941415 1,12968
Total Group ¢ $ 312520
Groun P: Meter Gaskets
1 1,000 |[#%x3% Slaght Meter coupling mubber gasket $ 011] % 110,00
2 1,000 [[x% Stright Meter coupling fiber piug $ 036] % 360.00
Total Group B $ 470.00
TOTAL AMOUNT.......... fare
LESS DISCOUNT.....0ovvnenees
TOTALAMOUNT.............. $145,563.5
TERMS.....ovevenancrenn
DELWERY ....vviiiviinines

RECOMMENDATION:

Award: Bid No. 2015-20, Waterworks Fittings & Materials to Ferguson Waterworks, HD Waterworks, ACT Pipe

& Suppy, and Aguaworks Pipe & Supply.

DISCLAIMER:

The above bid recommendation Is made by Department Directors and the final award Is subject to City Council approval,

Department Utility/Systems

Budgeted Amount Available $181,500.00

Additional Funds Required;

Prepared By Monica L, Perez, Admin, Asst. ||
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