BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Title:_Replacement of Belt Driven Pumps

Bid No.:_2015-36

Date Opened:_December 01, 2014 @ 3:00 p.m. Page 1 of 1
American Machine Wofford McAllen
Pump & Power Equipment, L1.C Shop & Pumps Armature Works, Inc,
McAllen, TX Edinburg, TX McAllen, TX
UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
ITEM | QUANTITY DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1 2 Lift Station #3 - 2115 W, Sprague 3 7,00000]% 14,000.00 No Bid No Bid
2 2 Lift Station #7 - 1124 Durmiendo Street $ 56000013 11,200.00 No Bid No Bid
3 2 Lift Station #16 - 1201 N. Doolittle 3 5600.00]3% 11,200.00 No Bid No Bid!
4 2 Lift Station #18 - 3100 S. Closner in front $ 7,700.00] % 15,400,00 No Bid No Bid
of County Jall
5 2 fiLift Station #21 - 2001 E. lowa Rd, Northeast || $ 6,450.00 | $ 12,800.00 No Bid No Bid
||Corner
6 2 |lLift Station #22 - 3201 South Sugar Rd & $ 7.000.00}$  14,000.00 No Bid No Bidll
||Gloria Drive |
7 2 [lLift Station #22 - 3201 South Sugar Rd & $ 665000f%  13,300.00 No Bid No Bidj|
IIGloria Drive
8 2 Lift Station #24 - 2180 N. Kenyon Rd $ 7,00000]8% 14,000.00 No Bid} No Bid
] 2 WWTP Basin Return Pumps Room #2 $ 7,00000}8 14,000.00 No Bid No Bid
10 2 WWTP Basin Return Pumps Room #3 $ 7,00000]18% 14,000.00 No Bid No Bid
11 2 WWTP Plant #4 Return Pumps $ 7.00000}8% 14,00000 e No Bid No Bid
TOTAL AMOUNT........ veenes T . ™
LESSDISCOUNT........00nuue
TOTAL AMOUNT. ............. $148,000.00(i $154,816.00 No Bid No Bidjj
TERMS. .......civiicreranes
DELIVERY ....coovviennnnnns L N
RECOMMENDATION:

Award: Bid No 2015-36 Belt Driven Pumps to Pump & Power Equipment, LLC, the
lowest bidder meeting specifications, in the amount of §148,000.

DISCLAIMER:

The above bid recommendation is made by Department Directors and the final award is subject to City Council approval.

Department: Utility/Wastewater Treatment Plant

Budgsted Amount Available:
Additional Funds Required:
Frepared By: Monica L. Perez, Admin. Asst. lI

$160,000.00
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