BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

g: Firefighting Equipment - Wearing Apparel

No.. 2015-43
le Opened: 22-Dec-14
Casco Industries, Inc.
M| QUANTITY DESCRIPTION OF GOODS OR SERVICES UNIT | EXTENDED j  UNIT | EXTENDED |  UNIT | EXTENDED
PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
| 40 |INex Gen Coveralls - Sizes: Small - 5XL No Bid No Bidjj
2 50 liGiobe Structural Boots - Regular and Wide Calf - $305.00]  $15,250.00
_ iMode! Shadow 14" 1301400
3 100 Firefighter Structural Hood Model PBI P84 Lifeliner $48.00 $4,900.00)
35TP723E5
4 20 Firefighter Helmet Bullard Model UST Traditional Blue No Bid No Bid
5 5 Firefighter Helmet Bullard Model UST Traditional White No Bid No Bid
B 24 Firafighter Gloves: Made! Shelby FDP 5228 Core $51.00 $1,224.00|
IRT7100 Glove Barrier Fabric - Size Small
7 48 [IFirefighter Gloves: Madel Shelby FDP 5228 Core $51,00]  $2,448.00
||RT7‘E 00 Glove Barrier Fabric - Size Medium
8 48 [Firefighter Gloves: Model Shelby FDP 5228 Core $51.000  $2,448.00]
[RT7100 Glove Barrier Fabric - Size Large
9 36 [Firefighter Gloves: Model Shelby FDP 5228 Core $51.00 $1,836.004
RT7100 Glove Barrier Fabric - Size Xiarge
10 24 Firefighter Gloves. Model Shelby FDP 5228 Core $52.00 $1,248.00
RT7100 Glove Barrier Fabric - Size Jumbo
i1 12 Ringers Extrication Gloves: Cuff Short 314-08 - Size Small_| $26.95 $323.40
SUBTOTAL. ..evevrvenrnennes ] $29,677.40
NETTOTAL .....cocivnnvnicnnn
TERWS....... Ceraavieananes
DELIVERY 1.evvvnvnniniennns -
ZCOMMENDATION: T
vard:  Bid No. 2015-43 Casco Industries, Inc., in the amount of $34,589.90, as the sole Department; Fire

ider meeting specifications.

ISCLAIMER:

Budgeted Amount Available: $34,589.90

Additional Funds Required:

Prepared By: Marl Tovar, Administrative Asst.

¢ above bid recommendation is made by Department Directors and the final award is subject to City Councll approval.
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BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Firefighting Equipment - Wearing Apparel

lo.. 201543

Opened: 22-Deg-14

Casco Industries, (nc.
1| QuaAnTITY DESCRIPTION OF GOODS OR SERVICES UNIT | EXTENDED ||  UNIT | EXTENDED ||  UNIT |EXTENDED)
PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
24 Ringers Extrication Gloves: Cuff Short 314-09 - Size Small $26.95 '$646.80
24 Ringers Extrication Gloves; Cuff Short 314-10 - Size Large $26.95 $646.80
24 Ringers Extrication Gloves: Cuff Short 314-11 - Size XLarge $26.95 $646.80]}
24 Ringers Extrication Glvoes: Cuff Short 314-12 - Size 2XL $26.95 $646.80
24 Ringers Extrication Gloves: Cuff Shofrt 314-13 - Size 3XL $26.95 $646.80
30 ESS Inner Zone 2 Structural Goggles $55.95 $1,678.50}
SUBTOTAL....... D $4,912.60
NETTOTAL.....covvvunnenns 1st page $29,677.40
TERMS, ....... Paeerarananen Total $34,589.80;
DELIVERY . ........oiciueian
OMMENDATION:

rd:  Bid No. 2015-43 Casco Industries, Inc., in the amount of $34,589.90, as the sole

ar meeting specifications.

CLAIMER:

Department: Fire

Budgsted Amount Available: $34,589.80
Additiona! Funds Required:
Prepared By: Mari Tovar, Administrative Asst.

above bid recommendation is made by Department Directors and the final award is subject to City Cotingil approval.
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