

BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Title: Uninterrupted Service Inspections of Water Storage Tanks

Bid No.: 2015-44

Date Opened: December 22, 2014 @3:00 p.m

			LiquiVision Technology Kalmath Falls, OR		U.S. Underwater Services Mansfield, TX		Pittsburg Tank & Tower Henderson, KY	
ITEM	QUANTITY	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
1	3 ea.	Initial Cleaning, Video, & Visual Inspections of Three (3) Underwater Clearwells	\$997.00	\$2,991.00	\$7,500.00	\$22,500.00	\$9,100.00	\$27,300.00
2	5 ea.	Initial Video & Visual Inspections of Five (5) Elevated Towers	\$1,212.00	\$6,060.00	\$800.00	\$4,000.00	\$450.00	\$2,250.00
3	4 ea.	Initial Video & Visual Inspections of Four (4) Ground Tanks	\$1,102.00	\$4,408.00	\$800.00	\$3,200.00	\$450.00	\$1,800.00
4	2 ea.	Initial Video & Visual Inspections of Two (2) Standpipe Tanks	\$897.00	\$1,794.00	\$800.00	\$1,600.00	\$450.00	\$900.00
		Grand Total		\$15,253.00		\$31,300.00		\$32,250.00
5	3 yrs.	Three year Contract for the Video & Visual Inspections of Three (3) Underwater Clearwells, Five (5) Elevated, Four (4) Ground, & Two (2) Standpipe Tanks	\$15,253.00	\$45,759.00	\$12,600.00	\$37,800.00	\$6,300.00	\$18,900.00
		TOTAL AMOUNT		\$61,012.00		\$69,100.00		\$51,150.00
		LESS DISCOUNT						
		TOTAL AMOUNT						
		TERMS						
		DELIVERY						

RECOMMENDATION:

Reject: Bid No. 2015-44, Uninterrupted Service Inspections of Water Storage Tanks.

Department: Utilities / Systems & Water Plant

Budgeted Amount Available : \$8,750.00

Additional Funds Required: _____

Prepared By: Antonio Leal, Water Plant Superintendent

DISCLAIMER:

The above bid recommendation is made by Department Directors and the final award is subject to City Council approval.

Title: Uninterrupted Service Inspections of Water Storage Tanks

Bid No.: 2015-44

Date Opened: December 22, 2014 @3:00 p.m

			Dunham Engineering Inc. College Station, TX					
ITEM	QUANTITY	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
1	3 ea.	Initial Cleaning, Video, & Visual Inspections of Three (3) Underwater Clearwells		NO BID				
2	5 ea.	Initial Video & Visual Inspections of Five (5) Elevated Towers		NO BID				
3	4 ea.	Initial Video & Visual Inspections of Four (4) Ground Tanks		NO BID				
4	2 ea.	Initial Video & Visual Inspections of Two (2) Standpipe Tanks		NO BID				
Grand Total				NO BID				
5	3 yrs.	Three year Contract for the Video & Visual Inspections of Three (3) Underwater Clearwells, Five (5) Elevated, Four (4) Ground, & Two (2) Standpipe Tanks	\$4,900.00	\$14,700.00				
TOTAL AMOUNT.....				\$14,700.00				
LESS DISCOUNT.....								
TOTAL AMOUNT.....								
TERMS.....								
DELIVERY.....								

RECOMMENDATION:

Reject: Bid No. 2015-44, Uninterrupted Service Inspections of Water Storage Tanks.

Department: Utilities / Systems & Water Plant

Budgeted Amount Available: \$8,750.00

Additional Funds Required: _____

Prepared By: Antonio Leal, Water Plant Superintendent

DISCLAIMER:

The above bid recommendation is made by Department Directors and the final award is subject to City Council approval.