BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Title: Transfer Pump-Valves & Fittings

Bid No.:_2015-74
Date Opened;_March 25, 2014 @3:00 p.m.

Aguaworks Pipe & Supply Ferguson Waterworks HD Supply Waterworks
Edinburg, TX Mission, TX McAllen, TX
UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
ITEM | QUANTITY DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1 1 ea. [114"x14"x14" Ductile Iron 1258 C110 Flange $4,423.47 $4,423.4711 $4,432.49 $4,432.49 $4,499.04 $4,499.04
Wye (Domestic)
2 1 ea. |l14" Flange RW DI OL Gate Valve {Domestic) $4,733,60 $4,733.60) $5,100.00 $5,100.00 $4,860.00 $4,860.00
3 1 oa. [114" Flange Lever & Welght Check Valve $5,339.30 $5,330.30] $5,475.00 $5,475.00 $7,637.85 $7,637.86
H{Domestic)
4 1 ea. |[14" Blank Flange (Domestic) $499.33 $4990.33 $490.62 $490.62 $498.76 $408.76
5 8 ea. ||14" Flange Kit $70.25 $562.00 $31.01 $248.08 $75.52 $604.16
6 3 ea. |12" Flange Kit $50.76 $152.28 $20.57 $61.71 $52.64 $157.92
TOTAL AMOUNT. .....cuiuuuns $15,709.98 $15,807.80 $18,257.74
LESS DISCOUNT..............
TOTALAMOUNT. .............
TERMS. .. it i i iiienene
DELIVERY .....cocoaivnvan, 2-8 Wks. ARO 2-6 Wks. ARC 2-6 Wks, ARO
RECOMMENDATION:
Recommendation: Recommend Aguaworks Pipe & Supply of Edinburg, Tx, for Department:  Utilities / Water Plant
a total amount of $15,708.98, due to lowest price and meeting specifications. Budgeted Amount Available: $111,140
Additional Funds Required: None

DISCLAMMER:
The above bid recommendation is made by Department Directors and the final award is subject to City Council approval.

Prepared By: Antonio Leal, Water Plant Superintendent
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BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Title: Transfer Pump-Valves & Fittings

Bid No.:_2015-74

Date Opened:_March 25, 2014 @3:00 p.m.

Balch Machine Shop
Brownsville, TX

UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
ITEM | QUANTITY DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1 1 ea. [[14"x14"x14" Dugctile Iron 125# C110 Flange NO BID
\Wye (Domestic)
2 1 ea, ||14" Flange RW DI OL Gale Valve (Domestic) NO BID
3 1 ea. 14" Flange Lever & Weight Check Valve NO BID
(Domestic)
4 1 ea. i{14" Blank Flange {(Domestic) NO BID
5 8 ea, |[14" Flange Kit NO BID
8 3 ea. {|12" Flange Kit NO BID
TOTAL AMOUNT.............. NO BID
LESSDISCOUNT..............
TOTAL AMOUNT. .............
TERMS. ... it i irnrinnans
DELIVERY . .................
RECOMMENDATION:
Recommendation: Recommend Aguaworks Plpe & Supply of Edinburg, Tx, for Department:  Utilities / Water Plant

a total amount of $15,709.98, due to lowest price and meeting specifications.

DISCLAIMER:
The above bid recommendation is made by Depariment Directors and the final award is subject to City Council approval.

Budgeted Amount Available:

Additional Funds Required:
Prepared By: Antonio Leal, Water Plant Superintendent
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$111,140

None




