BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Title: Fire Department Dniforms

Bid No.

» 2015-88

Date Opened: 22-Jun-15

T Galls, LLC 911 Rapid Response Casco industries, Inc.
ITEM|] QUANTITY DESCRIPTION OF GOODS OR SERVICES UNIT | EXTENDED) UNIT | EXTENDED | UNIT |EXTENDED
PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1 100 72366 - 5.11 Tactical Shirt, Long Sleeve, Class A - PDL) or approved equal $38.00 $3,800.00 $37.00 $3,700.00[f $36.96] $3,696.00
2 300 71167 - 5.11 Tactical Shirt, Short Steeve, Class - PDU or approved squal $38.00] $11,400.00]  $37.00] $11,100.00f  $40.32] $12,096.00
3 150 74003 - Rip Stop TDU Pants - Men or approved equal $36.00]  $5400.00] $3500f  $5250.00] $34.72] $5208.00
4 20 |ls4360 Rip stop TDU Pants - Women or approved equal $36.00 $720.00]  $37.00 $740.00f  $36.98]  $739.20
5 20 72365 - 5.11 Tactical Shirts, Long Sleeve - Class A - Long Taifs - PDU or approved equal $38.00 $760.00 $37.00 $740.00|| $36.96 $739.20
8 20 71167 - 5.11 Tactical Shirts, Short Sleeve - Class A - Long Talls - PDU or approved equal $38.00 $780.00 $37.00 $740.00|| $40.32 $806.40
7 150 74306 - 5,11 Company Pant - Men or approved equal $35.00]  $5250.00( $36.00] $5400.00f $35.841 $5376.00
8 20 74398 - 5,11 Company Pant - Women or approved equal $35.00 $700.00 $36.00 $720.00} $43.68 $873.60
9 1 [leaveling for Sizing of Firefighters $1,260.00 $1,250.00
SUBTOTAL....... ferrrarrran T $28,790.00 $29,640.00 [ $29,534.40
NETTOTAL .................
TERMS. . .cvviv v v ivnevanes
DELIVERY ... v cvvinuns frsaas
RECOMMENDATION:
Award:  Bid No. 2015-88 to Galls, LL.C in the amount of $28,7080 as the lowest bidder meeting Department Fire
specifications. Budgeted Amount Available $30,000
Additional Funds Required:
Prepared B' Mari Tovar, Administrative Asst.
DISCLAIMER:

The above bid recommendation is made by Department Directors and the final award is subject to City Council approval.
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Title: Fire Depariment Uniforms

BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

Bid No.: 2015-88
Date Opened: 22-Jun-16
) NAFECO Radia Enterprises, Inc.
DBA Career Uniforms
ITEM| QUANTITY DESGRIPTION OF GOODS OR SERVICES UNIT | EXTENDED| UNIT ] EXTENDED jj UNIT }EXTENDED
PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1 100 72365 - 5,11 Tactical Shirl, Long Sleeve, Class A - PDU or approvad squal No Bid No Bid}t No Bid No Bid
2 300 71167 - 5,11 Tactica! Shirt, Short Sleave, Class - PDU or approved equal
3 150 74003 - Rip Step TDU Pants - Men or approved equal
4 20 1164360 Rip stop TDU Pants - Women or approved equal
5 20 72365 - 5.1% Taclical Shirts, Long Sleave - Class A - Long Tails - PDU or approved aqual
6 20 71167 - 5.11 Taclical Shirts, Short Sleeve - Class A - Long Talls - PDU or approved equal
7 150 74308 - §.11 Company Pani - Men or approved equial
8 20 74308 - 6,41 Company Pant - Women or approved squal
9 1 leavaling [or Sizing of Firefighters
SUBTOTAL. ........ ierrieaes No Bid No Bid
NET TOTAL.......... Cheeuas
TERMS. i ciiuvnnisranrnnaans .
DELIVERY ......... Seeneraas .
RECOMMENDATION: N
Award:  Bid No. 2015-88 to Galls, LLC in the amount of $28,790 as the lowest bidder meeting Departmeni Fire _
specifications. Budgeted Amount Available¢ $30,000
Additional Funds Required:
Prepared B: Mari Tovar, Administrative Asst.
DISCLAIMER:

The abave bid recommendation is made by Department Directors and the final award is subject to City Council approval,
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